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- - Coanuuitants
- . Pow 1t Company Baghtration Mo 19560718

SVUIREAYE 1 00225 PAY A LI ISNIUSTHREAL PARR, SINGAPCME 08938 TEL @ (068) 62303501 FAN 1 (005) 425640

Your ref: CMTD2001233/AGC
Our rel: CS/SMO20004352/Usf3 DATE: 24/3/2020
The Motor Claims Departmeni

M/s SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD

Dear SirfMadam
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SGS 9673K

We thank for your instruction on 23/3/2020

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

23372020 at the premises of M/s SIN YT SIN WORKSHOP
and have the following 1o report:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amount :S58,857.40
Revised Estimate Amount  :S56,048.40

"Check” Items Amount :S§
Market Value 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value :5%
Nen Value 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the nearside
front portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damaoges Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



.Veron Chen {LKKAuln!

From: Veron Chen (LEKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 March 2020 11:40 AM

To: 'Henry, Irene James'; SUR; 'Chan, Shu Hul Agnes'

Subject: RE: SOMPO REF: CMTD2001233/AGC/RE: Accident on 21/03/2020 involving
SGS9675K & YQ129C along blk 135 bedok north st 2 carpark

Attachments: SG5 9675K PREL!I ADVISED. pdf

Dear Agnes,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle 5G5 9675K
Date of survey; 23/3/2020
Number of days [estimated) : 4 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler ON BEHALF OF SHIRLEY

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | amall sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 March 2020 11:30 AM

To: 'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SOMPO REF: CMTD2001233/AGC/RE: Accident on 21/03/2020 involving SGS9675K & YQ129C along blk
135 bedok north st 2 carpark

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@ kkaoto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408017%)

From: Henry, Irene James <irene.hen S50MpPO.COM.SE>

Sent: Monday, 23 March 2020 11:14 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Ce: sur@lkkauto.com; Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.cam>




Subject: RE: SOMPO REF: CMTD2001233/AGC/RE: Accident on 21/03/2020 involving SG59675K & YQ129C along blk
135 bedok north st 2 carpark

Aside to LKK AUTO,
Kindly contact the undersigned for conduct of the motor survey.

Best Regards

Irene Henry

Claims Division

D.B8322 4618 | T. 6461 6555

@/ SOMPO A Century of Trust

INSURANCE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.,
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase® via Sompo 5G

[ 10 Om

P Google Play

o ﬁpp Stﬁre

Download now @ ar
‘For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | ? For Travel, Persanal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, s intended for the person(s] or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally prvileged information. Unauthonsed disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and Is prohibited
If you are not the intended recipient, please deleie this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Lid. may collect. use and disclose your parsonal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, cur third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Pelicy

From: sinyu sin <sinyusin@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 March, 2020 11:07 AM

To: Henry, irene James <irene.hen SOMpPoO.COM.Sg>

Cc: Chan, S5hu Hul Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SOMPO REF: CMTD2001233/AGC/RE: Accident on 21/03/2020 involving SG59675K & YQ129C along blk
135 bedok north st 2 carpark

Dear Irene Henry,

We would like to choose "LKK Auto Consultants / Marcus Chua (East area)" to be SIE.
Thank you

Regards

Welleang

Sin Yu Sin Workshop
1 Kakl Bukit Ave &
#01-52 (Autobay)
Singapore 417883

Tel; 91993103 Fax; 68163103



From: Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, March 23, 2020 10:18 AM

To: sinyu 5in <sinyusi mail.com>

Cc: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@®sompo.com.sg>

Subject: SOMPO REF: CMTD2001233/AGC/RE: Accident on 21/03/2020 involving SGS9675K & YQ129C along blk 135
bedok north st 2 carpark

Our Reference : CMTD2001233/AGC
Your Reference: 5G5S 9675K

Without Prejudice

Date: 23" March 2020 EMAIL ONLY

Attention:

M/S SIN YU SIN WORKSHOP

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YO 129C B SGS 9675K ON 21.03.2020

Dear 5ir/ Madam,
We refer to your notice of accident dated 20.03.2020 via email.

Please be informed that Agnes Chan is the handler of this case who can be contacted @ 6329 5327/
agnes.chan@som :

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey
Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 Raleigh Services Vincent Ng

Andrew Ow Yong

Kenneth Kong (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)

Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

Jeffray Ong




_Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Bes! Regards
Irene Henry
Claims Division

D: 6322 4618 | T: 6461 6555

e/ SOMPO ' A century of Trust

IHSLIFU‘LHCE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd,
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower. Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo com. sg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase® via Sompo 5G

® App Store

Download now @ or
*For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | * For Travel, Persanal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mall, Including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
andior legally privileged infarmation. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and s prohibited
Il you are not the intended reciplent, pleasa dalete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Lid. may collect. use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
staled in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associaled comparies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosura 1s permifted/required by laws. our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: sinyu sin <si hotmail.co

Sent: Saturday, 21 March, 2020 3:35 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <Motor5u Mmpo.com.sg>

Subject: Accident on 21/03/2020 involving 5GS9675K & YQ129C along blk 135 bedok north st 2 carpark

Dear Sirs,

We are Iinstructed to send you the attached Notice of Accident / to conduct pre-repair survey

Your insurer: YQ129C
Thank you

Regards

Weileang

Sin Yu Sin Warkshop
1 Kakl Bukit Ave 6
#01-52 (Autobay)



Singapore 417883

' Tel: 91993103 Fax: 68163103

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
A www.avg.com



‘Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Henry, Irene James <irene henry@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 23 March, 2020 11:14 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com; Nivitha (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: SOMPO REF: CMTD2001233/AGC/RE: Accident on 21/03/2020 involving
5G59675K & ¥YQ129C along blk 135 bedok north st 2 carpark

Attachments: SGS9675K PRS.pdf; SAS2767670.PDF

Aside to LKK AUTO,

Kindly contact the undersigned for conduct of the motor survey.

Best Regards

Irene Henry

Claims Division

D: 6322 4618 | T' 6461 6555

O SOMPO A Century of Trust

FHHL.IHAHFE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd,
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission’ & Product Purchase’ via Sompo SG

" hpp E'-_‘-ln“:'u

Download now @ or
For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Irsdrance | * For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motar Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, 1s intended for the personis) or company named and may contain canfidential
andlor legally privileged information. Unauthonsed disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and 1s prohibited
It you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Lid. may collecl, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure 1o holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
digclosure is permittedirequired by laws. our third party service providers and agents (acling on our behall), Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: sinyu sin <sinyusin@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 March, 2020 11:07 AM

To: Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>

Ce: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SOMPO REF: CMTD2001233/AGC/RE: Accident on 21/03/2020 involving SGS9675K & YQ129C along blk
135 bedok north st 2 carpark

Dear Irene Henry,

We would like to choose "LKK Auto Consultants / Marcus Chua (East area)" to be SIE.



. Thank you

" Regards
Welleang
Sin Yu Sin Workshop
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-52 |Autobay)
Singapore 417883

Tel: 91993103 Fax: 68163103

From: Henry, Irene James <irene_henry@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, March 23, 2020 10:18 AM

To: sinyu sin <sinyusin@hotmail.com>

Cc: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: SOMPO REF: CMTD2001233/AGC/RE: Accident on 21/03/2020 involving SGS9675K & YQ129C along blk 135
bedok north st 2 carpark

QOur Reference : CMTD2001233/AGC
Your Reference: 5G5S 9675K

Without Prejudice

Date: 23" March 2020 EMAIL ONLY

Attention:

M/S SIN YU SIN WORKSHOP

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YO 129C & SGS 9675K ON 21.03.2020

Dear Sir/ Madam,
We refer to your notice of accident dated 20.03.2020 via email.

Please be informed that Agnes Chan is the handler of this case who can be contacted @ 6329 5327/

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motar surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as
Maotor Surveyor Surveyor tick)

1 Raleigh Services Vincent Ng

Andrew Ow Yong

2



Kenneth Kong (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

leffrey Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appaintment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regarts
Irene Henry
Claims Division

D: 6322 4518 | T: 6461 6555

@ SOMPO Century of Trust

IHSUFLthEE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/08 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www sompo com sq | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase® via Sompo 5G

o i‘upp Store

Download now @
| For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | * For Travel. Personal Accident, Home & Priviate Molor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mall, including attachments, is intended for the persan(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawlul and 1s prohibiled
I you are not the intended recipient, please delele this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permittedirequired by laws. our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: sinyu sin <sinyusin@hotmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 21 March, 2020 3:35 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: Accident on 21/03/2020 involving SGS9675K & YQ129C along blk 135 bedok north st 2 carpark

k|




_Dear Sirs,
We are Instructed to send you the attached Notice of Accident / to conduct pre-repair survey,

Your insurer: Y(129C
Thank you

Regards

Weileang

Sin Yu Sin Warkshop
1 Kaki Bukit Ave &
#01-52 (Autobay)
Singapare 417883

Tel: 91993103 Fax: 68163103



Used Honda Stream Car for Sale in Singapore, Lucky Win Cars - sgCarMan Page | of 2
sGCARMART.COM Login  Sigh up

Hew Cars Used Cara Aental Carz Sall My Car Directory Products Insurance Arficles Farum Resources
. stream PicoRange  w| Deprecation | > iDwear(lv] VehceType v| N Submit Avinend
Home « esl Care » Lacxy Wn Cam « onds S 4 84 She Liibsn (TDF 10 1213581 )

Honda Stream 1.8A Style Edition (COE till 12/2021)

e E LW Financial Insurance Accessories Similar Research Photos
Price $14,800
e
Depreciation ¥B,600 fyr Reg Date 12-Diec-2006

{1y Brmths | Bdays COE laft)

Mileage N.A, Manufactured 2006

Road Tax $1,368 fyr Transmission Auto

Dereg Value $9,495 as of moaay | ] oMy 518,801

COE £27.554 ARF $£.20. 642

Engine Cap 1,799 cx Power 103.0 &W (138 bnp)
Curb Weight 1,350 kg Mo. of Owners 5

Type of Vehicle

Features

WView specs of the |

Accessories
Powerfud R18 [-WTEC Engine Paired With & Speed Altp Tranemicsion. Sports Rime, Lesther Seats

Description Selber Inf t
- e nrormmation
Luschy Win Preowned Cars! Extrematly Well Kept Unt. Oean And Neat [neenor, In Houss Loan OF §11K. o
Gimmacks! ldeal For Short Term Usage, Call Us Now For A Viewing Today! Quality Cars At Afordable Pricng! Lucky Win Cars
Category )
¢ 1 Kk Bukit bvenue 2 #01-2]
Eak Bul Rutmiub
Status
Available = s Lee B40E2608 &
&drenine Tan STTEOEIs @
Arithary (Boon) Fl001G5s @
e Lawersncs (Weng) GETT1980 &
m Yehicle Evaluation
—_—— Afrad of lemons™ Reguest to have this car evaluated professonally
" Car Valuation - Fres
o ™o Find out the markst value of your exnisting car for free
Upfront Paymeni
Transfer Fon 25
Comparn
https://www.sgcarmart.com/used cars/info.php?ID=891049&DL=1103 23-Mar-20



Used Honda Stream Car for Sale in Singapore. 88 Motor Trading - sgCarMart

sGCARMART.COM

Page 1 of 2

Login  Sign ug

Hew Cara Used Cars Rental Cars Sell My Car Direciory Products Insurance Articies Forum Resturces

=

sream  (PrceRacge v [Depreceson ] > 10yewi[v] VenceType v ¥ Submits —

Home = Lii? Carg = 68 Motor Trasding + Monds Stresm 184 (C0F 1l (51, 2022)

Honda Stream 1.8A (COE tll 01/2022)

DwErvice Fimancial

Price 14 800
Depreciation 7,960 fyr Reg Date 14-Feb-2007
{1yr 10mths Soays COE |eft)
Mileage NA Manufactured 2005
Road Tax $1.271 fyr Transmission Auto
Dereg Value %9796 as of today ( ) oMV §$17,789
COE $26,330 ARF $19.568
Engine Cap 1.799 cc Power 103.0 kW (138 bhp)
Curb Weight 1,350 kg Mo. of Owners 3
Type of Vehicle
Features

Full Lesan Asallable At $1k Plus, We Can Help To Convert To Z10 Ussge If Nesded. In House Loan Or Bank Loan
Assitable! Balloon Scheme Avallabie! Fast, Easy And Flexible Loan Approvall We Are sgCarMart Premium Deples
Buy With Confidence! Viewing And Test Drive Avallable Daily Including Weekend From 10.30 AM. To 6.30 P.M.|
Al Dur Yetuches Has Undergone A 120 Pomts Check By Our In House Workshop

Category
Status
Awaillable

Resources

m Vehicie Evaluation

— Afraid of lemons? Reguest to have this car evalustad professionally.
i Car Valuation - Fres
o ‘h. Find out the market valus of your existing car for fre=

Compare

https://www . sgcarmart.com/used_cars/info.php?ID=887396& DL =2080

Insurance Accessoring Similar Research Photos

S — BN o
= T B OB o
MOTOR TRADING als

Ssller Informmatian

E8 Motor Trading

® rREMIUM DEALER 3030 #

w 100 Jsdan Sultan #02-38/Level 7 Carpark
Testile Cenfre
Teh 62911187

5 ek B7S55787 @
ap EZETeTI 8
Mr Saby ann @
Yang ETTOELYT @

23-Mar-20



Jsed Honda Stream Car for Sale in Singapore, Coche Motors Pte Lid - sgCarMart

sGCARMART.COM

Mew Lals

Depreciation

Mileage

Road Tax

Dereg Value

COE

Engine Cap

Curb Weight

Type of Vehicle

Features

Powerful Yet Reliable 18L SOHC
Airbags, Digital Climatic Aircon View specs of the

Accessories

Auto Climanc Amcon, Leather Saats, Sports Rims, Reverse Sensors And Camera, UV Films, Knockdown Rear Sests

Description

Cheapest [n Town. Hurry Before It 15 Sold. 100% Loan Avaliable. 2 Dwners Only. No Repairs Nesded. Well
Mamtamed. Suitable For Short Term Usage. Viewing By Apposniment Only,. Trade In Waeicome. Feel Free To Cal

Financial

Gelting a new car soon? Find out maore before you buy today!

ETEAam

USed Cars Rental Cars
8A (COE till 08/
Insurance
12,500
SEBTO fyr
M.A
$1,359 hyr

57,849 as of today |
§27.232
1,799 o

1,360 kg

Lis For A Friendly Descussion

Category

Status

Available

Resources

wt Wy Can

AcTessories Sirmilar
Reg Date
Manufactured
Transmission
oMy
ARF
Power
No. of Owners

o f'l:f\ Find out the market value of your exisong car for free

gr*&: Vehicls Evaluation

—_—— Afrad of lamons? Request to have tis car evaluated professonally, |

Upfrpnt Payment

TAre

https://'www.sgcarmart.com/used _cars/info.php?1D=887516&DI.=3521

Direciory Froducts

Price Range L Ceepreciaton bl 10 year -

25-0ct-2006

[ Lyr Setheg Boays COE le=ft)

2006

Al

$42 830

$25,113

103.0 & [ 138 bhp)

Pl

16V I-NTEC Engene, Smooth 5-Speed Autc Transmason With Paddie Shift, ABS,

NIV e Artcies

ahicle Type - =  Subeut

Seller Information

Page | of 3

Farudim Hesources

Coche Motors Pte Ltd

10 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 =03-84

Preivigs P Akl Buk®

& weman Liang

tac

uEeTTIs @

greBBEIT @

23-Mar-20



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page | of 2

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Singapore NRIC
419C

SGS9675K

No

23 Mar 2020
HONDA
STREAM18A
Grey

2007
R18A1728771
RN61025477
103.0 kW (138 bhp)
$17.864.00

28 Mar 2007
28 Mar 2007

4

$19,651.00

Forfeited

$0.00

31 Dec 2021

B - Car (1601cc & above)
5

$27,594.00

$9.776.00

$9.776.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle
must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if

applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 23 Mar 2020

https://vrl.ha.gov.sg/la/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereglnput 7FUNCTION  ID=F030... 23-Mar-20



SIN YU SIN WORKSHOP

Reg No: 53253863C
1 Kaki Bukit Ave & #01-52 (Auto Bay @Kaki Bukit) Singapore 417883
Mabile no: (65) 51993103/96533103 Fax: (65) 68163103
‘Emall : Sinyusin@hotmail.com

21 March 2020

Sompo Insurance ﬁhgnpnre Pte Ltd

50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06
Singapore Land Tower,
Singapore 048623

1. We act for Seah Guan Yan, the owner of motar vehicle no SGS9675K which was involved In the
aforesaid accident

2. Please note that we will proceed to engage our own surveyors and/or carry out repairs to our
client's vehicle If you do not carry cut an Inspection of the vehicle on 24 March 2020




SIN YU SIN WORKSHOP

Reg No: 53253863C

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-52 {Auto Bay @Kaki Bukit) Singapare 417883 ‘//
Mobile no: (65) 91993103/ 97825292 Fax: (65) 68163103 id Mﬁ
23/3/re
D

Email : Sinyusin@hotmail.com
23 March 2020 ,V.,;—

THIIID PAITI"'f IHSU HEFI EOMPO IHSI.IHAHCE

g et O

S$/No. Parts List Qty Amount ()
1. Front bonnet 1 (ﬂ'—m 'fu{ 554050 i
1. Front bonnet lock 1 w4 513500 —
3. Front grille base 1 Cra S278.007
4.  Front grille chrome garnish 1 CAd  $253.00
5. Front grille "logo™ emblam 1 3&- > ¥y 44"' 5 65,00
, b3 oy
6. Front headlamp L/R 2434302 WT88%0 cAx  cios0s0 A~ 137860
7. Front headlamp bracket L/R 2ukgapaz om0 PR 53000 P
B Front bumper 1 08/ 7 0n $63500 —
8. Front bumper side retainer L/R 2 55 A4 5110005
10. Front reinforcement beam 13151 N 5 358.50 L
11. Front bumper lower grille 1 W1 510200 X
12. Front suppart panel 1 Hbb30 4// 55_3._.-:.,01:1'-"--“‘"'
13, Front suppart panel top garnish 1 A S 158.00 a"
14, Air Horn 2 65, AR $13000
15 Front air condenser 1 g& $927.00 X
16, Front radiator 1 ' $1083.00 A
Subtotal before discount S 7950.50
Discount 20% _ 5159810
Subtotal 1 £ 6352.40
S/No. arts 5/Nett Qty Amount ()
1. Front no plate 1 “1 s25 X
2. Front no plate gamish 1 1 s50 X
3. Front bumper clip 1 L 530
4. Front support panel top cover clip 1 ﬂ_i““‘- 530 f
Subtotal 2 5135
LABOUR
To check wirings and rectify slectrical faults where necessary $ &80 '; I:'

To remove and replace radiator and fan assy and perform leakage test through pressure testing S 150 ) (00
4]

To remove and replace alrcon condenser and charge up alrcon gas £120
To straighten, repair, realign on front affected area and replace damaged parts 51000 693
To spray painting on affected area S 1000 7 gf)

Total lenm'_{ﬂﬂ

RO

g3
3
ot

Total Cost OF Repairs|Total cost of parts + Total labour cost) ~  $B857.40



' ” V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

P 51 Ubi Ave 1 #0125 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
/y_. TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 5258 4315

Reg Mo 188607198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

SDMPD INSURANCE EII'\IGAKPDRE PL Red CS/SMO20004352/UsM3n2

sorarrics ruce [N
#05-01/06 pule amoaom

SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623

‘t‘ 1

0.00

Policy No
Claim No. CMTD2001233/AGC Excess ($) 0.00

Assign From  HENRY IRENE JAMES Assign Date 23/03/2020
Make & Model HONDA STREAM (A) c.c 17499

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2007
Chassis No. RMNB1025477 Colour BROWN
Odometer 192181 Stearing IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM

R/H Front Tyre |215/45R17 ROADSTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |[21545R17 ROADSTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre (21545 R17 ROADSTONE 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyra |21545R17 ROADSTONE 6 mm

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

Survey held at  SIN YU SIN WORKSHOP

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 8
#01-82 AUTOBAY
SIWE 41 ?533

TAYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.,
BI!H WGE TU' YGUR |H5THUG'|1UN5 WE HAVE NOT .H.UTHDRI-E ED RE F‘AIRS

ESTIMH'ED N{}RML PERJDD FDR REPAIFI




Fy 7L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- 51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408332
- TEL 6256 3561 FAX 6258 4115

Reg. No: 198607188R GST Reg No. 19-0607198-R Page Mo.i1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGS 9675K

1|FRONT BONNET BUCKLED 940,50 685.20
1|FRONT BONNET LOCK TWISTED 135.00 135.00
1|FRONT GRILLE BASE CRACKED 278.00 278.00
1|FRONT GRILLE CHROME GARNISH CRACKED 253.00 253.00
1|FRONT GRILLE "LOGO" EMBLEM MNECESSARY 65.00 35.20
2|FRONT HEADLAMP LIR CRACKED 1,860.50 1,378.60
2|FRONT HEADLAMP BRACKET LR @5110.00 CRACKED 220.00 110.40
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED / TORN 635.00 635.00
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER L/R @%55.00 MOT NECESSARY 110.00 -
1|FRONT REINFORCEMENT BEAM DENTED 35850 31520
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 102.00 -
1|FRONT SUPPORT PAMEL BENT 635.00 466.30
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TOP GARNISH MOT NECESSARY 158.00 -
2|AIR HORN @565.00 CRACKED 130.00 130.00
1|FRONT AIR CONDENSER SERVICEABLE 827.00
1|FRONT RADIATOR SERVICEABLE 1,083.00 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,508.10 -864.38
6,392 40 353752
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT MO PLATE (SN} NOT NECESSARY 25.00 -
1|FRONT NO PLATE GARNISH (SN} NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER CLIP {SN) NECESSARY 30.00 30,00
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TOP COVER CLIP {SN) MNECESSARY 30,00 30,00
135,00 60.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRINGS AND RECTIFY ELECTRICAL FAULTS 60.00 20,00
WHERE NECESSARY.
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE RADIATOR AND FAN ASSY 150.00 100,00
AND PERFORM LEAKAGE TEST THROUGH PRESSURE
TESTING, }

Report Ref No. CS/SM0O20004352/Usf3n2



I 4 L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- — 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

avansm
TEL 6256 3581 FAX: B256 4115

Reg No: 198607198R GST Reg Mo 12-8607188-R Page No.2 of 2

— —_————  —— —

TO REMOVE AND REPLAGE AIRCON CONDENSER AND

CHARGE UP AIRCON GAS. |

1O STRAIGHTEN,REPAIR REALIGN ON FRONT 1,000.00 500,00

AFFECTED AREA AND REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS.

TO SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREA. 1,000.00 780.00
2.330.00 1.500.00

GRAND TOTAL 8,857.40 5,087.52

Y

Report Ref No, CS/SMO20004352/Usfan2

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser

CHSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Raporn is mass saisly o i umw @i barmit of the Cllant namad on the froad pege of this Repser

Haguri n whole 51 in part. does 80 st his or her gwn sk



