Huey Yon (LKK Report)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

RE-SEND

Dear Sir / Madam,

Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Monday, 30 March, 2020 1:44 PM

Chan, Shu Hui Agnes

MotorSurvey@sompo.com.sg; SUR; Reports (LKKAuto)

FW: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SGS 9675K Ref: CMTD2001233/AGC
GIA Rpt.pdf; LKKAdjustmentla.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf; LKKInvoicel.pdf;
LKKphoto.pdf; LKKphoto-1.pdf; LKKphoto-2.pdf

Enclose Survey Report of SGS 9675K.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 30 March 2020 1:16 pm
To: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>

Cc: MotorSurvey@sompo.com.sg; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Reports (LKKAuto) <report@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SGS 9675K Ref: CMTD2001233/AGC

Dear Sir / Madam,

Enclose Survey Report of FBK 5673T.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315



Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



