Vic (LKKAuto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 April, 2020 12:25 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: SMR7873C & SML5790C DOA 19.3.20 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG20004338/Aha3
Attachments: INVOICE.pdf; LOA jpg; Ita fee.pdf; PHOTO-2020-03-19-15-19-16.jpg; SMR 7873C -

GIA report (19.03.20).PDF.pdf

Dear Mr Vic ,

Enclosed is invoice , GIA report , LOA ,invoice & Ita .

As request following :

1. RC $6420(S6000+7% GST - AS AGREED )

2. Loss of use $960 ( $120- 1800CC car of 2020 years x 8 days -6 days recommend + 1 day waiting
PRS + 1 days weekend

3. Ita $7.45

@ 100% TOTAL  $7387.45

( DIRECT FROM BEHIND WITH SCENE PHOTO )

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen

GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBOLIE PTE LTD
HP: 92712214

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, March 24, 2020 3:25 PM

To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SMR7873C & SML5790C DOA 19.3.20 *** LKK REF: CC6/A1G20004338/Aha3

Dear Sirs / Madam,



Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Vic,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 24 March, 2020 12:57 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SMR7873C & SML5790C DOA 19.3.20

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Refer : SML5790C -AIG
Enclosed is GIA & ESTIMATE .
Please advise OIC, Claim no & print the estimate pass to Mr Adrian . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen
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