Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 19 October 2020 8:39 AM
To: SVC Admin

Cc: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FW: Final Repair Bill for SLQ4039G
Attachments: SLQ4039G Final Repair Bill.pdf

Dear June,

Kindly submit Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to FWD SINGAPORE PTE LTD.

Ref no : 1202000014204

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: SVC Admin <admin.svc@revol.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 16 October 2020 4:41 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: FW: Final Repair Bill for SLQ4039G

Hi Veron,

Good afternoon

Please see attached copy of the updated Final repair bill for your approval.
Thank you and have a great afternoon

Best regards,

June

On Fri, 16 Oct 2020 at 10:51, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@l|kkauto.com> wrote:

Dear June,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Surveyor has confirmed amount of $3785.52.

See attached.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: SVC Admin <admin.svc@revol.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 10 October 2020 4:57 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Final Repair Bill for SLQ4039G

Hi GuoQiang,

Please find attached our final repair bill for SLQ4039G for your approval.
Thank you and have a great afternoon! :)

Best Regards,

June



