Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 19 March 2020 4:24 PM

To: ‘assignments'

Subject: FW: OUR REF: SNM20D201356/XE4257P/BEN - TP Claim - SJV7953U - DOA :
16/03/2020

Dear LKK

Please assist to arrange for survey of TP vehicle SJTV7953U.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Ben Tang
Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6175 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: X34 Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Nabilah <nabilah@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, March 19, 2020 9:35 AM

To: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang @sg.cntaiping.com>

Cec: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'Billy' <billy @mova.com.sg>; 'Nitha'
<nitha@mova.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM20D201356/XE4257P/BEN - TP Claim - SJV7953U - DOA : 16/03/2020

Your Ref : XE4257P
Dear Ben,

Kindly assist to arrange LKK Auto for the survey appointment on 20/03/2020 (Friday) morning at Mova (Fan
Yoong).

Kindly assist to advise on direct settlement.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Nabilah Senin
MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd

15 Fan Yoong Road

Singapore 629792
Tel: +65 6262 3377
Fax: +65 6264 3151

@MOVA

Auvlomative Pla Lid

Connect with us on [ﬂlﬂ

From: Ben Tang [mailto:Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 18 March 2020 1:45 PM

To: Nabilah
Cc: Claims Dept of CTI

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM20D201356/XE4257P/BEN - TP Claim - SJV7953U - DOA : 16/03/2020

Dear Sirs

We refer to your email dated 17 March 2020.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's vehicle jointly with your client/your
motor workshop. We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors to conduct the joint pre-repair survey

as a single joint expert.

LKK / LBS / STA

ADRIAN LING

Kelvin Ang

SEE CHEW SENG

MOHD FADHILAH BIN
OSMAN

XING QUO QIANG

KENNETH KONG

SIMON HO

CHUA WEUIE

MARCUS CHUA

HENRY NG

You may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out

by the single joint expert.

If we do not hear from you within two days of this letter, you shallhave deemed to have agreed that the surveyor
appointed by us shall be Single Joint Expert for this maftter.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Ben Tang
Executive



Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6175 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: K Py Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Wednesday, March 18, 2020 1:22 PM

To: Nabilah <nabilah@mova.com.sg>; Ben Tang <Ben.Tang @sg.cntaiping.com>

Cec: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: OUR REF: SNM20D201356/XE4257P/BEN - TP Claim - SJV7953U - DOA : 16/03/2020

Dear Ben,

Please conduct PRS for SJV7953U.

Note : officer in charge — Ben Tang 63896175.

*#% Kindly quote our reference number when replying.
Thank you

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896116 | F: (65) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A~FJii3f Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately.
Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Nabilah <nabilah@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, March 17, 2020 6:30 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cec: 'Billy' <billy @mova.com.sg>; 'Nitha' <nitha@mova.com.sg>
Subject: TP Claim - SJV7953U - DOA : 16/03/2020

Your Ref : XE4257P

Dear Sir/Mdm,



Kindly assist to arrange survey on 18/03/2020 (Wednesday) at Mova (Fan Yoong).
Kindly assist to advise on OIC and direct settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Nabilah Senin
MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd

15 Fan Yoong Road

Singapore 629792
Tel: +65 6262 3377
Fax: +65 6264 3151

@MOVA

Aulomative Pla Lid

Connect with us on nm



