Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 April 2020 11:13 am

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: Fw: RE : ESTIMATE FOR SMG 7163 B & AFTER PAINT PHOTOS
Attachments: SMG 7163B.pdf

Confirmed.

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 6 April 2020 9:01 AM

To: kumchewl <kumchewl@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: RE : ESTIMATE FOR SMG 7163 B & AFTER PAINT PHOTOS

Attach finalised for SMG 7163B. Kenneth

From: kumchew1 [mailto:kumchew1@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 3 April, 2020 4:20 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: RE : ESTIMATE FOR SMG 7163 B & AFTER PAINT PHOTOS

Hi Mr Kenneth,

Please let us have your finalise amount.

Best Regards,

Mdm Lim

KUM CHEW MOTOR WORKSHOP

160 Sin Ming Drive
#05-08 Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

Tel : 64563715 Fax: 64557754

From: kumchew1 [mailto:kumchew1@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, March 20, 2020 4:57 PM

To: 'kennethkong@lkkauto.com'

Subject: RE : ESTIMATE FOR SMG 7163 B & AFTER PAINT PHOTOS

Hi Mr Kenneth,
Refer to the above matter.

Please find attached estimate for you to marking and reply us by email.



Your early revert is much appreciated.
Best Regards,

Mdm Lim

160 Sin Ming Drive

#05-08 Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel : 64563715 Fax : 64557754



