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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg

Sent: Wednesday, 22 July 2020 11:08 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: kentsh@vfixauto.com.sg; jeffbz@vfixauto.com.sg; jessicassy@vfixauto.com.sg; 

ybsim@vfixauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: Finalize PC8853Y DOA - 17/03/2020

Importance: High

Dear Rasul, 
 
Good day to you. 

 

We refer your email dated on 21/7/2020. 
 
We accept your offer amount at $15,800 and 17 working days. 
 

Please help us proceed to next step. 
 
Have a nice day and thank you. 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
 
Weng Sheng 
Motor Claim Operation Admin 
Vfix Auto Pte Ltd | Vfix Rental Pte Ltd  
26 Chia Ping Road Singapore 619977 
Contact: 6455 2957 | E: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg 

 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 21 July 2020 7:14 PM 
To: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg 
Subject: RE: Finalize PC8853Y DOA - 17/03/2020 

 

Hi Weng Sheng, 
 

Refer to attachment 
Finalised amount is $ 15,800 / 17 days of lump sum repair 

Kindly confirm 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg [mailto:wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 21 July, 2020 5:44 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 
Cc: ybsim@vfixauto.com.sg; jeffbz@vfixauto.com.sg; jessicassy@vfixauto.com.sg; kentsh@vfixauto.com.sg 

Subject: RE: Finalize PC8853Y DOA - 17/03/2020 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Rasul, 
 
We refer to your email dated on 30.06.2020. 

 

This is to follow up on the finalize amount from your side that we not receive ever 

since 30.06.2020. 

 

Your prompt reply will be highly appreciate. 

 

Thank You. 
Thanks & Regards, 
 
Weng Sheng 
Motor Claim Operation Admin 
Vfix Auto Pte Ltd | Vfix Rental Pte Ltd  
26 Chia Ping Road Singapore 619977 
Contact: 6455 2957 | E: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg 

 

From: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg <wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 30 June 2020 4:23 PM 
To: 'Rasul (LKKAuto)' <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'ybsim@vfixauto.com.sg' <ybsim@vfixauto.com.sg>; 'jeffbz@vfixauto.com.sg' 
<jeffbz@vfixauto.com.sg>; 'jessicassy@vfixauto.com.sg' <jessicassy@vfixauto.com.sg>; 
'kentsh@vfixauto.com.sg' <kentsh@vfixauto.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Finalize PC 8853Y DOA - 17/03/2020 
Importance: High 

 

Dear Rasul, 
 
Kindly refer the attached email to finalize cost of repair. 
 
We looking forward for your reply. 
 

Thank You. 
Remark: W.e.f 22nd April 2019, our office has been relocated to 26, Chia Ping Road, Singapore 
619977. Please update your record with the following: Company contact number - 6455 2957 ; 
Company general email - contact@vfixauto.com.sg 
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Thanks & Regards, 
 

Weng Sheng 

Motor Claim Operation Admin 

Vfix Auto Pte Ltd | Vfix Auto Service Pte Ltd | Vfix Leasing Pte Ltd 

26 Chia Ping Road Singapore 619977 

Contact: 6455 2957 | E: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg 
 

From: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg <wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 4 June 2020 5:27 PM 
To: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)' <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'ybsim@vfixauto.com.sg' <ybsim@vfixauto.com.sg>; 'jeffbz@vfixauto.com.sg' 
<jeffbz@vfixauto.com.sg>; 'jessicassy@vfixauto.com.sg' <jessicassy@vfixauto.com.sg>; 
'kentsh@vfixauto.com.sg' <kentsh@vfixauto.com.sg>; 'alanclk@vfixauto.com.sg' <alanclk@vfixauto.com.sg>; 
'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Finalize PC 8853Y DOA - 17/03/2020 

 

Dear Shirley, 
 

Kindly refer the attached after paint photo and estimate for you to finalize cost of 
repair. 
 

Thank You. 
Remark: W.e.f 22nd April 2019, our office has been relocated to 26, Chia Ping Road, Singapore 619977. Please 
update your record with the following: Company contact number - 6455 2957 ; Company general email - 
contact@vfixauto.com.sg 

  
Thanks & Regards, 
 

Weng Sheng 

Motor Claim Operation Admin 

Vfix Auto Pte Ltd | Vfix Auto Service Pte Ltd | Vfix Leasing Pte Ltd 

26 Chia Ping Road Singapore 619977 

Contact: 6455 2957 | E: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg 

 

From: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg <wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 3 June 2020 3:55 PM 
To: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)' <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'ybsim@vfixauto.com.sg' <ybsim@vfixauto.com.sg>; 'jeffbz@vfixauto.com.sg' 
<jeffbz@vfixauto.com.sg>; 'jessicassy@vfixauto.com.sg' <jessicassy@vfixauto.com.sg>; 
'kentsh@vfixauto.com.sg' <kentsh@vfixauto.com.sg>; 'alanclk@vfixauto.com.sg' <alanclk@vfixauto.com.sg>; 
'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: PC 8853Y DOA - 17/03/2020 

 

Dear Shirley, 
 

Noted and once we confirm will revert you. 
 

Thank You. 
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Remark: W.e.f 22nd April 2019, our office has been relocated to 26, Chia Ping Road, 
Singapore 619977. Please update your record with the following: Company contact number - 
6455 2957 ; Company general email - contact@vfixauto.com.sg 

  
Thanks & Regards, 

 

Weng Sheng 

Motor Claim Operation Admin 

Vfix Auto Pte Ltd | Vfix Auto Service Pte Ltd | Vfix Leasing Pte Ltd 

26 Chia Ping Road Singapore 619977 

Contact: 6455 2957 | E: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg 

 

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 3 June 2020 3:28 PM 
To: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg 
Cc: ybsim@vfixauto.com.sg; jeffbz@vfixauto.com.sg; jessicassy@vfixauto.com.sg; kentsh@vfixauto.com.sg; 
alanclk@vfixauto.com.sg; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: PC 8853Y DOA - 17/03/2020 

 

Dear Weng Sheng, 
 

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us. 
 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 

email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 

regretted. 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


