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Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)
From: Glynn Neo <glynn@jxc.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, July 9, 2020 10:54 AM
To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)
Subject: Re: Finalize XE 2726R

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: Green category

Agree.  

Sent from my iPhone 
 
 

On 7 Jul 2020, at 14:15, Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  
Hi Glynn, 
  
Kindly refer the finalize amount $2,050. Repair day 2 days. (L/S, before gst). 
  
If agree please reply ASAP. 
  
  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
  
LKK Auto Consultants 
  
Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
<XD2726R RepairCost1.pdf> 


