Zayyer

From: Zayyer

Sent: Tuesday, 15 March, 2016 4:51 PM

To: Jia Mu

Cc: Zayyer

Subject: RE: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SKB 5155M & SJS 3759G on
13/11/2015

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Jack,
Refer to the below email and conversation a while ago.

This is a conflicting version and there is no conclusive evidence from both parties. Enclose herewith is the statement
of our insured for your record purposes.

On a without prejudice basis, we propose to settle the claim at $$1019.00 and the breakdown is as following;

Cost of Repair $$1800.00
Loss of Use SS 180.00 ($60 x 3days)
$$1980.00
@50% liability $$990.00
GIA search $S 29.00
Total $$1019.00

Kindly confirm the acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis
with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings.
No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Zayer | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2409, email: zayyer@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jia Mu [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 14 March, 2016 10:55 AM

To: Zayyer <zayyer@lkkauto.com>

Subject: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SKB 5155M & SJS 3759G on 13/11/2015

Your Ref: SJS 3759G
Our Ref: SKB 5155M

Dear Sir/Madam,



Please find attached our LOD for your onward action. Original Copy will send to you by
Post.

Please feel free to contact the under mentioned should you require any further
information.

Your prompt action will be greatly appreciated.

Best Regards,

JACK Li

MG Solution Pte Ltd

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

Singapore 415933

Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+65) 6243 1376



