I'A L I.-' i Dol

Pre CU/FTE :
i f 'l:- 1- J||‘.I|

Dume/Time Hlu| P

Regnered i Merimen N 11 [

y 11§39 390 Vit

Inanarad Vehiche Mo £ Claim Ko —
wame of Inswsd T KON Thinty \lovy Loy Policy No . (1 L, N ek 1
msused Tel No __Wp "1‘1::,.:, AL e Mode | vCTUAee Bl P onsk kvartgaet
Excesm See [1 158 DOA M Place of Assidest - (ihard ¥ Tuit :‘I'HH Rt M
{5 drrves the owner® (YES /NO )  Namreof Ascidnt L ~ Pilia
|f NO, Driver Name / Age maumf(g;m waummt:m /ND
Driver Tel Mo (VL YES /NO) |emered Lisbility * L Fiual 7 Yes /o
= E |r‘.1|"":‘”- —_— — —_—
WSP: (4 (1 e WSP wsP WSP
Tel, ot Tel: Td: Te.
Lanbiiry Liability
RMEKS RMES




HEF:

- EEC BY PAna kiny | -
ASSIGNMENT
¢ 't.:_-
o B o — _l'ln‘nth' 1F'l‘h|‘- -_"'I- _1rlhg‘ ;:Jl_('
Estimmied Cost T mcgd-rlunrmrwwnmrpmmf
I Truck | Traller of
! E— P - TIl
To Insgect Vehicis No e Mars Hup 4 fe ec |51
of Workshop s Colout O 3 nsured | Std| NITNA
W sphedng A 1HIE T/Radic Insured | Std | NI/ NA
sued S — EngMNo. s
Policy No N e KPR DR/ e A i3k
Chmms NG, Gen | Falt | Poor | Burml
e [ — { =
Suminsured Excess l.lmmd.*ulhdlluntw Je—
iCianrs Record) Brake. fﬁ'orulmuruumm o -
Make of Veh e | e m;ﬁmmm«h R
TyeSes = F ;___: —
(Pakcy Candison) R apLg 31 ¢ J =
Samark The veh had commenced [ts NS | 05 @mnmnmﬂmmmmwm:mwm
m&llllﬂhldhlpldbﬂ. TOYO [ YOKO of
Bal o Madket Vaive. | Emat Baa
JDAC Accigent Rport Consistant? - Yes of No RBa R - _ mm R/Eal als ~mm
GlA | PR Sesn Consistent? - Yes of No LBa | mm LEs A o
e — e e — :.-_._qi—rj I—
Est Fepairs  dop Res Yes of Mo DOA pod 4% /
Lum Sum: y 3Val: Yes of No Survey haid at v & 7 14
A | REV | REP. | 24HRS Dﬂdw.rnlmmﬁl@ﬂmlmqr
vehide INIOUT -
Date Person Contacied:  ______— — mmrmm:mwﬁmunm
_Daie/Time | __mu-.nﬂw__________ I = IR S =
- . : ey = e o == a
\ Y il = == _ =
DusiTiesm. File Pront : Preil. Raport Days Of Rapair.
- . Final Report Resurvey Mo. of Trip: Sursgy Fos =
Ol T s Rapimm &3 ) P
add Fas: Site Inap 19
|t

Fgport FolTim

imo Sum | LB




CrpSisSM ol e
KmHOHﬁlﬂ!(ullli,Sb

2 At ['b*"‘luk Qlenl ™ I

.". lli

T LM oo e e
4 X
WRTR e ;
pe g J

Lo Ja/ f04L: ¢
r—l _ v

&)

Y Sbion

L ' -'-:‘-u:.rl?.’mﬂ:-‘un

- VAl A soweg
i B s
JBmct e Ky .”.I' T
Nal Approws Mo |ruejlwm" .
l;ln“mhn -
Synaiue:
Cme




Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAutD)

Sent: Thursday, 19 March 2020 7:14 AM

To: ‘'mg3solution@gmail com’

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SKB 5155M & SIS 3759G on
13/11/2015

Attachments: DV_SKB 5155M.pdf

Without Prejudice
Hi Sharon,
We refer to the above matter.

As discussed, we confirm settlement at $1,019.00(all-in).

On a without prejudice basls, we propose to settle the claim at $51019.00 and the breakdown is as following;

Cost of Repair $51800.00
Loss of Use 55 1B0.00 (560 x Idays)
$51980.00
@50% liability 5%990.00
GIA search £5 29.00
Total $$1019.00

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with the following documents for our further action: -

« LOD
s Authorisation to act signed by your client
Repair Bill

* GlA search receipt (529.00)

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negatiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ interred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party |s not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”




Hest Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408053)

From: Sharon < solution ail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 29 February 2020 10:19 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <che lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SKB 5155M & 5J53759G on 13/11/2015

Dear All,

We refer to below, we have seek for global sum of 51300 on 05/04/2020.
However, there were no update from your side. Kindly assist.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Sharan Chia

MG Solution Pte Ltd

Phone: 6243-1373 | fax: 6243 1376
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 | 5(415933)

From: Sharon [mailto: ution@gmall.com
Sent: Thursday, 5 April, 2018 10:21 AM

To: 'Zayyer <zayyer@Ilkkauto.com>; LKK - CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SKB 5155M & 515 3759G on 13/11/2015

Dear All,

We would like to counter offer at 51300 ( All in] .
Please kindly reconsider.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Sharon Chia

MG Solution Pte Ltd

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

Singapore 415933

Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+65) 6243 1376




From: Zayyer ilto:zayyer@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 29 March, 2016 1:05 PM

To: Jia Mu <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicie SKB 5155M & 5J§ 3759G on 13/11/2015

Dear Jack,
Refer to the below our offer.

Kindly revert back your acceptance. Thank you.

Best Regards,
Zayer | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2409, emall: zayyer Blkkauto.com| fax 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Zayyer

Sent: Tuesday, 15 March, 2016 4:51 PM

To: Jia Mu <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Cc: Zayyer < lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SKB 5155M & 5J5 3759G on 13/11/2015

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear lack,

Refer to the below email and conversation a while ago.

This is a conflicting version and there is no conclusive evidence from both parties. Enclose herewith Is the statement
of our insured for your record purposes.

On a without prejudice basis, we propose to settle the claim at $51019.00 and the breakdown is as following,

Cost of Repair $51800.00
Loss of Use 55 180.00 (SE0 x 3days)
S51980.00
@50% liability $5990.00
GIA search $S 29.00
Total $51019.00

Kindly confirm the acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis
with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings.
No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of
terms/settlement.”




Bast Regards,
Zayer | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pe Ltd

Phone: 6841 2409, emall: zayyer@kkauto.com| Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{208933)

From: Jia Mu [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 14 March, 2016 10:55 AM

To: Zayyer <zayyer@lkkauto.com>

Subject: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SKB 5155M & 5J5 37596 on 13/11/2015

Your Ref: SJS 3759G
Our Ref: SKB 5155M

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please find attached our LOD for your onward action. Original Copy will send to you by
Post.

Please feel free to contact the under mentioned should you require any further
information.

Your prompt action will be greatly appreciated.

Best Regards,

JACK Li

MG Solution Pte Ltd

Mo 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

Singapore 415933

Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+65) 6243 1376



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

Name P _SHSAN KM
Address CAPT #i1¢ 200 & ANCHORVALE
LeAl) W pg-E4 S 42377 )

Contact No

0: 476 ASIH fACTFLL TN SUEANCE  pTE 41D

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING /B £/£5M AND =75 33594 ON nx.fu;;,-,ug

AT/ ALONG ORCHARD  RepD

I/WE, SUSAN  rord , am/ar€ the registered owner of

mator car no. “I<E £1€S 4]

Pleace note that | have assigned all compensations monies due to me/us in the above said accident
to M/S MG SOLUTION PTE LTD.

|/We , hereby authorize you to release all compensation manies pertaining to the above-mentioned
accident to M/S MG SOLUTION PTE LTD and forward your settlement cheque to M/S MG
SOLUTION PTE LTD whom | had authorized to collect the said compensation monies.

Thank you

UC.E—”"‘ e 0

Signature of Claimant Witness By



MG SOLUTION PTELTD

23 Kakl Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #02.03 Singapore 4159
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6242 1376
{GST Reg. No. 20-1427944-N)

TAX iNéGIC

INVOICE No : T1 2019086

Bill To:
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD
78 SHENTON WAY

#07-12 AIG BUILDING

SINGAPORE 079120

PB No : 168027

Date ; 19-March-2020

ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT Vehicle Number : SKB 5155M
aTy DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
1 |To carried out accident repair as per surveyor's recommendation ] 800.00
(Lump Sumj
BEFORE GST 800,00
T% GST 63.00
TOTAL | § 863.00

Cheque should be made payable to MG Solution Pte Ltd

Co's stamp &E‘H‘I&Eﬂﬂd Signature



Menmen e-Claims

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Page 1 of |

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case | MWotified Est Submitted | Adj Assighed Adj Rot Adj Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Status
_ fg.gv 015 ;;:;\r 2015 541,800.00 $$1,800.00 Pending for Survey
| Edit Rag I Bt AZy Apt I 2Rt mml w:-l

HMain

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

[[Created by adjuster]

Insured: Micky Tham Wing Loong, 10: S1XI0066F
Eamant.  |KOM SUSAN, ID: 573412698
o 149 | sKB5155M Dete of Loss: ﬁﬁéf&?mﬁ From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r}]
Clam Type: | TP / 26383993725G Rt e | Coveroge: 33/08/301S - S3/0R/2015
hicie Rng.
:u;m':" 51537596 EL"{:‘“":;]__ MAT1B58S
- Excmia:
1_?551% MG Solution Pte Lid (HG) 23 Kak Bukit Avenue 4 #02-038, VICOM inspection Centre, 415933 Kaki Bukit - Tel: 51886331
s AIG Asis Pacific Insurance Pta. Ltd, (SG) - Tel! £5-6419-3000 ... [Handled by Lim, Shang Yang] ShengYang. Lim@aig.com
[JmARES | tndia tnternational Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100
Adjuster LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (NQ) - Tel 6256-3561 _ [Handled by ADRIAN LING] | Final Rpt due 18/03/2020]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

View Al |

Compose Case Mail |

» AIG_5G (18/01/7020): Report Send Back Alerts - SKES155M (TP)
+ AIG_SG (14/07/2016); Claim status
* AIG_SG (21/06/2016): Clalm Status
 AIG_5G (26/11/2015) < No subject >

Na results

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKSE
Duw Date  Priority Typa

view All | Searcn Tasks | Crente tew Task | Complete |

Task Group  Subject  Handier  Assigned By

Completed On

Created On Dona?

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 27/3/2020



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SKB5155M (26383993715G)

[5153759G]
™
KOH SUSAN
Nov 13 2015 4:00PM

[Micky Tham Wing Loong]

MG Solution Pte Ltd

Page 1 of |

fun-;mmm {iperpege 1 |l
Mo | Fineized Gn LEK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
i1 |(omft) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breakdown c Edit
Photos/Images :mM %]
Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbsnail | Print
1 |03031615:16 | Genersl View 0| worc || A
1 |03/03/16 15:16 | Chassis Number Q| waws | B
3 |03/03/16 15:16 Ganeral View 0| wedic | M
4 |03/03/1615:16 | General View 0| oscws | B |
5 |03/03/16 15:16 | General View g Leat G | A
6 |03/03/16 15:16 | General View 0| wawrs | A
7 |03/03/16 15:16 | Genersl View @ | s | B4
8 | 03/03/16 15:16 Ganoral View @ | Losd PG =]
9 | D03/03/16 15:18 General View 0| cedws | A
10 |0303/16 15:16 | General View D eewc | A
Documentation 1 par page wl| &
Ho | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thurmbnsil | Print
i 25/11J15 1134 TP GIA REPORT i Load POF

2 |15/07/16 14:45 email to ALG submit WP report Load POF

3 15/07/16 14:52 emall to AIG submit WP report Load POF

4 |15/07/16 14:52 | Estimate Losd POF

5 | 20/07/16 09:19 LETTER TD OI Load PDF

6 17/03/20 17:18 WORKSHOP INVOICE Load PDF

7 (270320 17:18 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
|§__|27/03/2017:18 | Melesss Vauchar Lasd PDF

§ (270320 17:18 | GLA SEARCH Losd PDF

10 |27/03/20 17:18 LoD Load PDF

No_| Finalized On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbnall | Print
1 |2®B/11/1510:48 | 0T GIA REPORT i Load PDF

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | prine |

There are na documaent checkiists configured.

Qur Checkilst Remarks - LEK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd

™y
L%
Show Remarks Ta: ﬁ Handling lnsurer
Pt | laildou @ ey @l wilmEs pia Bhtes 8 10 OThEY DaTieE
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 27/3/2020



Preview Page 1 of |
NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
AlG THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
FOR ACCIDENTS ON OR AFTER 1ST JUNE 2008
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SJS3759G (Insd veh) Model: HYUNDAI ELANTRA 1.6 (A)
SKBS5155M (TP veh)

| Date of Accident: |13/11/2015

Global Sum Settlement | : | [ | Yes | 1X] No

Repair Estimate 3| 4,013.00

Final Repair Cost 5 900.00

Loss of Usa L 80.00 3.00 days at $60.00 per day
Rental (if any) -5 0,00 days

LTA /| GIA Search Fee 5 28.00

Others: 5 0.00

5
Final Settlement Sum 5 1.019.00

below)

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1] YES [ X] NO (Kindly indicate

A) For Non GIA Registered Warkshop: Agreed Liability 50 (%)

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessad Liability (*): (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenano No:

* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nol apply.

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |MG Solution Pte Lid 3 1,018.00
2) - §
3) E
2T Mar
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2020
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.

(Final Repair Blll; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;

Medical Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d... 27/3/2020



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreg o 1sssariser)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCB/AIG15019863/APA30G2-1

Date: 27/03/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Policy No: 2100156406
Claimant .
Vehicle No : SKB5155M Insured Vehicle No : SJ53758G
Date of Loss: 131172015 Nature of Claim: TF Claim No: 263839937256
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SKBS5155M
Make & Modal: HYUNDAI ELANTRA, 1.6 (A) Engine No: G4FGBU2367T49
Reg Date: O7/DB/2011 (Man. Year: 2011) Chassis No: KMHDH41CMCU172356
Calour Red Odometer: B4526 km
Engine Capacity- 1581 cc
Market Valua/New Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/45 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 225145 R17
Front Left Side: Bridgestone 6 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone & mm
Front Right Side Bridgesione 8 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestona 6 mm
The above valuss represen! the remaining tyre treads depth
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Parts 2.513.00 1,422 40 1,080.60 4340
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,500.00 860.00 B840.00 42 67
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S%) 4.013.00 2,282.40 1,730.60 43,12
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 1,800.00
Nett Amount (S§) 4.013.00 1,800.00 2,213.00 55.15
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x S560.00/day) (S§) 180.00
(S%) 1.880.00
Liable Amount (50.00%) (S5) 990.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (5§) 29.00
Nett Liability (S$) 1,019.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 24112015
Date Inspected: 24112015 Inspecied At MG Solution Pte Lid (HQ)
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #02-03B,
VICOM Inspection Centre
Singapore 415933
Estimated Penod of Repair; 3.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 27/3/2020




Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: CHEW HSIAO TONG

NOTE: This reporf represents our fndings af ihe time and place of inspection stated harein, Such inspection has been carmed oul 1o [he best of our
knowiedge and abdity but any ofnar Kability undar any other ciroumsionces is hereby expressly sxciuded.

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 27/3/2020




Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR LH DOOR Dented 1,278.00F *1,278.00FL
2 1 *REAR LH DOOR LOCK Nol Necessary 354.00F ~FL
a 1 *REAR LH WHEEL RIM Cut T00.00FS *400 00 F5
4 1 *REAR LH DOOR WEATHERSTRIPE Not Necessary 181.00F ~FL
F=Francruse pan. S=5SpcNetl. L=ListhemDsc
Sub Total (S§) 2,513.00 1,678.00
- List Item Discount on L ltems 0.00/20.00% (S$) 0.00 25580
Total Parts (S§) 2,513.00 1,422.40

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 27/3/2020




Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellanecus Rems selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 PANEL BEATING New 800.00 300.00

2 SPRAY PAINTING New B00.00 400.00

3  TO TRANSFER DOOR FITTING New 150.00 B0.O0

4  TOPERFORM WHEEL ALIGNMENT New 150.00 BO.0D
Gross Labour Cost (S5) 1,500.00 B60.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 27/3/2020




