Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 May 2020 4:27 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: SL 4871 J HONDA VEZEL FINALISATION
Attachments: SLS 4871).pdf

L/Sump $3900.00 confirmed.

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 31 March 2020 8:50 AM

To: chewkeong@supreme.sg

Subject: RE: SL 4871 ) HONDA VEZEL FINALISATION

Attach finalised for SLS 48711J.

From: chewkeong@supreme.sg [mailto:chewkeong@supreme.sg]
Sent: Monday, 30 March, 2020 5:20 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: SL 4871 ) HONDA VEZEL FINALISATION

Dear Kenneth,

Attached are the photos for your finalisation.
Thank you.

Best regards,

Chew Keong

Supreme Auto Service Pte Ltd
No0.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 97368619

Fax: 64517423



