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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 4 May, 2020 3:19 PM

To: contact@revoperformance.com.sg

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving GV6622S And SKN136M ON 12/03/2020 ALONG INTERLACE 

CONDO OUTSIDE CONDO TRAFFIC JUNCTION ABOUT 0740 HOURS - LKK REF 

CC4/AIG20004143/Gha3

Attachments: LOD GV6622S.PDF

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Joey, 

 

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted. 

 

We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: contact@revoperformance.com.sg [mailto:contact@revoperformance.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 4 May, 2020 2:59 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: Accident Involving GV6622S And SKN136M ON 12/03/2020 ALONG INTERLACE CONDO OUTSIDE 

CONDO TRAFFIC JUNCTION ABOUT 0740 HOURS - LKK REF CC4/AIG20004143/Gha3 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Vic, 

 

Please refer attached as the LOD for GV6622S. 
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Kindly send us the discharge voucher so that we can contact our client to sign it. 

 

Do let me know if have any question. 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

Joey Chong 

Revo Performance Pte Ltd 

Tel : +65 67456706 

Fax : +65 64843653 

 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Friday, April 03, 2020 3:53 PM 
To: contact@revoperformance.com.sg 

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving GV6622S And SKN136M ON 12/03/2020 ALONG INTERLACE CONDO OUTSIDE 

CONDO TRAFFIC JUNCTION ABOUT 0740 HOURS - LKK REF CC4/AIG20004143/Gha3 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Benjamin, 

 

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted. 

 

We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: contact@revoperformance.com.sg [mailto:contact@revoperformance.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 3 April, 2020 3:31 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Accident Involving GV6622S And SKN136M ON 12/03/2020 ALONG INTERLACE CONDO OUTSIDE CONDO 

TRAFFIC JUNCTION ABOUT 0740 HOURS 

 

Dear Sir / Madam ,                                                                           

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING : (GV 6622 S  &  SKN 136 M) ALONG INTERLACE CONDO OUTSIDE CONDO 

TRAFFIC JUNCTION 
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DOA  :  12/03/2020           TIME  :  0740 HOURS 

 

We refer to the above matter and write on behalf of WAGGIES & 

FRIENDS   ,                                                                                                       

The registered owner of GV 6622 S in respect of the above 

accident                                                                                                       

                                                                                                                 

We are instructed that the above accident was caused by your insured’s 

negligent                                                                                                           

driving / or management of your insured vehicle                                                                                                               

Your insured’s vehicle SKN 136 M collided onto the rear portion of our 

client’s                                                                                                     

vehicle GV 6622 S, As a result of the accident , Our client has been put to loss 

and                                                                                                             

expenses ,Particulars of which are as follows :                                                                                                     

                                                                                                                 

1.      Cost of repair   ( $ 1200 + 7% GST )                                                  $ 1,284.00 

2.      Loss of use   ( $100 x 4 days )                                                             $    400.00 

3.      Buy GIA report                                                                                        $      29.00                                   

                              

Total Amount   :                $ 1,713.00           

                                      

Enclosed are the following documents for your perusal                                                                                                  

1)      Driver ‘s driving license / Identity card                                                                                                           

2)      Certificate of insurance                                                                                                        

3)      GIA report                                                                                                                 

4)      Original repair claim                                      

                                                                          

Our company is not the authorized workshop of any of the GIA member 

companies                                                                                                        

and we are writing in purely for amicable sake .           

                                                                                                        

The demand herein is in respect of our client’s for damages pertaining to his 

motor                                                                                                          

vehicle and any settlement following or subsequent to this demand shall 

not                                                                                                      

prejudice any claim in respect of personal injuries                                                                                                             

                                                                                                                 

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the above said documents within 7 days and 

your                                                                                                               

favourable reply is deeply appreciated .                                                                                                                 

                                                                                                                 

Your faithfully ,                                                                                                  

_____________              

 

Thank you 

Benjamin  

 

 

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

 


