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RE: SLU 183C OD / 3744397038SG
From: Azlan, Syazairdina
To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Cc: SUR, Lim, Sheng Yang, Chan, Yoke Shi
Sent: 3/30/2020 8:26:38 AM
Attachments: SLU183C.pdf
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Dear Shirley,
 
Wrapping is covered under insured’s policy and can be claim under the Fixture and Accessories (Cosme�cs). 
 
A�ached the policy wording for your reference.
 

 
Thanks and regards,
 
Syaza Irdina Azlan
AIG
Express Claims Adjuster II, Singapore FNOL, Claims Operations – Auto   
SG Claims Operations  | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
Tel:8001206556 | Ext:1012205
 
Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com | www.aig.sg
 
From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Friday, March 27, 2020 1:57 PM
To: Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>; Lim, Sheng Yang <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>; Chan, Yoke Shi <yokeshi.chan@aig.com>; Gan, Hun Chung
<Hunchung.Gan@aig.com>; Loo, Tong Shing <TongShing.Loo@aig.com>; Parthiban, Theerthan <Theerthan.Parthiban@aig.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] SLU 183C OD / 3744397038SG
 
This message is from an external sender; be cau�ous with links and a�achments.

Dear All,
 
Our surveyor would like to know whether the policy have cover to install wrapping for rear bumper and rear lid?
 

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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