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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 March 2020 11:30 AM

To: 'PBSP’; Nivitha (LKK Auto); Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: ‘assignments’

Subject: RE: Urgent attention to China Insurance - PRS: OUR REF:

SNM20D201106/SGT3857L/BEN - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKK415Z &
SGT3857L ON 29/02/2020

Dear LKK
Please assist to arrange for survey of TP vehicle SKK415Z.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Ben Tang
Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6175 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X3 Jfif Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, March 17, 2020 10:54 AM

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTI
<claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Urgent attention to China Insurance - PRS: OUR REF: SNM20D201106/SGT3857L/BEN - REQUEST FOR DIRECT
SETTLEMENT - SKK415Z & SGT3857L ON 29/02/2020

Dear China Insurance

As agreed previously in our email, we will use Lkk as the SJE.

Please assign survey to LKK on an urgent basis as vehicle is already in workshop.
Thank you.

Regards,
Caroline



C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941
DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 17 March 2020 10:07:05 AM
To: PBSP <pm|-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM20D201106/SGT3857L/BEN - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKK415Z & SGT3857L ON

29/02/2020

[External Mail] This email originated from outside of the organisation; be careful with requests, attachments and links.
Dear Caroline,

Please be informed that we did not receive any assignment from CTl for this case.

Best Regards
Shiau Chan

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 March 2020 8:35 AM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Foong Shiuh Jye <foong.shiuh.jye@simedarby.com.sg>; Shukhaizi Misbah <shukhaizi.misbah@simedarby.com.sg>
Subject: Fw: OUR REF: SNM20D201106/SGT3857L/BEN - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKK415Z & SGT3857L ON
29/02/2020

Dear Sirs,
Our client sent his vehicle today.

Please arrange survey + repair soonest.

Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline

Clo Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601




From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 9 March 2020 5:43 PM

To: Foong Shiuh Jye <foong.shiuh.jye@simedarby.com.sg>

Subject: Fw: OUR REF: SNM20D201106/SGT3857L/BEN - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKK415Z & SGT3857L ON
29/02/2020

From: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Monday, 9 March 2020 5:21 PM

To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM20D201106/SGT3857L/BEN - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKK415Z & SGT3857L ON

29/02/2020

[External Mail] This email originated from outside of the organisation; be careful with requests, attachments and links.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Caroline
Please be advised that liability is clear.

We agree to direct settlement subject to consistency of damages based on findings from
surveyor with supporting documents.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Ben Tang
Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896175 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A it Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

: AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the
named addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or
proprietary to the Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If
you are not the intended Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or
printing the Message. Please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies
of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being
infected by computer virus or other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message
are solely those of the author's and do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”



