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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 29 April 2020 10:54 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SKQ4589Y REPAIR LIMIT

Attachments: SKQ4589Y.pdf

Hi Veron, 

 

Refer attached, part price checked. 

 

Regards 

Taufikh 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 28 April 2020 3:50 PM 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 
Subject: FW: SKQ4589Y REPAIR LIMIT 

 
Dear Taufikh, 

 

Parts prices check already? 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 

related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 28 April 2020 3:24 PM 

To: 'Rico 60' <claims@rico60.com> 

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SKQ4589Y REPAIR LIMIT 

 
Hi, 
 

Based on the repair limit, COR l/s$15,000 , 9 days. 

 

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 
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From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Wednesday, March 18, 2020 11:36:13 AM 

To: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com> 

Subject: SKQ4589Y REPAIR LIMIT  
  
Hi, 
 
Please take note repair limit for this car is $15,000. 
 
Regards 
Taufikh  
Lkk Auto 
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