Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 28 April 2020 3:00 PM
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fwd: SKQ4589Y REPAIR LIMIT
Get Outlook for Android

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, March 18, 2020 11:36:13 AM
To: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com>

Subject: SKQ4589Y REPAIR LIMIT

Hi,

Please take note repair limit for this car is $15,000.
Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto
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