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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 April 2020 8:17 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); Rico 60 Enquiry

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SJR872L REPAIR LIMIT

Attachments: IMG-20200428-WA0063.jpg; IMG-20200428-WA0064.jpg; IMG-20200428-WA0065.jpg

Dear Sir, 
 
I refer to attached afterpaint  
 
Offer accepted. 
 
Dear Shanelle, 
 
Please prepare the lod and cor to submit. 
 
Br, 
John Ong 
 
On Tue, 28 Apr 2020, 14:52 Taufikh (LKK Auto), <taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi, 

  

Based on the repair limit. COR l/s $4000 , 7 days. 

  

Please forward the after repair photos, thank you. 

  

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Wednesday, March 18, 2020 11:37:25 AM 

To: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com> 

Subject: SJR872L REPAIR LIMIT  
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Hi, 

  

Please take note repair limit for this car is $4000. 

  

Regards 

Taufikh  

Lkk Auto 
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