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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 23 March 2020 4:09 PM

To: Daniel Jude (danieljude@motorimage.net); SUR
Cc: TPY Insurance Team; Qoi Siow Hooi

Subject: SLF 4769R-DOA: 12/3/2020 (AIG OD)

Dear Daniel,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLF 4769R, based on surveyor’s
marking or whichever lower, (Excess $800/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



3/23/2020 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SLF4769R (51302490445G)
oD
Mar 12 2020 4:00PM
[MANDY YVONNE NG]
Motorimage Enterprises Pte Ltd

Repl;] _Reply: El Ma_rk as Ur;re_ad ] _Prln': l':'lgss_-age | Delete Message | Forward I o

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 23/03/2020 15:49 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$13698.60) - SLF4769R - Claim Handler: Nadaraja, Deeban

Approved:13698.60:Authorise repair, Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour with CLEAR photos.

'DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&linboxid=1652936&iDomainld=11&0bjld=1...  1/2



View Sent Message

This mall is associated with :

*SLF4769R (51302490445G)
(o]s]
Mar 12 2020 4:00PM
[MANDY YVONNE NG]
Motorimage Enterprises Pte Ltd

Resend I View Reciplents] Print Message l Delete Message | Forward ]

From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 20/03/2020 09:25 AM,
To Victor-CK.Koh@aig.com
cc veronchen@lkkauto.com; denisetay @lkkauto,com

Subject Re: Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SLF4769R - Claim Handler: Nadaraja, Deeban

Dear Victor,
According to surveyor, labour and spray paint not included right side.

8 Days for labour at $250/Day
6 Panels x $200

Rear RH Door shifted due to impact force.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler on behalf of Veron

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

<-- Original Message -->

From: AIG_SG

To: LKK_HQ

Sent On: 17/03/2020 01:47 PM

Subject: Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SLF4769R - Claim Handler: Nadaraja, Deeban

paint per panel,

Maintained:why is there labour and spray paint given for right side when damages on the left side? To re-adjust and indicate labour per day/ spray

'DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

| There are no documents.




3/17/2020 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is assoclated with :

*SLF4769R (51302490445G)
oD
Mar 12 2020 4:00PM
[MANDY YVONNE NG]
Motaorimage Enterprises Pte Ltd

| Reply I Reply All ] I\;'!ark as Unread | Print Message I Delete_Méssaﬁé_f F-em;ra jl_ o -

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (AIG_SG), senton 17/03/2020 13:47 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject

Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SLF4769R - Claim Handler: Nadaraja, Deeban

Maintained:why Is there labour and spray paint given for right side when damages on the left side? To re-adjust and indicate labour per day/ spray
paint per panel.

g0 Labou per parel
B0 Spiay peant A parel

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY - o o
| There are no documents.

f\((c-uc-l\fir, 1o ﬁlth\'i, labous cvdl = awnt et w(luclech right <icly

Lebeor pet prel 250 2o G b & 6D {dfj
Splf‘g [amvﬁ q;v( Fﬂ?\ £ 200 é Pcw.is . e

L, P don ShAA oo A 1ot s Jores

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1649783&iDomainld=11&i0bjld=1...  1/2




3/17/2020 Rich Text Editor, SVCDOCItrcontent

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno:199s07108r)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ilkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AIG Building

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933
Attn:  Nadaraja, Deeban Date: 17 Mar 2020

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SLF4769R Accident Date : 12/03/2020
Make : SUBARU FORESTER Policy No. : 2100480322
Assignment Date  : 16/03/2020 Excess . $%$800.00
Date of Inspection : 16/03/2020 Est. Duration of Repair  :12.00
Inspection At : MOTORIMAGE ENTERPRISES PTE LTD (HQ)

19 LORONG 8, TOA PAYOH
SINGAPORE 319255

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages

The vehicle sustained impact / damages n/s body and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross)
Revised Amount

Check Items (Estimated)
Total

Lump Sum Repair

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value
Pre-Accident Value
COE / PARF Rebate
Salvage Value
Margin for Repair

Remarks

(X))

:S§
:S§
:S$
8%

:S$

:S$
:S$
:S$
:S$
:S$

25,332.60
13,698.60

3,278.80
16,977.40

68,000.00
48,582.00

19,418.00

The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage.

Kindly let us have your authorisation.

The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

Other comments :

(s A’

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_rpts&rptmode=2&caseid=924777 &extid=334083&adjcu... 1/



SLF4769R - OD RECOVERY CLAIM - AIG INSURED - ARRANGE SURVEY -...

From: Chin, Lee-Ying

To: 'assignments’, Nivitha (LKK Auto)
Cc: Lim, Kok-Chong

Sent:  3/16/2020 7:45:15 AM

Attachments: TE) SLF4769R GIA REPORT - OD.PDFTX] SLF4769R ESTIMATE.PDF

Hi LKK,

Kindly assist to survey.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Lee Ying, Chin

AlG

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd.
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1947

Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: Daniel Jude [mailto:danieljude@motorimage.net]

Sent: Saturday, March 14, 2020 2:12 PM

To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey

Cc: TPY Insurance Team; Mohamed Isman

Subject: [EXTERNAL] SLF4769R - OD RECOVERY CLAIM - AIG INSURED - ARRANGE SURVEY - 16/03/2020 -
1100HRS - NON DRIVABLE CAR

Importance: High

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Hi Claims Team,
Kindly assist to arrange survey for the above mentioned vehicle
16/03/2020 - 1100hrs

**Non drivable car**

Thank You.

Best Regards

Daniel A Jude

Service Executive

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255

HP: 8611 3195

Email: danieljude@motorimage.net

Website: www.tanchong.com : www.motorimage.net




> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner |D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Mar 2020

Singapore NRIC
887H

SLF4769R

No

17 Mar 2020
SUBARU

FORESTER 2.0I-L CVT AWD SR
White

2016

FB20Y358584
JF1SJ5KC5GG075359
110.0 kW (147 bhp)
$16,215.00

29 Aug 2016

29 Aug 2016

0

$16,215.00

Yes
28 Aug 2026
$12,161.00

28 Aug 2026

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$56,500.00

$36,421.00

$48,582.00

OK



3/17/2020 Singapore Used Car Listings - sgCarMart

scCarMArRT.COM
THE ONLY PLACE TOR SMART CAR BUYLRS

Subaru Forester 2.0i-L Sunroof Used Vehicle List (13 vehicles)

Subaru Forester 2.0i-L Sunroof %$71,800 $9,410 /yr 31-Dec-2016  1,995cc 33,652 km  Happy Motoring Pte Ltd Available

1 Owner, Super Low Mileage At 33k, Huge Cabin/Boot Space, Call Avallable In Showroom For Viewing Now, Low Interest Rates Starting From 2.48%, 100%
Loan Available, Call For More Info.

| Office No. - 68442228

| Toh - 81388352 | Sham - 84228768 | Khoo - 96803004

Subaru Forester 2.0i-L Sunroof $72,800 $9,710 Jyr 01-MNov-2016 1,995 cc 31,900 km  AA Trust Automotive Available

! 1 Year Extended In-House Warranty. AA Trust Certified Quality Vehicle! The New Forester That Boast A Meaner Look And All Rounder Driving Experience!
| Comfort And Sporty That Drives Well On Long Distanc...

| Office No. - 63450381
Amos - 88005757

Subaru Forester 2.0i-L Sunroof $68,500 $9,270 [yr 20-Sep-2016 1,995 cc 76,632 km  Sincere Motoring Pte Ltd  Awvailable

| Drive With Assurance From An Accredited Dealer! Genuine Sales With No Gimmicks. Price Stated Are Final With No Hidden Cost. Straight Forward Deal With
Transparency Assured. Bank Interest Rates At 2.28...

Office No. - 67476066
Simon Tan - 91261801 | Edwin - 92331607 | Jeremy - 98150651

Subaru Forester 2.0i-L Sunroof $68,300 $9,340 [yr 02-Sep-2016 1,995 cc 80,680 km  Supreme Cars Ventures Available
Pte Ltd

Price Reduced! Special Financing Rate With DBS! Minimum 12 Months Warranty! Attractive And Easy Ownership With Supreme Cars Leasing! Beautiful Silver
Paintwork And Black Leather Interior! Trade In Ava..,

Office No. - 62593910
Ming - 96239952 | Ethan Koh - 93705799 | CT Chua - 93667761

Subaru Forester 2.0i-L Sunroof $68,800 $9,720 Jyr 29-Jun-2016 1,995 cc 58,000 km  Tay Motor & Credit Pte Ltd Awvailable

A Very Well Maintained Unit. Fully Serviced Agent Unit. Original Paintwork And Leather Seats Still In Excellent Condition. Feel The Excellent Handling Of
Subaru's AWD. Flexible Financing And Low Inter...

Office No. - -
Ben Poh - 90602520 | JC - 97947078 | Jason Loh - 81001755

Subaru Forester 2.0i-L Sunroof $70,800 £10,090 /yr 17-Jun-2016 1,995 cc 60,000 km  Hua Yang Credit Pte Ltd Available

Well Maintain Condition 1 Owner With Low Mileage Done, High Trade In, High Loan Available, 5 Year Warranty By Agent.

Office No, - 64625111
Sky - 84371619 | Miss Tan - 86864198 | James - 87682318

| Subaru Forester 2.0i-L Sunroof $62,800 £8,870 /yr 30-May-2016 1,995 cc 95,000 km  Auto Zoom Enterprise Pte  Available
Ltd
Buy With A Peace Of Mind 1 Year Warranty! Special Offer Interest Rate At 1.98%! Cheapest In Market! Engine In Stock And Tip Top Condition!

Office No. - 63421000
Stanley Chua - 96813489 | Robin - 97603335 | Jeffrey - 90041167

Subaru Forester 2.0i-L Sunroof $64,800 $9,350 fyr 27-Apr-2016 1,995 cc 78,393 km  Lake View Credit Pte Ltd ~ Available

Owner, New Yokohama Tyres, New Paintwork, Bidded Car...

Office No. - 67499895
Tong Hoe - 96433160 | Mr How - 97279995 | Alvin - 97914451

Subaru Forester 2.0i-L Sunroof $65,800 $9,540 /yr 18-Apr-2016 1,995 cc 64,608 km  Accendore Autolution Pte  Available
Ltd

Hurry! 1,98% Special Interest Rate, 1 Year Warranty Cover Engine And Gear Box, Free Ceramic Coating Worth $588 Comes With 2 Years Warranty, Can
Arrange For STA Evaluation, High Trade In Up To $2k More...

Office No. - 67473113
Adrian Lee - 91291200 | Patrick Chia - 98988585

Subaru Forester 2.0i-L Sunroof $63,800 $9,280 [fyr 31-Mar-2016 1,995 cc 99,774 km  Hua Yang Credit Pte Ltd ~ Available

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/search_result_pricelist_print.php?SA=&MOD=Subaru Forester 2.0i-L Sunroof&8RPG=20&RGD=2016&AVL...

Car Model Price Depreciation Reg Date Eng Cap Mileage Company Availability

Elegant Pearl White Forester 2.0A! Genuine Low Mileage Done 78393km. Maintained At Reputable Workshop With Proof, As Good As New. 1 Fussy Car Lover

1/2



CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

SUBARU AUTO PROTECTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Name of Policyholder  : Mandy Yvonne Ng Vehicle No. : SLF4769R
Period of Insurance : 28 Aug 2019 To 28 Aug 2020 Policy No. : 2100480322-03
Engine No. : FB20Y358584 Endorsement No. :
Chassis No, : JF1SJ5KC5GG075359 Issued Date : 08 Aug 2019
ABOUT THE COVER
Make/Model SUBARU FORESTER 2.0I-L
Engine Capacity/Tonnage = 1,995.00 CC Sum Insured = Market Value First Year of Registration : 2016
Driver Restriction . NA Off Peak Car : No Insuring with COE/PARF : Yes

Person or Classes of Persons Entitled to Drive”

s) The Policyholder

b) Any ather person who Is driving on the Pelicyholders order or with hisfher permission

This Policy will indemnify the Policyhalder or any authorised driver only if he/she meels the specifiad age condition

Age Condition 40 years old and abave
Limitation as to use*

Use only for social, domestic and pleasurs purposes and for the Policyholder's business, This Policy does not cover use for hire or reward, driving tultion, driving test, racing par_‘-mak.n‘g reliability trizl or
speed-testing, the camage of goods other than samples in connection with any trade or business or usa for any purpese (n conrection with Motor Trade.

Loss of Use 1500cc - 1600cc

* Limitations renderad inoperative by Saction 8 of the Motor Vehicles (Third-Party Risks and Compansation) Act (Cap, 188), Section 85 of the Road Transport Act, 1887 (Malsysia) and Road Transport
{Amendment) Act 2018, are not ta ba included under these headings

Section 1
Fire - 0 Own Damage - $800 Theft - $0 Flood Cover - $0

Section 2
Property Damage - S0

Windscreen : $100

Named Driver and EXcess (where applicanie)

Mandy Yvonne Ng - $800 (Own Damage)

APPROVED REPORTING CENTRES/AUTHORISED REPAIRERS (FOR CLAIMS RELATED REPAIRS)

1.Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd Add 18 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 318255 64170100

Farother Approved Reporting Centres/AlG Authorised Repairers, please contact our 24-hour accident emergency hotline 8t +65 6338 5200. Alternatively, you may refer 1o AlG website www alg com sg |
or AIG SG Mobile App. Simply search and dewnload “AIG SG* fram Tunes or Google Play |

IMPORTANT NOTES

Hire Purchase Company/Employer's Loan: MayBank

|/We hereby certify thal the palicy lo which this Certificale of Insurance relates is Issued In accordance with the provisions of the Motor Vehicles(Third Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Cap. 188), Part IV of
the Road Tr port Act, 1887 (Malaysia), Road Transport (Amendmant) Act 2013 and Motor Vehiclas (Third Party Risks) Rules. 1953 (Malaysia)

0500619222
oMt
TAN CHONG CREDIT SUBARU-YBS e

811 BUKIT TIMAH ROAD TAN CHONG MOTOR CENTRE

SINGAPORE 589622 AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
Underwritten by AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. AUTHORISED REPRESENTATIVE

0. Reg. Mo 201008404M | Copyrgh! € 2016 AIG Asia Pacibe Insurance Ple. Lid

SBCFHY

78 Shenton Way #07-18 AIG Building S079120 | T:+65 6419 3000 | www.alg.sg AlG Asia Pacific Insuranca Ple. Lid.




REPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE
IDENTITY CARD NOo. S7670887H

HName

MANDY YVONNE NG

—
M Race
CHINESE
a Date of birth Sex 576T0887H
= 12-05-1976 F

Country/Place of birth
UNITED KINGDOM

447387

naic e S7TE70BB7H

T

Oate of issue
— 01-04-2015
Address
APT BLK 134 BISHAN STREET 12
#07-163

SINGAPORE 570134




MMIE20032021 | Motor Image Enterprises Pte Lid - Toa Payoh
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 13/03/2020 13:33
SUBMITTED BY Dariel A Jude

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process

2. This Form must be completed by the Paolicyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow Insurance companies to

repudiate policy liability

4. The Issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies Is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies
5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

€. This report will be forwarded by the Insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made avallable upon application by interested parties
7. By the lodgement of this report to the Insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made avallable

aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

13/03/2020 13:33
12/03/2020 16:20
BEDOK NORTH AVE 4
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Madel

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC Na

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

SLF4769R

MANDY YVONNE NG
SXXXX887H
MANDY@NUS.EDU.SG
(LOCAL) +65-91388548
OFFICE-NOPHONE

SUBARU
FORESTER-2.0 I-L CVT AWD SR (A)

PERSONAL /LEISURE

YES

PRIVATE CAR

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

2100480322

MANDY YVONNE NG
SXXXX887H

12/05/1976

INDOOR

02/01/1998

22 YEARS AND 2 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-91388548

OFFICE-NOPHONE
MANDY@NUS.EDU.SG

Page 1of 71



Address APT BLK 134 BISHAN STREET 12 #07-163
Postcode 570134

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OWNER

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle 5

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - CROSS JUNCTION
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle) 2

involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown person(s) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 3

Passenger 1 NAME: C

GENDER: : FEMALE

Passenger 2 NAME: .2
GENDER: . FEMALE

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

PLEASE REFER TO THE ATTACHED DOCUMENTS
Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO

Vehicle Registration Number SLV9158L

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour HONDA FIT/JAZZ

Details Of Properties FRONT PORTION

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Name of Driver CHUA HENG LEONG JASON
NRIC/Passport Number SXXXX959B

Contact Number 82339417

Address

Postcode

Page 2 of T1



Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 3of 71



Accident Sketch Plan
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DECLARATION
1/We deciare the foregoing particulars are trus In svery retpect

f

Pollcynolder's Signgtire Oriver's Signature R:pm ng Centre P ersonnel’s Signature

Date & Time (% m,'}\ 21729 (I driver iz not the policyhelder) Namao: MfEL JuokE
e T amn Date & Time: MBIFIEI M - W W e X EF
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Accident Sketch Plan
SKETCH PLAN
IMPORTANT NOTICE
' emmmmm«numammwwm-ma}rms
2 This Form must be gompleted b

3 Inlormation provided must te as truthful and accurate as possible, Any wilful msrapresantation or withhaiding of materis)
facts may allow insurence companies 'o repudiate policy lability

4 The issue and acceplance of this Form by insurance companies is nal an admission of policy lisbility on the part of Ine nsurance
companies.

A The report will e forwarded by he insuwrers of the GGIA Records Management Centre established by the Genaral Insurancs

Association of Singapons (GIA) or archiving and thal coples of this report will lor 8 fee be made zvailable upon appiication by
Intersstad partiss

7 By the lodgment of 1his report to thea nsurers, you hereby consent to tha archiving of this report sl tha centrs and 1o comes ol the
report belng made avallatie aforesald

8 Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)
| undersiand. acknowledge, agree and consen that

(a) My Insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Assodation of Singapore (“GIA™) may/are permitted o coiledt, usa,
disclosa and/or process my personal data/personal information set out in this [form] and any other personal information
Wmmwmmmmnwtmmwwmwmmmm

Personal Information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this acddent (all insurer(s) who have insured
vehicla(s) involvad in this accident shall ba collectively referad to as the “Insurers™), the insurers | fiems, he

Monstary Authority of Singapora and any ralevant govemment sgency/aatherity (such as the polica), for the purposels) of

() processing, handling andfor deafing with my claims induding the setflement of tha daims and NECOSSANY INVeshigations
relating to the claims; i o

(i) investigating the accident andior my claims,
(i) carrying out anifor dealing with my instructions of responding ‘o any erquiries by me,
(iv) administening my daims (including the mailing of comespondenca, statements, involcos, repoits of nolicas to ma, which

could invalve disciosura of certain personal data aboul me tn bring abott delivery of the same as well 48 on the extarnal cover
of snvelopes/mail packages), andior

{v) complying with applicable law in administering, procassing, handling and/cr dealing with my claims (collectively the

ib) Allinsurer{s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accdent and ha lasurars’ mm:.mwhu penniled o
coflect, use, disdose end/or process my Personal Information for anm ar mara of the above Purposes, and

{¢) my Personal Information may/can be disciosed by any of the nsuters andior GIA to their thisd party service providers o
agents(inchuding thelr lawyersAaw firms], which may be siled outside of Singapors, for one or more of the above Purposas

(d) my Perscnal information will also ba collected and used to compila claima history lor fhe purpose of frond detection,
Invastigation and mansgamant in present and all fultre claims.

(&) e information so collected under (d) above may ba shared [ dlsclosed

() 10 all insurers andior any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, contioling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcamant and government agencles as reasonably requined for ihe purmoses stated, or

(1) for complying with roguisemants under any regulations, \aws of ol crdain

Policyholder's Signature Driver's Sigiatus o Reporting Ceare Petsonnel's Signatrs
I.\::,A'l'int: OL\W (1f driver is not the policyholder) Name: DANIEL '30(5’
‘.’z,p '1 404 Date & Time: KRICFINNO : QX X 518D
4 -
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Preview

Estimate

Date

03 / 14 / 2020

Page 1 of 4

001 / 004

Address

E-Mail

Name QUOTATION FOR SLF4769R

Tel (Home)
Tel (Office)
Tel (Portable)
Fax
Mode! Name
Body Model
Vin-Code

S13
SJ5DKT7C
JF1SJ5KC56G075359

Part Number

Part Code Name

Part

Code Q' ty

Price

60009SG0529P

9042256010

6103556000

6128086030 |

6103286030

T IT T ——

19042286050 |

e
e
T T e
T I
I
T Tt

7 —

T —

T —

PANEL ASSEMBLY-FRONT DOOR, LEFT

WEATHER STRIP-DOOR,OUT LH |

* LATCH & ACTUATOR ASSEMBLY-FRON

T, LEFT

- TAPE-FRONT DOOR,LEFT |
TAPE-FRONT DOOR SASH LEFT

- TAPE-FRONT DOOR SASH, REAR LEF

I
WEATHER STRIP-FRONT DOOR, LEFT

RUN CHANNEL-FRONT DOOR,LEFT

WEATHER STRIP-BODY SIDE, FLANGE |

FRONT

PANEL ASSEMBLY-REAR DOOR,RIGHT

* WEATHER STRIP-DOOR, REAR OUTER |

RIGHT

T, T T —

" LATCH & ACTUATOR ASSEMBLY-REAR |

. RIGHT

TAPE-REAR DOOR SASH RIGHT |

GHT

R oSS R R T

T

F1G-605

F1G-605
F16-607
FIG-905
b
F16-905
Feresii
F16-901
s
FIG-605
F16-605
—
FIG-607
FI1G-905

T EOE

60010A 1

612860 | 1|
e
T e
T e

T e | R

63511A 1

T |
TN )

T B B

62280A 1

T |

ForE TN M I

90422¢ | 1

904226 1

e s

A 720,00
41 100.80
4,  252.00
g
A, 18.00
e, 18.00

Q7 144.00
svc 12.00
AT
S

y 100. 80

Jn 46.80

5

Page-Total

2,561.40

Grand Total
16, 182. 60

Memo

Tel

http://localhost:58089/subaru-epc/printpreview_page.html? ver=20191126140421758 3/14/2020



Preview

Estimate

Date

03 / 14 / 2020

Page 2 of 4

002 / 004

Name QUOTATION FOR SLF4769R

Address

E-Mail

Tel (Home)
Tel (Office)
Tel (Portable)
Fax
Mode! Name
Body Mode!|
Vin-Code

S13
SJ5DKTC

JF1SJ5KC5GG075359

Part Number

Part Code Name

Part Code Q' ty

Price

635125G001

635276020 |
6357286001 |
- 604098G0119P |
T
e =
T R o
T e o
T
s
T M

T

WEATHER STRIP-REAR DOOR, RIGHT

RUN CHANNEL-REAR DOOR, RIGHT -

WEATHER STRIP-BODY SIDE. FLANGE |

REAR

'PANEL ASSEMBLY-REAR DOOR, LEFT

LEFT

LATCH & ACTUATOR ASSEMBLY-REAR

 LEFT

e R TR

TAPE-REAR DOOR SASH, CENTER LE |

FT

TAPE-REAR DOOR SASH. REAR LEFT |
S e e
-

AT S T T E—

~ 514295G0109P

- 51449560109P
T T

T —

TN o T - —

EFT

~ SIDE SILL COMPLETE-OUTER LEFT |

N T T E ) f—

T LT R FT - fa—r

F1G-901 63512

FI6-905 90422J

FI1G-90

FIG-522 51415A

FIG-912 91039A

| F6-901 62234A | 1| oo
T T it S
FIG-605 60410A | 1]
WEATHER STRIP-DOOR, REAR OUTER | FIG-605 62280B | 1|
FIG-607 62176E | 1|

ST i | B

o o

63512A

AT R ] RS
e s oo

T W T B

STRTTE AT M

i

sve  144.00

sve  12.00

1
~
sve  100.80

syc 234.00

";ié:m”wiéfﬁd
;ﬂimmmﬁbfﬁﬁ

oo 144,00

svo | 12.00

T 66066

4, 39960

Page-Total

6, 308. 00

Memo

Grand Total

16, 182. 60

Tel

http://localhost:58089/subaru-epc/printpreview_page.html?_ver=20191126140421758

3/14/2020



Preview

Estimate

Date

03 / 14 / 2020

Page 3 of 4

003 / 004

Address

E-Mail

Name QUOTATION FOR SLF4769R

Tel (Portable)

Te| (Home)
Tel (Office)

Fax
Mode| Name S13

Body Model SJ5DKTC
Vin-Code

JF1SJ5KC5GG075359

Part Number

Part Code Name

Part Code

Q' ty

91059AJ210
© 84401AJ010

© 91054A0231

- 6104286210

- 6104186012 |

- 942128G310VI |
P T TET Rt
e 1
T Rt
e
s
T TR
T T
T T

T e

ST T—

COVER-CAP OUT MIRROR, LEFT

" LAMP ASSEMBLY-SIDE TURN MIRROR

. LEFT

~ COVER-CAP OUT MIRROR LEFT LOWE |

R

REGULATOR & MOTOR ASSEMBLY-FRO

NT LEFT

 REGULATOR & MOTOR ASSEMBLY-REA

R LEFT

TRIM PANEL-FRONT DOOR, LEFT

WEATHER STRIP-DOOR, FRONT INNER |

LEFT

T TR NN T3 E—

T T T Ty N —

TP ————

AIR BAG MODULE ASSEMBLY-SIDE,.L |

EFT

AIR BAG MODULE ASSEMBLY-GURTAI ||

N, LEFT

' SENSOR-SIDE AIR BAG,LEFT |
Ty N T I T

T T TR VTN T ——

FIG-912 91054E

'84401D

| FI6-912

T

| FI6-914 91111X

FIG-343 98235D

FI1G-343 98221

R T e e

ST T LTy

ST
T

e e

ST e —
e s e

FIG-343 98235A |

1

T T S B

1

T T B vy

Distorted

Distorted

Page-Total

Memo

Grand Total

16, 182. 60

Tel

http://localhost:58089/subaru-epc/printpreview_page.html? ver=20191126140421758

7
7X
7v
72X
7

| 72+

3/14/2020



Motorimage
.

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh
Singapore 319255

sSuBAR

ESTIMATE / QUOTATION COST OF ACCIDENT REPAIR

REG NO: SLF4769R MODEL : FORESTER 2.0I-L AWD CVT
REF: INS/IC/CHI/0075/2020 | YEAR:  29-AUG-2016
ENGINE NO: FB20Y358584 | CHASSIS NO: JF1SJ5KC5GG075359
DOA: 12/03/2020 TOA: 1620 HRS
TYPE OF CLAIM: ODR | INS COMPANY: AIG
S/N NATURE OF JOB AMOUNT
. | REPAIR/REPLACE RR RH DOOR,RR LH DOOR.,FRT LH $3000.00 Zoeef
DOOR,ROCKER PANEL, CENTER ‘B’ PILLAR FRT LH FENDER
2. | RESPRAY RR RH DOOR.RR LH DOOR.FRT LH DOOR,ROCKER $2400.00 |/ Zecfs
PANEL, CENTER ‘B’ PILLAR FRT LH FENDER sve
3. | TRANSFER DOOR MECHANISM ( RR RH,RR LH, FRT LH) § 42600 »
4. | REMOVE & REFIX CARPET, SEATS TO FACILITATE REPAIRS $ 34200 [—
5. | REMOVE & REFIX ROOF LINNING $ 190.00 |— j//
6. | REMOVE & REFIX WIRE HARNESS $ 22800 "
7. | REMOVE & REFIX DASHBOARD $ 34200 -| 7 ;
8. | REMOVE & REFIX SEATBELT, MODULE & RESET $ 380.00 7,
9. | REMOVE & REPLACE DRIVER & PASSANGER AIRBAG & RESET § 427.00 ¢,
10. | FAULT DIAGNOSTIC TO RESET SYSTEM, $ 23500 + 7
1. | TO CONDUCT PROTECTANT COATING X2 $ 500.00 a"q\/
12. | TO CONDUCT ANTI-RUST COATING X2 $ 580.00 |x
13. | SUNDRIES $ 100.00 | 2> NN
e
5, 332. 60 [ ,‘T@arc Jabour18:9150.00 |
*Tore e A
(S)830.90 $26,163.50 ’ oT Y painling
P J ey
| * Third parfy ~;,',~T e
DATE APPROVAL: | Noillegal modification's) is sjpume - ¢ 258
TIME APPROVAL: | SupPlementary item(s) must be resurveyed an
SURVEY BY: fennevh (L) | > fom Insurance Company ’
HP / EMAIL: Y0663 | | Fcknowledged by Repaire ,’
BEFORE PAINT: Ves | |
DAYS GIVEN: [ Jetar s - | J’
M7 A, STk S
/ f/)’/Zo
ﬁ)@ Vo, B 80
' 124! ()56 ¢3rs

Al 5047





