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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 30 September 2020 3:40 PM

To: Ooi Siow Hooi; SUR

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto); TPY Insurance Team

Subject: FW: SLF4769R - OD RECOVERY - AIG - FINALIZED (1st Reminder)

Attachments: SLF4769R - OD RECOVERY - AIG - FINALIZED; SLF4769R - OD RECOVERY - AIG - 

FINALIZED

Dear Siow Hooi, 
 
Confirmed amount $12,799.25 before excess $800 and GST @ 12 days. 
 
Kindly forward us invoice and discharge voucher for us to close file.  
 
 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Ooi Siow Hooi <hooi@motorimage.net>  

Sent: Thursday, 27 August 2020 11:56 AM 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: TPY Insurance Team <tpyinsteam@tanchong.org> 

Subject: RE: SLF4769R - OD RECOVERY - AIG - FINALIZED (1st Reminder) 

 

Hi Claim Team, 

 

Attached for your reference and follow up. (1st Reminder) 

 

**Kindly reply to all for easier follow up** 

 

Thank You 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Siowhooi 

Admin Assistant 

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 

19 Toa Payoh Lorong 8, Singapore 319255 

Tel: +65-6703 8333 DID: +65-6703 8115 

Fax: +65-6253 5535 

Email: hooi@motorimage.net 

Website: www.tanchong.com : www.motorimage.net 
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From: Ooi Siow Hooi  

Sent: Tuesday, July 7, 2020 1:05 PM 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: TPY Insurance Team <tpyinsteam@tanchong.org> 

Subject: SLF4769R - OD RECOVERY - AIG - FINALIZED 

 

Hi Claim Team, 

 

Attached for your reference and follow up. 

**Kindly reply to all for easier follow up** 

 

Thank You 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Siowhooi 

Admin Assistant 

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 

19 Toa Payoh Lorong 8, Singapore 319255 

Tel: +65-6703 8333 DID: +65-6703 8115 

Fax: +65-6253 5535 

Email: hooi@motorimage.net 

Website: www.tanchong.com : www.motorimage.net 
 

 

 
 

 
Disclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or 
use any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the 
sender immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The 
sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions.  


