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FW: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: Express Settlement [PROPOSED LIABILITY] Claim No:
D20001463MFSH // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 3797P AND SJZ 2123K ON 12/03/2020

Chris Lim Gan Koon <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Mon 9/28/2020 11:24 AM
To:  Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Dear Asher,
 
Pls request for LOA from TP.
 
Thank you.
 
Chris Lim
Motor Claims Dept.
 
Personal Data Protec�on Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
h�p://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collec�on Statement.
Confiden�ality No�ce: This e-mail is confiden�al. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom
it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please
delete the message and all copies from your system and no�fy the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
From: Chris Lim Gan Koon 
Sent: Monday, 28 September 2020 11:24 am
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: FW: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: Express Se�lement [PROPOSED LIABILITY] Claim No: D20001463MFSH //
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 3797P AND SJZ 2123K ON 12/03/2020
 
Dear Asher,
 
Pls offer as per below :
 
COR - $5,296.50
LOU - $80 to $100 x 5 to 7 days
Total - $5,696.50 to $5,996.50
 
Regards
 
Chris Lim
Motor Claims Dept.
 
Personal Data Protec�on Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
h�p://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collec�on Statement.
Confiden�ality No�ce: This e-mail is confiden�al. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom
it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please
delete the message and all copies from your system and no�fy the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Monday, 14 September 2020 4:12 pm
To: Chris Lim Gan Koon <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: Express Se�lement [PROPOSED LIABILITY] Claim No: D20001463MFSH // ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SHA 3797P AND SJZ 2123K ON 12/03/2020
 

Your ref :D20001463MFSH

Our ref : CC4/FCI20004026/Aea3q2

https://ind01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.msfirstcapital.com.sg%2F&data=02%7C01%7Cilprocesscentre%40icicilombard.com%7C9dd0782600ac40cd24eb08d853130e55%7Cd36615d9b483417583da3e968b0fde20%7C0%7C0%7C637350688886358116&sdata=H%2BTVktdheyKevhpfjiNV%2BAZIIT78FTVqlsX2LCOk61A%3D&reserved=0
https://ind01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.msfirstcapital.com.sg%2F&data=02%7C01%7Cilprocesscentre%40icicilombard.com%7C9dd0782600ac40cd24eb08d853130e55%7Cd36615d9b483417583da3e968b0fde20%7C0%7C0%7C637350688886358116&sdata=H%2BTVktdheyKevhpfjiNV%2BAZIIT78FTVqlsX2LCOk61A%3D&reserved=0
mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com
mailto:ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg
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Dear Sirs,

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 3797P (OI) AND SJZ 2123K (TP) ON 12/03/2020

 

We refer to the above matter.

 

The accident occurred when our insured make a right turn into the main driveway and hit third party vehicle.

 

Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100%
liability.

 

We seek your approval to offer repairer "KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD "at$ 5,996.50 (all-in).

 

The summary is as follows: -

 

 Amount Claimed Amount Revised  

1. Cost of Repairs (w/GST) $   11,876.35 $  5,296.50  

2. Loss of Use (7days x $120) $        840.00 $      700.00 (7days x $100)

Total $   12716.35 $   5,996.50  

 

Surveyor recommended 5days for repair.

 

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

 

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.

 
 
Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
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email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 
 

From: Joanne Yong <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, April 1, 2020 9:18 AM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Express Se�lement [PROPOSED LIABILITY] Claim No: D20001463MFSH // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 3797P AND
SJZ 2123K ON 12/03/2020
 
Dear Asher,
 
Refer to your email below.
 
We agreed to the liability. Please proceed express se�lement.
 
Thank you
Regards,
 
Joanne Yong
Motor Claim Department
 

Change of email address
          joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg
 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Limited
A Member of  Insurance Group
36 Robinson Road
#16-01 City House
Singapore 068877
Tel: 6507  3846
Fax: 6507 3849
 
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Monday, March 30, 2020 3:35 PM
To: Joanne Yong <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: [PROPOSED LIABILITY] Claim No: D20001463MFSH // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 3797P AND SJZ 2123K ON
12/03/2020
 
Claim No: D20001463MFSH         
LKK Ref: CC4/FCI20004026/Aea3
 
Dear Sir/Madam,
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 3797P AND SJZ 2123K ON 12/03/2020
 
We refer to the above ma�er.
 
Enclosed the Preliminary Advise and Third Party maked es�mated for your easy reference.
 
Liability: 100%
 
Remark:B:NIL OID MAKE A RIGHT TURN INTO THE MAIN DRIVEWAY HIT TP
 
Kindly let us have your approval on liability.

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
mailto:Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg
mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com
mailto:joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg
mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com
mailto:Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg
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Thank You.
 
Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
 

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com

