Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: May 5, 2020 5:34 PM

To: kaimotor@gmail.com

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SGK 4972 C //LKK REF: CC6/AIG20004018/Aha3
Attachments: SLL 6663S.JPG

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/ Madam,

We refer to the subject matter.

Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on the available information at hand, your
client reported that our insured were cutting lane and jammed break while our insured reported that he was rear-ended.

Kindly refer to our insured’s statement as attached for your reference.

As such, we have our principal’s instruction and that we are unable to look into your client’s claim unless there is
evidence to prove that our insured’s is cutting lane.

Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kai Motor [mailto:kaimotor@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 5 May, 2020 12:47 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: Re: SGK 4972 C //LKK REF: CC6/AIG20004018/Aha3

Hi all,

Awaiting for reply.

Have a nice day w thanks.
¥

Ms Kim

On Mon, 27 Apr 2020 at 14:06, Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com> wrote:
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Hi All,

Awaiting for reply.

Have a nice day w thanks. ¥

Ms Kim

On Mon, 20 Apr 2020 at 11:30, Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Sir,

Kindly Cc
to me
and AIG
OIC.

Amended

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Your Insured veh no : SLL 6663 S

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. (By Email Only)

78 Shenton Way

# 07-16 Chartis Building

Singapore 079120 Date : 13/04/2020

Dear Sir / Madam

Final Cost of repair Toyota Yaris No SGK 4972 C & SLL 6663 S on 05/03/2020@14:20:00
To Supply:-



Total Lumpsum As Of Repair Costs Recommended By Surveyor And

Agreed By Ourselves : $4,100.00

GST 7% $ 287.00

$4,387.00

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Your Insured veh no : SFS 9936 U
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. (By Email Only)
78 Shenton Way
# 07-16 Chartis Building
Singapore 079120 Date : 13/04/2020

Dear Sir / Madam

Final Cost of repair Toyota Yaris No SGK 4972 C & SLL 6663 S on 05/03/2020@14:20:00
To Supply:-

We have been authorised by M/s COOKING ART INDUSTRIES PTE LTD , the owner of vehicle claim

against the party / parties responsible for the damages arising from number SGK 4972 C, to the above
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mentioned accident. </t

Have a nice day with thanks.

PSR RIFHI— K.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006



