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.2nd revert to Victor via Mergyyesrbf(ﬁg%?rlgrrfntary)
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Add Fee: ‘Sitelnsp (5 . ]
D: Interview (% _____.! Fhiolos P

cTech. ws '-ri__ ) e [

| 5:‘"&’6%1 IR ! -

22/07/20@12.46pm Victor informed C/A at $17480.88 via Merimen. ¢ T

22/07/20@2.29pm confirmed with Mr Boo final fig $17480.88, 6 days. (Red $10142.12, 37%)




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 10 March 2020 6:26 PM

To: ‘Admin A" 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)'; 'SUR'

Cc: ‘Claims'

Subject: OD CLAIM FOR SMH 2956 H ON 8/3/2020
Attachments: SMH2956H GIA.PDF.pdf

Dear All,

Kindly register OD claim for this vehicle. Attached is the GIA report for your reference.
We will forward you the estimate once it is available.
Kindly arrange for survey on 13/3/2020, 3pm.

Best Regards,
Syafig

Claims Admin Assistant

Premium Automobiles Ple Lid (Reg No 199902271'W)

53 Ubi Road | Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumanto.com.sg  w._www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alr.xdu(lm Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223
| ——————— | | |

WELCOME TO THE==i =
_STH DIMENSION.

; .Jﬂ-lE ALL-NEW Aum qQa:

' F | . (&'D f ,

Email Disclaimer




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 16 March 2020 5:52 PM

To: Claims; SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SMH 2956 H ON 8/3/2020
Dear Terrence,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SMH 2956H (Excess $1,600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection,

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained befare repair.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 16 March 2020 10:43 AM

To: claims@premiumauto.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com=:
SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims' =claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SMH 25956 H ON 8/3/2020

Dear all,

Kindly advise on OD approval.
Thank you,

Best Regards,
Terrence Tan
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w._ www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 68362223




3M6/2020

Merimen a-Claims

Claim Audit

=l AUDIT TRAIL
an Audit Hemarks
09 Mar  Clm Veh
1 2020 Model
15:23 Changed

09 Mar Reg No: SMH2956H, Policy No: 1900010052, Acct Date: 2020/03/08. Claim Type: SC. Insurer; Al
2 2020 Cim Created G Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (SG). Ins.Status == Notification. Created from SAS:MOR120030

By

[1 Merimen
Administrator

[1] Merimen
Administrator

15:23 065
12 Mar  Clm [1] Lim, Sh

3 2020  Registration Acct Time:14:45:00->14:00:00. ,rr“ b
16:56 Madified ang
13 Mar Clm (1

4 2020 Registration [nit.Est.:->5,000 - 6,000. Subramaniam,
11:11  Modified Divyashni
13 Mar Clm {] Nivitha

5 2020 Registration Setl.Typa;3->0, Claim Type:SC->0D,
17:04 Modified

Govindasamy

5 %éz"é';:r ;:{rﬂ:lid Adj: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Gu[-li?;:i:::w

7 A o s e Lo

8 ;gzh;ar ::{ — Mext Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date;2020/03/24 s{ﬂnh:;;:.h;y
17:04  Changed

9 %%:‘;':r 24 Mandate ,  roved:8000,00,Reinsp:Ad] decides, G[Dﬂnfél:;gh:w

10 igzr-;ar Et:istratinn Rep:1137->200611. [A] Nivitha

17:04 Modified

13 Mar Clm Veh
11 2020 Model

17:05  Changed

(202153} AUDT A4 2.0 TFSI QU S-TRONIC [A).

12 %E?:é:r ﬂi;:i.“:“r [None] -> ADRIAN LING Gﬁ::':::nﬂv

13 %E:z?::r o [A] SHIAU CHAN
14 %13:2?: ﬁt:ll':':d Claim Conclusion: -= 3. [A] SHIAL CHAMN
15 %é%:r by JP) Reg. Date: -> 2018/01/18, [A] SHIAU CHAN
16 %g?:;:r ﬁ:':"?:;“"‘ [A] SHIAL CHAN

13 Mar  Adj Im.
17 2020 Advice
17:23 Submitted

MNext Rpt:Final Rpt,Due Date:2020/03/24

13 Har Adj Mandate CurReq:9516.00:DAMAGES CONSISTENT, REPAIR COST ECONOMICAL. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISE

18 2020 [A] SHIAU CHAN

Request REPAIR,

17:23
16 Mar Clm [11 AIG

19 2020 Registration Acct Time:14:00:00->13:00:00, CneClaim
09:12  Modified Integration User
16 Mar Clm ;

20 2020 Registration Excess: -> 1600,00, 2F Remarks: -> Not Applicable, GST: == 7.00. [|1€;dﬂa;;a,
10:48 Maodified
16 Mar ;

21 2020  Label Added (20226):Coverage Confirmed, bA) Marimen

[A] SHIAU CHAN

Govindasamy

[A] Mivitha
Govindasamy

Administrator

10:48

5 égzh;ar ::2 Next Mext Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2020/03/24, Mandate Remarks: Autharise repair, Re-inspection to be  [1] Koh, Victor-
14:45 Changed done for damage check and supplementary items / labour with clear photos. CK

{23 égzr;ar Adj Mandate Approved:9135.00: Authorise repair, Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementar  [1] Koh, Victar-
14-45 Set y items / labour with clear photos, Reinsp:Yes. CK

Date From 4| 7% »| pateTo 4|75 ®| Audit Type Nene v Go
ACTIVITY
Mo record

Merimen Billing for this case - Transactign_ﬁl_s_bqq

Bl Cxaks

hitps:/isingapore. merimen.com/claimsfindex.cfmusebax=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhislory&caseid=9232435extid=334026 ACFID=68T ...

12



3/13/2020 Adjuster Immediate Advice

Note: This document has not been finalised,

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (Co.Reg,No: 199607 198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax; 6B44-8805 Email; suri@@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

Te: AlIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AlG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933
Altn:  Gan, Hunchung Date: 13 Mar 2020
Preliminary Advice
Vehicle Na : SMH2856H Accidant Date : 08/03/2020
Make s AUDI Ag Palicy Mo. : 1900010052
Assignment Date 1 13/03/2020 Excess : §50.00
Date of Inspection  : 13/03/2020 Est. Duration of Repair :4.00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOEILES PTE LTD (UBI)
55 UBI ROAD 1
SINGAPORE 408893

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) bt 23,915.00
Revised Amount 55 9,135.00
Check ltems (Estimated) 35 481.00
Total 5% 9.616.00
Lump Sum Repair 55

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value pet
Pre-Accident Value ot 125,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate 3% 57.928.00
Salvage Value 5§
Margin for Repair 55 67.072.00

Remarks

{ ® ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly
let us have your authorisation,

[ }  The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

{ ) Other comments :

hitps-isingapore. merimen.comiclaims/index.cfm ?usebox=5VCdockfuseaction =dsp_viewersmart&docid=51908768&preview=1&nolayout=1&CFl... 1/





