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DISCHARGE RECEIPT 

 

CLAIM REFERENCE  : D20001281MFSH 

ACCIDENT DATE : 02/03/2020 

ACCIDENT LOCATION  : JUNCTION OF CROSS STREET AND CECIL STREET 

INSURED  : CITYCAB PTE LTD 

INSURED DRIVER : NG KAH LEONG 

INSURED VEHICLE : SLU 5114U 

INVOLVED PARTY : SHC 7990K 

SETTLEMENT SUM : $ 2,330.20 

 

I/We, the undernoted CLAIMANT being the person/entity entitled to receive the compensation in relation to the 

accident, hereby agree to accept the SETTLEMENT SUM as full and final settlement of all claims for damages, costs & 

disbursements arising out of the ACCIDENT, and I/WE also agree that the said settlement sum: 

 

                 1. is paid without admission of liability on the part of MS First Capital Insurance Limited and/or its 

                 INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER in respect of the said loss and for damage whether                               

                 now or hereafter to become manifest, 

 

                 2. is accepted by me/us to the intent that the said MS First Capital Insurance Limited and /or its  

                 INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER be absolutely and finally discharged from all claims                

                 whatsoever which I/WE now or hereafter may have arising out of or connected with or  

                 traceable to the said accident. 

 

I/WE acknowledge that this DISCHARGE RECEIPT is not to be construed as an admission of liability on the part of MS 

First Capital Insurance Limited and/or its INSURED and /or its INSURED DRIVER and it shall not be used as evidence 

in any claims or actions which may be made against them or any of them. 

 

CLAIMANT : BLUECAR EAST ASIA LTE LTD  Signature and Date : 
        

 

WITNESS   :              Signature and Date : 

       

 

 

Indeco Engineers Pte Ltd
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RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK Your ref : D20001281MFSH //
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 7990K (OI) AND SLU 5114U (TP) ON 02/03/2020 Re: SLU5114U - TP
Claim Against SHC7990K (FC) DOA 02/03/2020

Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Thu 7/16/2020 1:01 PM
To:  Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Without Prejudice
 
Dear Asher,
 
We are agreeable to se�le at $2,330.20.
 
Thank you.
 
Eric Woo
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Email: EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg
|Company Regn. No. 195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protec�on Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
h�p://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collec�on Statement.
Confiden�ality No�ce: This e-mail is confiden�al. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the
message and all copies from your system and no�fy the sender immediately by return e-mail
 
 
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Saturday, 11 July 2020 2:42 am
To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK Your ref : D20001281MFSH // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC
7990K (OI) AND SLU 5114U (TP) ON 02/03/2020 Re: SLU5114U - TP Claim Against SHC7990K (FC) DOA 02/03/2020
 

Your ref : D20001281MFSH

Our ref : CC4/FCI20003963/Gea3q2

 

Dear Sirs,

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 7990K (OI) AND SLU 5114U (TP) ON 02/03/2020

 

We refer to the above matter.

 

The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle.

 

mailto:EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg/
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Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100%
liability.

 

We seek your approval to offer repairer " INDECO ENGINEERS PTE LTD " at $ 2,330.20 (all-in).

 

The summary is as follows: -

 

 Amount Claimed Amount Revised  

1. Cost of Repairs (w/GST) $   2,931.59 $ 2,230.20  

2. Loss of Use (1day x $100) $      100.00 $    100.00 (1day x $100)

Total $   3,031.59 $ 2.330.20  

 

Surveyor recommended 1day for repair.

 

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

 

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.

 
Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 
 

From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, May 22, 2020 10:07 AM
To: Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Lai Bee Yin <bylai@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>; Seah Wan Er
<weseah@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>; Tan Teck Leong Leon <tltan@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>; Tan Cheng Huat
<tanch@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>
Subject: RE: SLU5114U - TP Claim Against SHC7990K (FC) DOA 02/03/2020
 
Dear Eric,
 
Below email fyna.

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
mailto:RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg
mailto:EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg
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mailto:bylai@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com
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Thank you
 
Best Regards
 
Rachel Wu
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507
3862|  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
 
Personal Data Protec�on Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
h�p://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collec�on Statement.
Confiden�ality No�ce: This e-mail is confiden�al. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom
it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please
delete the message and all copies from your system and no�fy the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
From: Tan Cheng Huat <tanch@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com> 
Sent: Friday, 22 May 2020 10:03 am
To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: ashersng@lkkauto.com; Lai Bee Yin <bylai@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>; Seah Wan Er
<weseah@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>; Tan Teck Leong Leon <tltan@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>
Subject: SLU5114U - TP Claim Against SHC7990K (FC) DOA 02/03/2020
 

 
 
Warmest Regards
 
Tan Cheng Huat
Technical Officer
INDECO ENGINEERS PTE LTD 
(A member of the CWT Group)

DID +65 63822736 Fax +65 63822817 www.indeco.cwtlimited.com
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CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This communication is meant only for the addressee(s) named above and may contain information, which is confidential
and/or legally privileged. If you are not the named addressee(s), or the agent responsible for receiving and delivering this communication to the named
addressee(s), this communication has been sent to you in error. If so, kindly contact us immediately for retrieval purposes. Unauthorized dissemination,
distribution, copying or reliance on this communication is prohibited and may attract criminal penalties. Thank you.
 


