Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 19 March 2020 9:42 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SFR8777Z *Our Ref: CC4/FWD20003933/Ups3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SLA 8913R(FWD) AND SFR 8777Z ON 10/03/2020]

Attachments: WhatsApp Image 2020-03-19 at 9.31.48 AM jpeg

Hi Hsiao Tong,

This is the message from TP as attached.
Thank you.

Regards,
Jacyne

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd (aim)

Office: 28 Sin Ming Lane #07-147 Midview City Singapore 573972

W/S: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933
Tel: 91198371

On Thu, Mar 19, 2020 at 9:24 AM AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Hsiao Tong,

We do not have any evidence to show for this case.
Thank you.
Regards,

Jacyne

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd (aim)

Office: 28 Sin Ming Lane #07-147 Midview City Singapore 573972

W/S: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933
Tel: 91198371

On Thu, Mar 19, 2020 at 7:31 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Your Ref: SFR87772 Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/FWD20003933/Ups3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,



ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLA 8913R(FWD) AND SFR 8777Z ON 10/03/2020

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy
reference.

As per FWD instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our
necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



