Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 23 July 2020 5:57 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Accident on 7/3/2020 involving SHB 5192R & SGU 2339S (EQ's insured) Our Ref:

TAX/03/20/2021/1g *** LKK REF: CC3/EQI20003917/Qga3

Dear Cecilia,
We agreed to accept your global offer of $2,000.00. Please let us have your DV. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

@smnr

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 23 July, 2020 4:21 PM

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis)

Subject: RE: Accident on 7/3/2020 involving SHB 5192R & SGU 2339S (EQ's insured) Our Ref: TAX/03/20/2021/Ig ***
LKK REF: CC3/EQI20003917/Qga3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Lee Gek,

We are pleased to offer G/S $2000.00 (all-in).
Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thanks

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlement sum.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted.



