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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Joanne Yong <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 April 2020 11:32 AM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE ON QUANTUM [Express Settlement via LKK] - 

D20001406MFSH/1 // Our ref: CC4/FCI20003878/Kda3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
SH7347L AND SCH6988H ON 08/03/2020]

Dear JiaLe, 
 
Refer to your email below. 
 
Agreed to your propose offer. Please proceed for Express Settlement. 
 
Thank you 
Regards, 
 
Joanne Yong 
Motor Claim Department 
 

Change of email address 
          joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg 
 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Limited 
A Member of  Insurance Group 
36 Robinson Road 
#16-01 City House 
Singapore 068877 
Tel: 6507  3846  
Fax: 6507 3849 
 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, April 6, 2020 10:53 AM 
To: Joanne Yong <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE ON QUANTUM [Express Settlement via LKK] - D20001406MFSH/1 // Our ref: 
CC4/FCI20003878/Kda3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH7347L AND SCH6988H ON 08/03/2020] 
 
Claim No: D20001406MFSH/1 
LKK Ref: CC4/FCI20003878/Kda3 
 
Dear Sirs/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 7347L AND SCH 6988H ON 08/03/2020 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer “POON SIANG SEOW” at $3,521.05(all-in). 
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The summary is as follows:- 
 

 Claimed 
Amount 

Revised Amount 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 12,188.00 $ 3,000.00 
2. Loss of Rental (4days x $130)(w/GST) $       556.40 $     513.60 (4days x $120)(w/GST) 
3. LTA Search Fee $            7.45 $          7.45 
                                                  Total $ 12,751.85 $ 3,521.05 

 
Surveyor recommended 04 days for repair  
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Joanne Yong [mailto:Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg]  
Sent: Thursday, 19 March 2020 5:18 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) 
Cc: Admin A; Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20001406MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT 
 
 
Dear All, 
 
We have received the LOD from the workshop. 
 
For your action with the workshop.  
 
Thank you 
 
Regards, 
 
Joanne Yong 
Motor Claim Department 
 

Change of email address 
          joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg 
 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Limited 
A Member of  Insurance Group 
36 Robinson Road 
#16-01 City House 
Singapore 068877 
Tel: 6507  3846  
Fax: 6507 3849 
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From: Joanne Yong  
Sent: Tuesday, March 17, 2020 1:06 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20001406MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
Refer to your email below. 
 
Please proceed express settlement. 
 
Thank you 
 
Regards, 
 
Joanne Yong 
Motor Claim Department 
 

Change of email address 
          joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg 
 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Limited 
A Member of  Insurance Group 
36 Robinson Road 
#16-01 City House 
Singapore 068877 
Tel: 6507  3846  
Fax: 6507 3849 
 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, March 12, 2020 3:37 PM 
To: Joanne Yong <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20001406MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT 
 
YOUR REF: D20001406MFSH 
LKK REF: CC4/FCI20003878/Kda3 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We had inspected TP vehicle SCH 6988H on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement. 
                                                                                                                        
Enclosed for your perusal is:  

·         TP estimated cost of repair 
·         Preliminary advice 

                                                                        
Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Jia Le and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 5792. 
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To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 11 March, 2020 12:27 PM 
To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'Joanne Yong' <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20001406MFSH/1 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
 

Best Regards  

G.NIVITHA 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
 
 
 
 

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]  
Sent: Wednesday, 11 March 2020 10:27 AM 
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM 
Cc: CWS Motor Claims; Joanne Yong 
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20001406MFSH/1 
 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 
We refer to the above reference. 
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey. 
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days. 
 
Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal. 
 
Best Regards, 
Admin Team 
Claim Workflow System 
Motor Claims Department 
MS First Capital Insurance Limited 
Tel : 6507 3848 
Fax : 6507 3849 
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PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail. 
 

 
 

 

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software. 
www.avg.com  

 


