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ASSIGNMENT
m: Date: ‘O, 3 ,2’036 Veh No: SDE IS‘SOI-/ Yr Regn: //3 //&
Estimated Cost: Type: I M.Cycle [ Bus [ Van | Lorry | Taxi/ Primé Marverf
0D /YP /WS TP RES [ OD RES [ EVA | INV [ MV Truck / Trailer or
To Inspect Vehicle No: PR 1330 H Make: Ay d[ A[{’ e {73‘(
at Workshop m/s pmm iam Colour [ﬂtg AIC:  Insured/ Std/ NI/ NA
of o4 Rgnm &QJ—OV- Sp.Reading 4770! T/Radio: Insured | Std / NI/ NA
Insured: Eng/No: ’
Palicy No. C/No: WA”ZZZF?&TA @74(92
Claims No. ﬁu)o() \1.. Gen. Cond: ¢ o | Fair { Poor [ Burnt
Sum Insured: Excess: T84 Steering: Inqy 185 r | Jammed [ Leaked / Burnt or
(Client's Record) Brake: Ingrdgr[Jammed | Leaked / Burnt or
Makke of Veh: 2pm Modi: Nil / @ | STD AIRim or
l ‘ < / Tyre Size: F: Qﬁ/mp/q
(Policy Condition) BN R: .
Remark: The veh had commenced its - N/S | OIS | [BS/DUN/EXNOVA/GYFS/LIZA/MIC/OHTSU/PIR/SUMI/
repair at the time of inspection. TOYO | @0 -
Bal. or Market Value: Front Rear
IDAC Accident Rport: Consistent? : Yes or No R/Bal. mm R/Bal. 6 mm
GIA / PR Seen: ' Consistent? : Yes or No L/Bal. mm L/Bal. 6 mm
Est. Repairs: days Res: Yes or No D.OA. D.O.L / 9 23 2}0
Lum Sum: % 3Val.: Yes or No Survey held at Flmrvﬂ HPM
CA | REP. | 24HRS Des. of Damages@i Rear | OIS | NIS | UIC | Rooftop or
Vehicle: IN/OUT ;
Date: _ Person Contacted: The UIC | Chassis frame / Body Structure affected due to collision,

Date / Time Action / Instruction
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Date/Time, File Pass to? D Preli. Report Days Of Repair: jf .

2(: \V’) TV[()]S‘{" E I Final Report Resurvey Mo. of Trip: Survey Fee:
Data/Time, File Ret ;n 0? Transporiation:
2 Add Fee: “Site Insp (8 ) _8+Rs_ sl
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View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SDB1330H (55266946295G)
oD
Mar 7 2020 3:45PM
[GOH CHIN SENG EUGENE]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Reply , Reply Allj Mark as Unread i Print Message ; Delete Message_i Forward |

A —— st . . — S

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (AIG_SG), senton 11/03/2020 15:37 PM,

To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$20972.50) - SDB1330H - Claim Handler: Nadaraja, Deeban

Approved:20972.50:Authorise repair. Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour with clear photos.

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.



Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 11 March 2020 5:01 PM

To: Claims Dept; Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SDB 1330 H

Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SDB 1330H (Excess $100/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 March 2020 11:10 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
<admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SDB 1330 H

Dear Denise,
Attached document for your kind reference.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tony Foong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699

p. +65 6366 2323, d. +65 67689911
e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

Singapore NRIC
186G

SDB1330H

No

10 Mar 2020

AUDI

A4 SEDAN 2.0 TFSIS TRONIC
Grey

2017

CVK053242
WAUZZZF43JA094802
140.0 KW (187 bhp)
$33,206.00

01 Mar 2018

01 Mar 2018

0

$38,489.00

Yes
29 Feb 2028
$28,866.00

29 Feb 2028
B - Car above 1600cc or 27kW (130bhp)

COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $39,000.00
COE Rebate Amount: $31,087.00
Total Rebate Amount: $59,953.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Mar 2020

OK

7



Note: This document has not been finalised.

. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno:199607198r)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933

Attn: Mithoo Singh, Aashweenjeet Kaur Date: 11 Mar 2020

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SDB1330H Accident Date : 07/03/2020
Make : AUDI A4 Policy No. : 1800019376-01
Assignment Date 1 11/03/2020 Excess : §%0.00
Date of Inspection 1 10/03/2020 Est. Duration of Repair :6.00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages

The vehicle sustained impact / damages ....... portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.
Repairer's Estimate (Gross) :S§ 36,697.00
Revised Amount :S$ 20,972.50
Check Items (Estimated) :S$ 8,386.00
Total 5% 29,358.50
Lump Sum Repair 5%

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value :S$
Pre-Accident Value :S$ 119,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate :S$ 59,953.00
Salvage Value :S$
Margin for Repair :S$ 59,047.00

Remarks

{ x ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly let us have
your authorisation. )

( ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

{ ) Other comments :



3/10/2020 Used Audi A4 Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart
sGCARMART.COM Login  Sign up

New Cars : Rental Cars Sell My Car Directory Praducts Insurance Articles Forum
Sell by Consignment

Consign your car to sell direct at the price you want without hassle.
No sale = no charges!

Post an Advertisement
Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just
$58 until it's SOLD!

it Grondi With over 200 units of vehicles

Reso

PRIME MOTOR & LEASING

[CHENG YONG CREDIT ENTERPRISES PTELTO GROUP OF COMPANIES]

Post an Ad Advertiser Login Ways of Selling ;‘:fé;::o?e‘;:n’j;;gi‘;%;r&?k;s' Lt " ”"‘:——
Browse by Category 7 “Sort by Date Posted ¥ |20 resuits/page
5 vehicles Audi A4_ . 7 ) 777 “ _ ] 7 ) o ! )
Model Price Depreciation Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type
Search Selection Audi A4 Any Any 2018 Any Any Any Availabl
Audi A4 2.0A TFSI S-tronic $128,000 $13,720 fyr 12-Feb-2018 1,984 cc 5,000 km Luxury Availabl

Loan Interest At 2.28%, Extremely Well Maintained And Fully Agent Maintained. This Beast Does Not Just Look Beautiful, It's 100%
Accident Free. View To Believe! Trade In Welcome Call/SMS To Arrange A Viewing Today! Viewing Strictly By Appointment Only!

Posted: D1-Mar-2020  Tags: 2018 Audi A4, Audi A4, Audi, A4

Audi A4 2.0A TFSI S-tronic $119,800 $12,580 fyr 07-Mar-2018 / 1,984 cc 11,000 km Luxury

1 Owner, New Car Condition, Super Low Mileage 11,000km, Full Loan Available, Excellent Condition. No Repairs Needed, Low
Maintenance Cost, Well Maintained. Spacious Interior And Comfortable Drive, 100% Accident Free! High Trade-In, Hurry Call Now!

Motor Universe Credit Pte Ltd
posted: (6-Mar-2020  Tags: 2018 Audi A4, Audi A4, Audi, A4

Audi A4 2.0A TFSI S-tronic $118,800 $12,160 [fyr 11-May-2018 1,984 cc 27,750 km Luxury

Only Sporty Grey On The Market In 2018! 1 Owner Only! Agent Warranty With Audi Singapore Till May 2023! A Peace Of Mind!
Call/SMS/WhatsApp For Viewing Today!

Republic Auto
Posted: 07-Feb-2020  Tags: 2018 Audi A4, Audi A4, Audi, A4

Audi A4 2.0A TFSI S-tronic $115,800 $11,760 /yr 25-May-2018 1,984 cc 44,000 km Luxury

Promotion Perks For Full Loan Start From 2.98%~3.28%,bank Loan 2.28%!Tip Top Condition! 5 Years Agent Warranty Until 2023,
Powerful, Sporty Yet Luxury! Almost Brand New Condition. 100% Low Genuine Mileage. Well Maintained.All Trade-In Welcome. Please C...

Hua Yang Credit Pte Ltd
Posted: 28-Feb-2020  Tags: 2018 Audi A4, Audi A4, Audi, A4

Soon Xing Engineering Pte Ltd - Specialist for Audi Car repair, servicing & maintenance
Soon Xing Engineering Pte Ltd is a one- stop service centre for gearbox and control module repair & overhaul.

More info about this shop

Audi A4 2.0A TFSI S-tronic $123,800 $12,270 [yr 10-Sep-2018 1,984 cc 24,488 km Luxury

1 Owner Unit, 5 Years Agent Warranty With Audi. Sporty Sedan And Spacious Interior. Genuine Low Mileage At Only 25K Km.
Call/SMS/WhatsApp For Viewing Today!

Republic Auto
Posted: 08-Mar-2020 Tags: 2018 Audi A4, Audi A4, Audi, A4

Save this search criteria, to get email alerts whenever a match is found.

https:h’www.sgcarmart.comlused_cars.’listing.php?ORD=RGD_ASC&MOD=AudT A48&RPG=20&VEH=0&RGD=2018&AVL=2

Availabl

Availabl

Availabl

Availab!
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