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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Darren <claims@teamworkgarage.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 May 2020 2:31 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Cc: Desmond

Subject: RE: F4281Y FINALISE

Hi Denise, 

 

We confirm the COR @ $3000 and DOR @ 5 days 

 

Darren 

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 

53 Ubi Avenue 1 

#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 

Singapore 408934 

Tel: 68442475 

Fax: 68442474 

 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Thursday, 21 May 2020 4:28 PM 

To: Darren 

Subject: RE: F4281Y FINALISE 

 

Dear Darren, 

 

Do let us know on your final amount confirmation 

 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will 

be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6271-0351 | email:  sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Darren <claims@teamworkgarage.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 21 May 2020 3:14 PM 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: F4281Y FINALISE 

 

Hi Taufikh, 

 

Kindly see attached 

 

Darren 

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 

53 Ubi Avenue 1 

#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
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Singapore 408934 

Tel: 68442475 

Fax: 68442474 

 

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) 

Sent: Thursday, 21 May 2020 2:56 PM 

To: 'Darren' 

Subject: RE: F4281Y FINALISE 

 

Hi Darren, 

 

Please forward after repair photos, thank you. 

 

Regards 

Taufikh 

 

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 21 May 2020 2:43 PM 

To: 'Darren' 
Cc: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)' 

Subject: F4281Y FINALISE 

 

Hi Darren, 

 

Refer attached, COR l/s $3000 , 5 days. 

 

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 
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