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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

— ]
From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 11 March 2020 5:03 PM
To: claims@premiumauto.com.sg; SUR; assignments
Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SKW 9402 M

Dear Kee Siang,
As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SKW 9402M (Excess S 600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: b256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shiau Chan [LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Wednesday, 11 March 2020 10:49 AM

To: claims@premiumauto.com.sg; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SKW 9402 M

Dear Kee Siang,
Not yet.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: claims@premiumauto.com.sg <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 March 2020 9:23 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SKW 9402 M

Dear Shiau Chan,

Approval please 7
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[] Merimen
Administrator

Reg Mo: SKWa402M, Acct Date: 2020/02/16, Claim Type: SC, Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance
Pte. Ltd, {SG). Ins.5tatus => Notification, Created from SAS:MPA1200279581

[1] Merimen
Administrator

i
Subramaniam,
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Subramariam,
Diwvyashni
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Acct Time:11:45:00->11:00:00.

Init.Est.:->5,000 - 6,000.

Setl. Type:3->0. Claim Type:5C-=0D,

Adj: LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) []TI;LE]EééU
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anorzoz2o | Adjuster iImmediate Advice

MNote: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregne1esso71ser)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Email: sur@lkkauto,com;assignments@lkkauto,com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

AlG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933
Attn:  Gan, Hunchung Date: 10 Mar 2020
Vehicle No : SKW9402M Accident Date :16/02/2020
Make : AUDI A3 Policy No, : 2100440657
Assignment Date 2100312020 Excess ; 550.00
Date of Inspection  : 09/03/2020 Est. Duration of Repair +3.00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAFORE 408699

Point of Impact | General Description of Damages

The vehicle sustained impact / damages rear o/s portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 55
Revised Amount 2%
Check Items (Estimated) 5§
Total ;S5
Lump Sum Repair 8%

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value it
Pre-Accident Value 5%
COE / PARF Rebate 8%
Salvage Value 5%
Margin for Repair 5%

Remarks

{ X} The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly

let us have your authorisation.

6,123.00
3,821.00
1,213.00
5,034.00

75,000.00
47 ,435.00

27,565.00

! ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck,

{ ) Other comments :

https://singapore. mermen.com/claimsfindex.cfm?fusebox=5VCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_viewersmart&docid=51828409&praview=1&nolayout=1&CFI...
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