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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 26 March 2020 9:23 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Wenzheng LIEW from.TP (CNB); Chris TAN (CNB)

Subject: RE: Vehicle Repair Assessment for SLL9124L

Message Classification: Restricted 

Hi Asher 

 

As clarified over the phone, the total charges would be $200 ($20 for documentation (item 1) & $180 for pre-repair 

assessment (item 5)). 

 

We will raise the PO once the system is up in early Apr. 

 

Thanks.  

 

cc. Wenzheng, to follow up with PO in early Apr.  

cc. Chris, need to upload the contract into iLMS in Apr.  

 

Shirlene Yeo  (Ms) 

Manager, Logistics Unit 

Corporate Services Division 

Central Narcotics Bureau 
DID:  (65) 6325 6626  

 

Central Narcotics Bureau   W cnb.gov.sg    FB fb.com/CNB.DrugFreeSG    IG Instagram.com/cnb.drugfreesg 
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 

copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is an 

offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 26 March 2020 9:09 AM 

To: Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg> 

Subject: RE: Vehicle Repair Assessment for SLL9124L 

 

Hi Shirlene, 

 

We refer to the email below. 
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Kindly return call as we need to enquiry on the charges. 

 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler   

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

 

From: Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 26 March 2020 2:37 AM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Wenzheng LIEW from.TP (CNB) <Wenzheng_LIEW_from.TP@cnb.gov.sg>; Chris TAN (CNB) 

<Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg>; Ritar DIAYALAH (CNB) <Ritar_Diayalah@cnb.gov.sg>; Muhammad Farhan SANUSI (CNB) 

<Muhammad_Farhan_SANUSI@cnb.gov.sg> 

Subject: RE: Vehicle Repair Assessment for SLL9124L 

 

Message Classification: Restricted 

Hi Asher 

 

Pls confirm that the charges for this pre-repair assessment is $180 as we need to raise a PO for the payment. 

 

Thanks.  

 

Shirlene Yeo  (Ms) 

Manager, Logistics Unit 

Corporate Services Division 

Central Narcotics Bureau 
DID:  (65) 6325 6626  

 

Central Narcotics Bureau   W cnb.gov.sg    FB fb.com/CNB.DrugFreeSG    IG Instagram.com/cnb.drugfreesg 
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 

copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is an 

offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 

 

From: Shirlene YEO (CNB)  

Sent: Friday, 13 March 2020 10:45 AM 

To: 'Asher Sng (LKKAuto)' <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Wenzheng LIEW from.TP (CNB) <Wenzheng_LIEW_from.TP@cnb.gov.sg>; Chris TAN (CNB) 

<Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg>; Ritar DIAYALAH (CNB) <Ritar_Diayalah@cnb.gov.sg>; Muhammad Farhan SANUSI (CNB) 
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<Muhammad_Farhan_SANUSI@cnb.gov.sg> 

Subject: RE: Vehicle Repair Assessment for SLL9124L 

 

Message Classification: Restricted 

Hi Asher 

 

Ok, please proceed. Thanks.  

 

 

 

Shirlene Yeo  (Ms) 

Manager, Logistics Unit 

Corporate Services Division 

Central Narcotics Bureau 
DID:  (65) 6325 6626  

 

Central Narcotics Bureau   W cnb.gov.sg    FB fb.com/CNB.DrugFreeSG    IG Instagram.com/cnb.drugfreesg 
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 

copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is an 

offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 13 March 2020 9:48 AM 

To: Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg> 

Cc: Wenzheng LIEW from.TP (CNB) <Wenzheng_LIEW_from.TP@cnb.gov.sg>; Chris TAN (CNB) 

<Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg>; Ritar DIAYALAH (CNB) <Ritar_Diayalah@cnb.gov.sg>; Muhammad Farhan SANUSI (CNB) 

<Muhammad_Farhan_SANUSI@cnb.gov.sg> 

Subject: RE: Vehicle Repair Assessment for SLL9124L 

 

Hi Shirlene, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

Enclosed a copy of the assessment for your easy reference. 

 

Kindy advise if we can process with our final report and billing. 

 

Thank You. 
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Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler   

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Ritar DIAYALAH (CNB) <Ritar_Diayalah@cnb.gov.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 6 March 2020 11:43 AM 

To: Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Wenzheng LIEW from.TP (CNB) <Wenzheng_LIEW_from.TP@cnb.gov.sg>; Chris TAN (CNB) 

<Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg>; Muhammad Farhan SANUSI (CNB) <Muhammad_Farhan_SANUSI@cnb.gov.sg> 

Subject: RE: Vehicle Repair Assessment for SLL9124L 

 

Message Classification: Unclassified 

Dear All, 

 

Pls also include Farhan in the emails relating to vehicle matters as he is also the vehicle IC in Lima division. Thank you.  

 

 

Regards, 

 

Ritar Diayalah 

Enforcement Lima Division 

CENTRAL NARCOTICS BUREAU 

Hp: 81447167 

Fax : 63650185 

 

 
Central Narcotics Bureau   W cnb.gov.sg    FB fb.com/CNB.DrugFreeSG    IG Instagram.com/cnb.drugfreesg 
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 

copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is an 

offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 

 

From: Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 5 March 2020 6:17 PM 

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Wenzheng LIEW from.TP (CNB) <Wenzheng_LIEW_from.TP@cnb.gov.sg>; Chris TAN (CNB) 

<Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg>; Ritar DIAYALAH (CNB) <Ritar_Diayalah@cnb.gov.sg> 

Subject: Vehicle Repair Assessment for SLL9124L 

 

Message Classification: Restricted 

Hi Cecilia 
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Our vehicle – SLL9124L was damaged during duty. Our workshop, SMRT, had quoted us the repair cost as attached (pls 

refer to attached SOW). We would need LKK to assess if the replacement part/repair cost is reasonable. No claim 

against 3rd party is involved. Please let us know when you can view the vehicle to assess the repairs.  

 

Our point of contact is Ritar – 81447167. Thanks. 

 

cc. Ritar, I have checked, SMRT needs not be ard. Thanks.  

 

 

 

Shirlene Yeo  (Ms) 

Manager, Logistics Unit 

Corporate Services Division 

Central Narcotics Bureau 
DID:  (65) 6325 6626  

 

Central Narcotics Bureau   W cnb.gov.sg    FB fb.com/CNB.DrugFreeSG    IG Instagram.com/cnb.drugfreesg 
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 

copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is an 

offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 

 


