Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: sharon@sngahtee.com

Sent: Friday, 8 January 2021 10:43 am
To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: YN9495B - FINALISE

Hi Shirley

We accept LS $22750 before excess $450 as per your adjusted audatex report.
Please offer in merimen.
Thanks.

Best Regards

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHT

MOTOR & PAMEL'SE

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, January 7, 2021 11:31 AM

To: sharon@sngahtee.com

Subject: RE: YN9495B - FINALISE

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: sharon@sngahtee.com <sharon@sngahtee.com>

Sent: Monday, 4 January 2021 7:06 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@I|kkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: YN9495B - FINALISE

Hi,



Can we confirm the amount? $23400 before excess $450.
Please confirm by this week.
Thanks.

Best Regards

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHT

MOTOR & PANELS




