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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Auto Pro <1stautopro@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 October 2020 3:33 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FW: Finalize SLQ9406Y

Hi Shiau Chan, 

 

We agree to close at $2350. 

 

Thanks and best regards, 

 

Christina Tan 

9188-3197 

51 Ubi Avenue 1 #05-02 Paya Ubi Industrial Park Singapore 408933 
To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 
 

 

On Wed, 8 Jul 2020 at 12:27, Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Christina, 

  

Have any update for this case ? 

  

Finalize amount $2,350. Repair day 3 days under lump sum repair (before gst). 

  

Please confirm the COR by return email ASAP. 

  

  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
  
LKK Auto Consultants 
  
Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)  

Sent: Tuesday, June 2, 2020 11:30 AM 

To: Auto Pro <1stautopro@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE: Finalize SLQ9406Y 

  

  

Hi Christina, 

  

Have any update for this case ? 

  

Finalize amount $2,350. Repair day 3 days under lump sum repair (before gst). 

  

Please confirm the COR by return email ASAP. 



2

  

  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
  
LKK Auto Consultants 
  
Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)  

Sent: Tuesday, May 19, 2020 3:49 PM 

To: Auto Pro <1stautopro@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE: Finalize SLQ9406Y 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Hi Christina, 

  

Kindly refer attachment for your information. 

  

  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
  
LKK Auto Consultants 
  
Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

From: Auto Pro [mailto:1stautopro@gmail.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, May 19, 2020 3:40 PM 

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Finalize SLQ9406Y 

  

Hi Sun Pin, 

  

Able to provide me with your marked estimate to tally ? 

  

Thanks and best regards, 

 

Christina Tan 

9188-3197 

51 Ubi Avenue 1 #05-02 Paya Ubi Industrial Park Singapore 408933 
To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
https://i.ibb.co/hDYT7sF/1ap-full-logo.jpg

 
  

  

On Tue, 19 May 2020 at 13:46, Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

  

Hi Sir, 

  

Kindly refer the finalize amount $2,350. Repair day 3 days under lump sum repair (before gst). 

  

If agree please update. 

  

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor 

  

LKK Auto Consultants 

  

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  


