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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 March, 2020 7:36 PM

To: 'KENNY LIM CHING GHEE'

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A; Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: New Assignment - PRS - Accident involving SLA8101S & EL776Y on 22 Feb 2020 

- Oref: 19/20/20/VP05/023089 [External Confidential]

Attachments: Preliminary Advice.pdf; TP ESTIMATE - MARKED.pdf

Categories: HMK

YOUR REF: 19/20/20/VP05/023089 

LKK REF: CC4/LPC20003658/Eka3 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We had inspected TP vehicle EL 776Y on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement. 

 

Enclosed for your perusal is:  

• TP estimated cost of repair 

• Preliminary advice 

 

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Khanchna and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360. 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 5 March, 2020 11:42 AM 

To: 'KENNY LIM CHING GHEE' <kennylim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: New Assignment - PRS - Accident involving SLA8101S & EL776Y on 22 Feb 2020 - Oref: 

19/20/20/VP05/023089 [External Confidential] 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 

Thank you for the assignment. 
 

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 
 

 

Best Regards  

G.NIVITHA 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
 

 

 

 

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE [mailto:kennylim@lonpac.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 4:45 PM 

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; 'Summer Lee (LKK Auto)' 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG 

Subject: New Assignment - PRS - Accident involving SLA8101S & EL776Y on 22 Feb 2020 - Oref: 

19/20/20/VP05/023089 [External Confidential] 

 

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 

Dear Summer  
 

Please arrange for a PRS for the T/P vehicle EL776Y at Performance Motors. Person to 
contact: 

Ms Caroline 

C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 

303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941 

DID: 6319 0174 

We attach herewith the relevant documents/video for your perusal. Kindly assess 

liability and propose Direct Settlement if necessary.  

Thank you.  

Best Regards 

 

Kenny Lim  

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 

DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 

 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 

 

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE  

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 11:05 am 

To: 'PBSP' <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject: RE: EL776Y - Scene Video [External Confidential] 

 

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 

Dear Caroline  
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We intend to arrange for a PRS of your client’s vehicle and confirm liability shortly.  
 

Please let us hear from you soon.  
 

Best Regards 

 

Kenny Lim  
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 

DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 

 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 

 

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 10:14 am 

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject: Fw: EL776Y - Scene Video 

 

Dear Sirs, 

 

Kindly see email below. 

 

Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Caroline 
C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941 
DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601 

From: Inthiran Thurasamy <inthiran.thurasamy@simedarby.com.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 10:09 AM 

To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg> 

Subject: EL776Y - Scene Video  

  

Dear Caroline, 

  

Please see attached scene video for EL776Y. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best regards 

  

Inthiran Thurasamy 

Motor Claim Advisor  

Body and Paint 
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BMW 

Performance Motors Ltd 

Performance Munich Autos  

  

TEL: +65 1800 2255 269 

DDI: +65 6319 0110 

FAX: +65 6479 4601 

Mobile: +65 81214600 

Address : 303 Alexandra Road, Singapore 159941 

Email: inthiran.thurasamy@simedarby.com.sg 

  
www.bmw.com.sg 
  
Sime Darby Motors 
A member of the Sime Darby Group 
  

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the 

named addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or 

proprietary to the Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. 

If you are not the intended Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding 

and/or printing the Message. Please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete 

all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the 

Message being infected by computer virus or other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions 

expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and do not necessarily represent those of Sime 

Darby's.” 

  

 
 

 

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software. 

www.avg.com  

 


