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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

e

From: MTCL@income.com.sg

Sent: Monday, 23 March 2020 4:24 PM
To: Weron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR CLAIM NUMBER
Hi,

Please refer to attached for claim ref number.

Regards,

Ignatius Kah

Cperations, Motor & Personal
Lines

WwWWw.income.com.sg

(' IncorrE At Income, we are “In with You' on Performance, Growth,

Innovation and Impact, These attnbutes reflect what we promise

as an employer and what we want our people to exemplify,
. . H m Find out more at Income.com.sg/ careers

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com)
Sent: Monday, 23 March 2020 11:21 AM

To: MTCL@income.com.sg

Subject: REQUEST FOR CLAIM NUMBER

Dear Sir/Madam,

Kindly provides claim number

N

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Claimant Vehicle
S/NO | Income Reference | Claimant (Owner / Taxi Company) No. Income Vehicl
| MT/1089276-001 | SMART TAXIS PTELTD SHC 41988 FZ 23308
Time of Tentative repair
D.0.A Accident Estimate cost
2/3/2020 18:00 $11,751.74 £4,491.23
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" Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

> Back to OneMotoring

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Viehicle Model;

Primary Calour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.

Chassis Na.:

Maximum Power Dutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amodunt:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Categary:

COE Period(Years):

PQOP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Please note that the B-year COE far this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the

vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 04 Mar 2020

OK

Company
369K

SHC41788

Mo

04 Mar 2020

TOYOTA
PRIUSHYBRID 18CVT
Maroon

2017

2ZRS099959
JTOKB3FU103573289
0.0 kW (120 bhp)
$29.007.00

01 Nowv 2017

01 Mov 2017

0

$5,000.00

Yes
31 Oct 2025
£3,750.00

31 Oct 2025

A - Car up to 1600cc & F7kW [130bhp)

]

§335%95.00
£2375200
$27,502.00
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IMPORTANT NOTICE

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

1, Plapsa ynpor carru-ﬂu the ciatads of e BCTiden) 10 Spied B 1RO DR prOCoES
7 Tha Form mus t= complatad by e Policyhobter and/on the Auttoraesd Devet

'I
|
I' i

1 darmation provided musl be se buthiul pnd socurnis g possibie. Ay wilful merepresesiaton or wilhoicbng of mabers TRCE My Y SELrmnos '-"H‘Fl-""“ L]

vpudiate policy labilly

A The igaus and scceptance of this Fom by meuranoe companime is nal @n admsson of paficy andity on ihe per of ine meurence companes

5 &ny talse reparting may be referred to the Police for imestigation.

0 Thin teport will be foramrded by 1he ssurers of e QLA Fecoms Managerman Cenbe estatilistod Sy e Chtetil Raurenos AESOCmnon of Singapore |

prchiying and that capies of this teport will. for g fea e mado seslabie upon apoicalion by mieeated per

7. By M loagarment of INe report 1 e mauren. you hsreoy conssni 1o e archeving of Bus reoon al Me centra @ 10 copes of #a repor being rete

aforanaist

Dal= Of Rapar
Diate Of Accident
Esact Location Of Accident

Country/State of Loss

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Palicyhalder
Name Of Registered Owner
Co Reg No

Email Address

Mobie Phone No

Allernalive Phone No
Vohicle Particulars
Manulaciurer

Model

Exact Purposa lor which vehicle was being used al

tirne of acciden

Are you claiming under your own insurance palicy

for repair lo your vehicla?
I No, Please state action o be taken
Vehicle Category
Insurance Company
Mama of insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Flest Palicy

Policy Numbar

Caovar Nota Mumber
Driver

MName of Drver

NRIC Na

Date Of Birth

Ocoupation

Oata Of Driving Pass
Driving Exparience
Gandar

Mobile Number

Fax Numbar

Contact Mumber

EMall Adddress

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

002020 1212
O2:03/2020 18:00

JURONG POINT [BOON LAY WAY! NEAR Ti5)

SINGAPORE

SHCa188B

SMRT TAXIS FTELTD
DOOOOCE0K
NOEMAIL

OFFICE-80000000

ToOYQOTA
PRILS TAXI-1.8 (A

HIRE AND REWARD

NO

THIRL PARTY
TAXI

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD
THIRD PARTY FIRE ANDIOR THEFT
YES

D-1808318TMFSH

BATHA KRISHNAN S0 ARUMUGARM
SXAAMAIEZL

1210511847

CUTDOOR

210511873

48 YEARS AND 8 MONTHS

MALE

(LOCAL) +65-80000000

NOEMAIL

rh:n

ke
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Address

Postcods

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If Mo, Retalionihip of the Driver wilh the Insured

Virhicls Registration Number of Drivers Cwn
Vehiche

Insyrance Company of Drivars Dwn Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Acclden|

Wemner Condimans

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign wehiche involved in this accdent?

Mumber of vahicles (Including own vehicks)
imvalved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to haspital by
ambulance?

Was any other matesdal or propafy damaged?

| have been approached by unknown persan(s)
soliciting/oflering acciden! claims assistanca

Mumber of Passengers (Including Driver)
Detalls of Police Action

Was the accident reponed o the palica?

If Yes, Please stats which Police Station
Was notice of intended Proseculion given?
If Yes.againgl whom7

Circumstances ol Accident

19

WO
OTHER - RELIEF

SIDE SWIPE
CLEAR
DRY

ND
2
RO
NO
YES

NO

NO

NO

| WAS MOVING FORWARD SLOWLY TD QUEUE AT THE TAXI STAND JURONG POINT (BOON LAY WAY), SUDDENLY |
FELT AN IMPACT FROM MY RIGHT HAND FRONT SIDE OF MY TAXI. A MOTOR CYCLE FZ23308B HAD ENCROACHED INTO
MY LANE AND HIT THEY RIGHT HAND FRONT PORTION OF MY TAXI, | ALIGHTED AND CHECKED THE MOTOR CYCLIST

RIDER AND HE HAD NO VISIBLE INJURY
Attachment(s)

Ara pecident photos evailable for altechment?
Was there any video caplured by Car Camera?
Remarks/ Roasons

Was there any audio recorded?

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vahicks Registration Mumber
Vahicia Make/ModelColour
Detalls Of Proparias
Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
NRICPassport Number
Contact Number

Address

Pastcods

Insyrance Company Name
MNature Of Damage

YES

YES
FILETCO BIG
NO

=223308

MOTORCYCLE

TITAN KANG KHA MENG

Paga 2 of 10
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No. Of Passanger (Including Driver)
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Sketch Plan Pg. 2
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32020 hitps:ivacswat smirt.com.sg/Esimaton.asp

3 @5”?’?? ]

Case Details |

Case Reterence Number ; insurance Company Mame : NTUC Incara Insurence Co-opemiie
|

Company Typa : EMAT Tass Pe Lid

TAK 0302008 L !
Type of Mopair : Accidan! Repai Estimation ID : EST-10710:1D Accident Date and Thme : 02012020 10,00 AM |
Vehicle Registration Mumbar - Asnsigned By : Tasl Claims Manager N

SHC41088 Team VoNiDts Agsim Momine} '

Documents / Photographs W

Viaw Documants / Photographs Total Do i

Estimation Details i

Snare Parts Cost Detail
SMAT Recommendation Surayor Approval
BOM  Costing Portion  Materlal  Part Name Gty Lhst List Dinis)  Final Aepnir!  Surveyor  Surveyor  Aepaitfeplace Romarks
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[ Priceit)
nii{E)
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o 1 e Raplace = 7 [ Lt-f-
Kay
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Thrw BUMPER AH : ol }”BR
Koy
L4
One  Man SUPPQAT, ER | 230 8230 MO0 6LT2 Replecs = fp—— .\(1\,1
Time BUMPER L
Ky
in
e Wk GRILLE, 1 WE00  1ES.00 2500 1IATE  Wapisce 3 Lo
Tims RADIATOR . " Lo I §1{7d
Koy
In
O L1 CLIPS MECE, FRT 10 183 1600 2500 1.3 Replace
Time & AR BUMPER = | ; '/‘M?(
L]
L]
ane  Main AETAINER, FR 1 BS .50 #Won &3 Replace
s . g (] (] Mot N L
ey M
in
One  Main COVER ASSY, 1 k00 1800 2500 13507 Aeplace ' Mot Giwe ® ¥ twe
Time EMGINE 1
Key
L]
Ons  Main COVER A88Y, 1 45280 45200 3500 33060 Repmco f ¢
Tims ENGINE UNDER . > NI ST
Wy CENTER SET
in
One  Main COVER ENGINE 1 8450  S450 3500 7088 Feplacs = ot Gl _}( Tve
Tima UNDER CENTER 9
Hay
in

Totel Bpare Pari Cost  7,7H8.51 Surveyor Toml 230204

Lump Sum Discount (%) 0.00 Lump Sum Dis (%] 4

Firusl Sgars Pari Cost  7.632.20 Final Sur Total 293204

hitps:/lvacsweb smrl.com. sp/Estimation. aspy
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+_ e GMAT Fecommendalion Bervmper Apoet ‘ . :
b i
_BOM Confing Portion  Matorial  Pan Mame Qty  Lim Limt Dis%) Finael  Aepail  Surveyor  Surveyor tnm
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L
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Totwi Spare Part Cost 778861 Surveyor Tois]  2533.04
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Fingl Spare Part Cost 762220 Final Gur Tota]  2532.04
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32020
Labigur's Cost Datall
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Totai
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Taiwi:
Otter Cant Detall

SNo.  Costing Type Jow Scope

hitps:ivacsweb. smr.com.sg/Eslimalion. asps

SMAT Surveyor Remarks
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1 00 ]
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Summary
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L S Hopesr Opton

hitps ivpcswsh, amr com sg/Estimation.aspx
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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Sves/ARC/ARC/Taxis) <YeoPohsuan@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 23 March 2020 10:35 AM

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Ce: SUR: C5 A Team

Subject: RE: SHC41988

Hi,

Amount confirmed as per your recommendation, thanks.

Regards
Poh Suan

——-0riginal Message-—-

From: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) [mailto:sunpin@|kkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 23 March 2020 9:09 AM

To: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Sves/ARC/ARC/ Taxis)

Subject: RE: SHC41988

Hi Pah Suan,

Confirm the finalize amount 54,491.23. Repair day 3 days under part by part repair.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

—-0riginal Message-—-

From: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Sves/ARC/ARC/Taxis) [mailto:YeoPohsuan@smrt.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 20 March, 2020 2:38 PM

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Cc: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: SHC41988

Hi 5un Pin,

Attached herewith the repair estimate of SHC 41988 having Case No: TAX/03/20/2005.

There is no change to the approved amount of $4,491.23 @ 3 working days under part by part repair.
Cost of Repair invoice will be generated as approved.

Please finalize with me within 7 working day, thanks.

Thanks & Regards
Poh Suan



—-Original Message—-—-

From: Lim Wei Siong (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & 1A/Taxis)
Sent: Friday, 20 March 2020 2:06 PM

To: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Taxis)

Subject: Emailing: Image_010.pdf

Your message is ready to be sent with the following file or link attachments:

Image_010.pdf

Note: To protect against computer viruses, e-mail programs may prevent sending or receiving certain types of file
attachments. Check your e-mail security settings to determine how attachments are handled.



© ©i Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: Qi Sun Pin [LKK Auto)

Sent: Menday, 23 March, 2020 9.09 AM

To: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Sves/ARC/ARC / Taxis)
Subject: RE: SHC41988

Hi Poh Suan,

Confirm the finalize amount $4,491.23. Repair day 3 days under part by part repair.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
0i Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

—Lriginal Message-——

From: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Taxis) [mailto:YeoPohsuan@smirt.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 20 March, 2020 2:38 PM

To: Oi Sun Pin [LKK Auta)

Cc: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: SHC4198B

Hi Sun Pin,

Attached herewith the repair estimate of SHC 41988 having Case No: TAX/03,/20/2005.

There is no change to the approved amount of 54,491.23 @ 3 warking days under part by part repair.
Cost of Repair invoice will be generated as approved.

Please finalize with me within 7 working day, thanks.

Thanks & Regards
Poh Suan

----- Original Message----

From: Lim Wei Siong (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis)
Sent: Friday, 20 March 2020 2:06 PM

To: Yeo Poh Suan {Auto Sves/ARC/ARC/Taxis)

Subject: Emalling: Image_010.pdf

Your message is ready to be sent with the following file ar link attachments:

Image_010.pdf




) Shirie: Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Sves/ARC/ARC/Taxis) <YeoPohsuan@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 20 March 2020 2:38 pm

To: Ol Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Ce: SUR, CS A Team

Subject: SHC41988

Attachments: Image_010.pdf; CIMGB163 jpg; CIMGB162.jpg; CIMG8164.jpg

Hi Sun Pin,

Attached herewith the repair estimate of SHC 41988 having Case No: TAX/03/20,/2005.

There is no change to the approved amount of 54,491.23 @ 3 working days under part by part repair.
Cost of Repair invoice will be generated as approved.

Please finalize with me within 7 working day, thanks.

Thanks & Regards
Poh Suan

—-—0riginal Message-——

From: Lim Wei Siong (Auto Svcs/Claims & 1A/Claims & |A/Taxis)
Sent: Friday, 20 March 2020 2:06 PM

To: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Taxis)

Subject: Emailing: Image_010.pdf

Your message is ready to be sent with the following file or link attachments:

Image_010.pdf

Note: To protect against computer viruses, e-mall programs may prevent sending or receiving certain types of file
attachments. Check your e-mail security settings to determine how attachments are handled.
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Contractar WEGA ENGINEERING PTE LTD :
Acadent Case = Date of Collection : |
Number 7-9![] 03 [>2/ 3005 413/15 |
Vehicle No - Date of Request :
SHC 4198 R (320
Number of Days to
Vehicle Model | 70%078 PAIuS L - Extend
RUIQUEST FOR 51/PPLYMENT PARTS
_SIN_| Number photos | Part Description Quantity Unit Price |
1 |gss i !
- 16046 Mavp Assy Foy A d 410-19 /\(ra
2 v <
> =
4
— . R
|8 il A
P
8 )
— — ]
<<<Please submit pholegraphs for damaged parts>>>
I, (Name) C}'”H
(Positian) ADVISOR
Do solemrtly and sincerely declare

| acknowledge that this declaration is true and corroct,

WL il

who makes a false declaration is llable to the damagos of porjury.

| hmmq Parts are raised for replacement %o Ihe aforesald vahicle

Signature of person making this declaration

[Te te signed in front of an outhorised witness)
#ndd | mako it with the undarstanding and belief that a person

Acknowiedge By ARC Executive | Suparvisor / 54
Approval By Surveyor / In-houss Sfalf
Parts Ordering sunrmmrcmmsmrmmur Form22 | PO / WOC/! Reservation /
WOC Number
o ;
hoto Submitted . Date of submission
For SMRT Stal




