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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Monday, March 23, 2020 6:16 PM
To: DAVIDLENG@FAREASTREF.COM.SG
Cc: Admin A
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKK8118D & SHB5185L / OTHERS  ON 28/2/2020 ALONG /AT 

PIE TOWARDS CHANGI JUST BEFORE EXIT 26B

OUR REF: CC3/AIG20003511/T1ks3 
 
 
LENG CHEE KEONG 
POLICY HOLDER 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKK8118D & SHB5185L / OTHERS  ON 28/2/2020 ALONG /AT PIE TOWARDS CHANGI JUST BEFORE 
EXIT 26B 
 
We refer to the above subject matter.  
 
We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
 
Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given us 
your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for 
an amicable settlement with third party claimant. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 
within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD – if applicable) will be with held for the time being. Pending for final 
allocation of liability in settlement by our principal AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Su Li (LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, March 27, 2020 8:14 AM
To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis)
Cc: CS A Team; Admin A
Subject: FW: LOD  Re: Accident on 28/2/2020 involving SHB 5185L, SKK 8118D (AIG's insured) & 

SJH 8332D  (Our Ref: TAX/02/20/2093/lg) 
Attachments: img-326180302-0001.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
 
Hi Khanchna, 
 
FYNA, our ref CC3/AIG20003511/T1ks3 
 
                                                                
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Su Li | Admin Support 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 (Ext:119) Email: SuLi@lkkauto.com| Fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis) [mailto:LeeGek@smrt.com.sg]  
Sent: Thursday, 26 March 2020 6:16 PM 
To: CS A Team; Admin A 
Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 28/2/2020 involving SHB 5185L, SKK 8118D (AIG's insured) & SJH 8332D (Our Ref: 
TAX/02/20/2093/lg)  
 
Dear All, 
 
We quantify our claim as follows:-  
 

Cost of Repair $2120.20            

Loss of Rental $987.12  ( 9 days x $109.68  ) 

Loss of Income $540.00  ( 9 day x $60.00  ) 

LTA Search Fee $7.00            

Total $3654.32            
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We enclose the following documents:  

1)    Repair invoice  
2)    Proof of rental rate 
3)    Police/GIA reports  
4)    Accident vehicle laid-up report 
5)    LTA search 
6)    Hirer’s letter of authorisation  

 
Our hirer engaged his own lawyer to claim for his injury only.  
 
Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks. 
 
Regards 
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548) 
Claims Department 
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd   

 
 


















