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5l ual lvE t, t0l-25 p]{yA uar n\iDUsTRL{L PARI(! SINOAPORE 40a9$ TEL . (065) 62S6356t fAX : {06st 6x&r1r.

Your Ref:

Our Ref: CS/SMO20003496/Dr.f3

Date: l8 Mar 2020

The Motor Claims Departmeit
SOMPO INSI]RANCE SINGAPORE PL

Dear SirMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OT VEHICLE NO. SIIA4997Y .

Please be infomed that we had conducted the inspection ofthe abovementioned vehicle
on 03103202q at the premises of M/s BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD and have the
following to reporti

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check" ltems Amount
Market Value
LTA Reimbursement Value
Neft Value

Description ofDamage:
The vehicle sustained damaEes
at the n/s front & o/s front bodv.

Yous faithfully

BRYAN ANG
Licensed Appraiser

s$ 27.685.48
s$ 14.267.88
s$-s$-
s$-
s$-



Yvonn KK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)
Wednesday, March 18, 2020 8:47 AM
'Teo. Grace

Choo, Thelma;SUR
RE: CMTD2000B34/THE - LKK/ SKV6624P & SHA4997Y ACC on 22.02.2020.
SHA4997Y PRELI ADVlSE.pdf

Dear Sir/ Madam

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SHA4997Y
Date of survey : 03/03/2020
Number of days:8 days

Thank you.

Besi Regards,

Yvonne wong (Ms) I Case Handler

LKKAutoCoDsulr ts Pte Ltd
Phorc: 6256-3561 email: wonnewons@1kl<auto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 5! Paya Ubi lndustrial Pdh, Lrli A\€nue I #o2 2s S(4o89$)

Attachments:

Date:03/O3/2O2O

From: Teo, Grace Imai,to:grace.teo@sompo.com.sg]
Sentl Tuesday, March 03, 2020 8:46 AM
To: Claims Dept <claims_ltv@bifrostauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkka uto.com>; assignments
<assign ments@ lkka uto.co m>j S U R <su r@ lkka uto.com>
Cc: Choo, Thelma <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>; Assessment <claims@bifrostauto.com>; Regina
<assessment_ltc@bifrostauto.com>; Accident Claims Dept <claims_ltr@bifrostauto.com>; Ms tim
<claims_ltm@bifrostauto.com>
Subject: CMTD2000834/THE - LKK/ SKV6624P & SHA4997Y ACC on 22.02.2020.

Our Reference: CMTD2000834/THE
Your Reference: SHA4997Y

Without Preiudi.e
EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsuru€v@somoo.com.ss

Attention:
M/S SIFROSTAUTO PTE LTO



(LKK Auto

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Our Reference: CMTD2000834/THE
Your Reference: SHA4997Y

Date:03/03/2020

Teo, Grace <grace,teo@sompo.com.sg>
Tuesday, 3 March, 2020 8:46 AM
Claims Dept;'admin,d@lkkauto.com'j'assignments@lkkauto.com';
sur@lkkauto.com
Choo, Thelma; Assessment; Regina;Accident Claims Dept; Ms Lim
CMTD2000834/THE - LKK/ SKV6624P & SHA4997y ACC on 22.02.2020.
SHA 4997Y - GLA Report (1).pdf

Without Preiudi.e
EMAIT ONLY

OUR Email motorsurusv@somoo.com.sa

Attention:
M/S BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD

Dear Ms. Lee,

ACCTDENT tNVOLV|NG SKV6624P & SHA4997Y ON 22,02.2020

We refer to your email reply of02.03.20.

We will appoint lKK AUTO to survey the above vehicle.

Aside to LKK Auto,

Please make arrangementto conduct the survey for SHA4997Y on a without Prejudice and any admission of liability
basis.

Please be informed that Ms. Thelma Choo is the handler ofthis case who can be contacted at 63224 687/
thelma.choo@somoo.com.sq .

Please submit with your report upon completion ofsurveyto mycolleague, Ms. Thelma.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Grace Teo
Claims Division
D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F.6221 3147



r For Travel, Pe*onalAccident & Home tnturance I r ForT,ave, persohat Accident, Ftome & priv.re Motor t.surance

Disclaimer: This €_mail, including aflachments, is intended for the person(s) orcompany named and may contain confidentiat
and/or legally pnvileged infomalion. Unaulhorised disctosure, copying or use oflhis infomation may be untaurutand is prohibited
llyou are noi the intended recipieni, ptease detele lhis message.
Privacy Policy Notice: sompo rnsurance singapore pte. Lrd maycolect, use and drscrose your personardaia for rhe purposes
slated in our Pdvacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holdrng and assocraled companrel, credit bureau, pafies 10 whom
disclosure is pemitledrequired by taws, ourihird party service providers and agenis (a;ting o; our behatD. ptease ctick herc for

From: Claims Dept <claims_ltv@bjfrostauto.com>
Sent: Monday, March 2, 2020 5:58 pM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>
Cc: Choo, Thelma <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>; Assessment <claims@bjfrostauto.com>; Regina
<assessment_ltc@bifrostauto.com>; Accident claims Dept <claims_ltr@bifrostauto.com>; Ms Lim
<claims_ltm@bifrostauto.com>
subiect: Re: CMTD2000834/THE - pRt/ SKV6624p & SHA4997Y ACC on 22.O2.2O2O.

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

We select LKK Auto Consultatlts.

For mqtor claims survey request, please emailto motorsuryev@somoo.com.sE

SOMPO

Sompo lnsu.ance Singapore pte. Lld.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com,so I Facebook: www,facebook,com/SomooSG

Quick & Easy Claims Subrnissionl& product purchasezvia Sompo SG

Download now @

i|ls Lee

Bifrost Auto Pte Lld

Accidert Ciaims Departme[t

+65 9792 1329 (Mobile.)

On Moq 2 Mar 2020 at l6:45, Teo, Grace <g1q99.1991@q94p9.pg4q;g> p161e;

Our Reference: CMTD2000834/THE

Your Reference: SHA4997Y



Date.02/03/2O2O

Without Preiudiae

EMAIT ONLY

Attention:

M/S BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD

Prc-Repair Survey

Motor Surveyor Surveyor
Andrew Ow Y

Selection (Indicate as
tick)

Dear Ms, Lee,

ACCTDENT tNVOr-VrNG SKV6624P & SHA4997Y ON 22.02.2020

We referto your Notice ofAccident dated 02/03/2020.

Please be informed that Ms. Thelma Choo is the handler ofthis case who can be contacted at 62224 691,/
thelma.choo@sompo.com.sE.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's/your custome/s vehicle jointly with your
client^our motorworkshop. We propose to use one ofthe motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Vincent N
Ra.leieh Services



Mohd Taufikh (West

Priority Sereices

LKK Auto Consultants

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two ofthe listed motor surveyors. we will bear the cost of
the pre-repalr sutuey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D:6329 5'170 I T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please emailto motorstrruev@somoo.com.sF

SOMPO A Century ofTrust

Sompo lnsurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sq I Facebook: www.facebook.corn/Somposc

quick & Easy Claims Submissionl& Product Purchase'zvia Sompo SG



Download now @

From:Claims Dept<ctaims ltv@bifrostauto.com>
Sent: SatLrrday, February 29,2020 7157 pM
To: Claims - Motor Survey <Motorsurvev(osomDo.com.sp>
Cc: Assessment <qlahll@lljIggEgtqJpl!>; Regina <assessment ltc@bifrostauto.com>j
<claims ltrfAbifrostauto.com>; Ms Llm <claims ltm@bifrostauto.com>
Subject: Re : PRS for our client's vehicle SHA 4997 y and your insured,s vehicle SKV 6624

or

l For Travel, Personai Accidenr & Nome tnsuEnce | : ForTravet, personat Accident, Home & private Moro. tnsuran.e

Disclaimer: Thjs e_mair, incruding altachments, as intended forrhe person(s) orcompany named and may contain conridentiar
and/or legally privileged iniormation. unauthorised disciosure, copying or use of this information may be untawfutand is
prohibited. lfyou are not the jntended recipient, ptease detete this messaqe.

Privacy Policy Notic€: Sompo lnsurance singapore Pte- Ltd. may collect, use and disctose your personatdata forthe purposes
staled in our Plivacy Poficy. This may include disclosure to holoing and associated companie!. credit bureau. parlies io whom
drsclosure rs permilted/required by laws ourthird party seNice provide.s and agents (acting on ourbehatD. ptease ctick Iqe for

Accident Claims Dept

P on 22.02.2020.

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

we represent ourclient, chong Hock Ling, to notiryyou ofthe aforesaid accident involving our client,s vehicle sHA
4997 Y and your insured's vehicle SKV 6624 p o n 22.O2.2O2O.

Please find enclose our client's GIA report foryour necessary action.

This serves as a NOTICE that we are claiming against S(V 6624 p for damages, costs and disbursements.

Please let us knowwithin 2 working days from today, your client's and your intention to conduct a pre,repa:rsurvey
of our client's vehicle.



lf we do not receive any repryfrom you within the stipulated timeline, we shallproceed to appoint ourown surveyor
and proceed with the necessary repair for our crient's vehicre without further reference to your insured or you.

PLEASi I.ET US HAVE A LIST OF YOUR EXTERNAL SURVEYORS FOR OUR SELECTION AS A SINGI-E JOINT EXPERT.

Premises for the Pre-repair inspection: Blk 9 Sector C #01-42, Sin Ming Industrial Estate, Singapore 575644

Contact Person: Ms Lim / Ms Lee

Contact Emaili claims ltv@bifrostauto.com / claims ltm(abifrostauto.com

VEH lN (Date & Time) : 29.02.2020

PRS ARRANGEMENT (Date & Time) : AS SOON AS POSSIBLE

Kindly cc a copy ofthis letter to your insured for his/her acknowledgement.

We look forward to hearing from you soon.

To avoid incurrence of any unnecessary cost on both our end, kindly confirm liabillty status within 7 days
from this to minimize time wastage and incurrence of any unnecessary cost{s) on both our end, we seek
your kind advice, within 7 days working days, on liability status for subject claim. If we do not hear from
you within the stipulated period, we shall proceed with the purchase of your insured GIA report and this



'cost or any other cost incurred for confirmation of liability status shall be included in our LOD for
reimbursement purpose.

Thankyou.

You can protect our environment. Ihink betore you print.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE
This e-maii (including any attachments) fray comain informatio. that-E privite8ed or @nfidennat
rhe sending of this e nail to .ny pecon other than the intended recrprent ir not a miver o, the ptivitege or @nfidentiatity thar attachg to ft.
lryou arc ndthe intended recipient, prease noni/lh€ senderimmediatety, debreth.emailanddo noi @py, dhtriblte o; disclose its conrenE.

ills Lee

Bifrost Auto Pte Ltd

Accideut Claims Deparlnent

+65 9?92 1329 (Mobile)
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SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
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3:n,"-uli"np,",ij.@oEsenGliondwifo|oineolT.I6da,,..Efayarow15U.at.comp.n:.slo
EPUd al€ por_cy li€b lily
4. Th.lswe d e*ptarce or rhis Fom by insuraice@npanies is nol an admissio. ol oot y tiabiliry o. rhe pad o hs i,suEnce 6mpanr6s.

: 4lEseEgllsllxE-@rEglatq?qEeror rrysri!.iron.
6.rr.srepol,inbe'wardedbv[I€nsLrasolhecl-ARemrdsMa garal.cenu€ es..bt,srd byu6 cuera, k3u6nce A*oc.aLon ofs.4gapo.e (GD)to,ard'iv rc a1d bdt cop'€s o, dris rcpn w l ro,aree bemadeava.ra"r" i-"pp.,-r-rv,rc".r""'p;;; - --.,*
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'le 'nsure4 vouheEbyEnsentlotheaE\ivngoftrisre9onalh6oenr,eand16copiesofrheepodbein!m.d.avaibbte

221021202A 11:4A

2210212420 09:30

ONAN RO

SINGAPORE

b<acl Localion O, Accident

Couniry/State ol Loss

II\,JPORTANI NOTICE

Daie Ol Repon

Vehrclo Regjslrar'on Numbe.

nsured/Policynoldi|r

Name Ol Registered Owner

Co Reg No

Aller.ative Pho.e No

Vehicle Parliculars

Exact Purpose ror which vehiclewas

A.e you claiming u.der yourown insumnce poticy
ror repair to you. vehicle?

lfNo. Please state action lo be taken

Vehicle C€legory

lnsurance Coriipany

Name ot lnsurance Company

Type orCoveEge

Driver

Name of O ver

NRIC No

Date oi Bidh

Date Oi Ddving Pass

SHA4997Y

COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD

1XXXXX821R

FLEETSAFETY@CDGETAXI.CO!I,SG

oFFicE-65508768

HYUNDAI

t40

NO

THIRD PARTY

TAXI

I\,IS FIRST CAPIfAL INSURANCE LTO

THIRD PARry FIRE AND/OR THEFT

YES

o,18088936t\,1FSH

CHONG HOCK LING

sxxxx463t
19/05/1955

OUTDOOR

14t12t1976

43 YEARS AND 2 I\IONTIIS

IIIALE

(LOCAL) +65-981 76568

NOEMAIL



General lnforhation of the Accidsnt

Poslcode

WasddverEn ehptoyee ol the lnsured,s Company
llNo, Reiationship ofihe Driverwtrh the lnsured
Vehicle Registlation Number of Driveis Own

lnsurance Company of D.lve/s Own Vehi€le

Other hformalion

Was any forelgn vehicte invotved in lhis accidef,t?

Number olvehices (inctudino own vehicte)
Lnvolved in rhe acc dent

Was any body injured in ihe Accidenr?

Was any ltrjLrred conveyed to hospiratby

was any other materiator prcperly damaged?

I have been approached by untnown persontsl
so|crnnq/otrerno accidentctaims assjstan.e

Number of Passengers (tnctuding Odvor)

268 ONAN ROAO

424658

NO

OTHER , TAXI ORIVER

COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR

CLEAR

WET

NO

2

NO

NO

YES

NO

1

Details ot Poiice Action

Was r,he accidentrepoded to ihe police? NO

lfYes Pleaso state which potice Srarion

Was nolice ofintended Prosecuton given? NO

li Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER ATTACHED'TYPE OF ACCTOENT:- HEAO TO stDE
Attachment(s)

Areaccldenlpholosavailableforalrachment? yES

Was lhere anyvid€o captured by Car Camera? yES

Was there any audio rccorded? NO

Vehicle Registration Number

Vehicle Make/lrodel/Colour

NRIC/Passport Number

lnsurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage

No. or Passens€r (,ncluding onver)

PRIVATE CAR

TEO YANG SONG

sKV6624P



SXETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOIIC!
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O prc(er5.B tra.drng and/o, dea nEwrh myctaims incudinethesertemenrolthect:ims:nd any,,e.essary..vEitgarions re ar ng ro rhe cta m5.

iil) rnvestiEari.s rhe ac. denr andlor mycta ms;

I r)L"..v.lgonano'or oea irE, r^ -vrr.r.Ln,o1! o-r!.pord lgro "1! 
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investieating, co.troti.Cormanagingfraud,
requned fo. the plrposes sr.red, or

FeponinC Cemre P€rsonn. ,s Stgnature

Date & rrme:22.02' 020



A . SHA 4997Y
B . SKV 6624P

Along Onan Road

DEsCRIBE CIRCUMsTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

On 22.02.2020 al abaut 09130 hours I ryg!-leyg]llg "!gng 
Onan Road with no passenger

onboard.

While kavelling skaight , suddenly Veh B ( SKV 6624p ) reverse and collided into my taxi A

Front Lefl Podion .

As it took place too fast I could nol take evasive aclion to prevent

I have company video and photos al scene to supporl my claims .

Veh B ( SKV 6624P ) - Mr Teo yang Song

DECLARATION

Ave declare the foregoins parrtcutars :re true in

"o"'33.TJ#$:sH,gllJ'.,o

Reporiiig Centr€ Pe6onne t Signature

oa& a rime 22.02r z0
hrs@11



BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE

DATE:

MODEL

3-Mar-20

INSURANCE: -9" UP.
HYUNDAI I4O

VEHICLE NO.: SHA4997Y

l-/

v
/
/
/

I
x
/
/I

I
/
)(

/
f
/I
v"
a
>v

\

BoNNET ,,J^,\. J 6+ 1 $2,265.90 $2.265.90
BONNET RUBBER (LH) I'h.{ I $15.70 $'r5.70
EQNI'IEr RUBBER (RH) t.t^(

1 $6.20 $6.20
BONNET HINGE (RH) NxI

1 $82.00 $82.00
BONNET INSULATOR CLIPS N^ 1 $7.00 $7.00
FRONT BUMPER COVER D*J-( ll^ r-t-.^.r" I $1,052.20 $1,052.20
FRONT BUIVPER SPONGE 

'.IA{ 1 $99.20 $99.20
FRONT BUIVIPER BMCKET TOP (LH) N( 1 $44.80 $,{4.80
FRONT BUMPER BMCKET (LH) H! 1 $49.20 $49.20
FRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET FI{ $4.60 $4.60
FRONT BUMPER RETAINER MOUNTTNG ir.r $8.00 $8.00
FRONT BUi'PER GRILLE AIR DUCT \'.\ $26.20 $26.20
HEADLAMP SUPPORT PANEL ASSY h1,V- ^ $907.40 $907.40
HEADLAIVIP (LH/RH) l-7n )<,-{ \M"r,-}- h/tL $2.776.OO $2,776.00
IEADLAIVIP SUPPORT TOP COVER \ }^fk& $222.60 $222.60
FRONT FENDER (LH) J2-**{ $566.30 $566.30
FRONT FENDER APRON PANEL (LHJ E-1. $637.00 s637.00
FRONT FENDER SHIELD ILH) aitlv\&-,\ $174.90 $174 90
EEONT FENDER IVIUDFLAP (LH) F.JXI $'13.50 $13.50
FRONT FENDER RETAINER k-l $3.00 $3.00
ERONT DOOR MIRROR SIDE GARNISH \'r $225.00 $225.O0
FRONT DOOR (LH) 

'1,,-,.-., $2.256.40 $2,256.40
FRONT DOOR RUBBER tsr"r

$96.00 $96.00
FRONT DOOR HINGE UppER (LH) qx $44.50 $44.50
FRONI DOOR HINGE LOWER (LH) H^r $44.50 $44.50
FRONT DOOR CHECK (LH) q*(

1 $91 80 $91.80
FRONT DOOR TRIM BOARD (LH) hL( 1 $997.40 $997.40
FRONT WINDSCREEN [/]OULDtNG N( I $23.70 $23.70
FRONT WINDSCREEN SEALANT I,I{

1 Mo.oo $40.00
FRONT WINDSCREEN PILLAR OUTER (LH) Hi{ 1 $1.535.90 $1.535.90
FRONT WHEEL Rllvl (LH/RH) ,-r r \ ,l\ 2 i65&60 $130frA
FRONT WHEEL HUB CAP (LH/RH) T,+ 2 $2-T{20 $AMO
FRONT WHEEL NUT (LH/RH) H^, 2 -s570 $11.40
FRONT WHEEL BEARING (LH/RH) 'D-ul 2 $301.80 $603.60
FRONT WHEEL HUB ASSY (LH/RH) *i'r 2 $J5a60 $307.20
FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER ASSY (LH/RH) z,q !+,-A,-^ 2 ( $6a4.4A $136&.60
EBQNT SHOCK ABSORBER MOUNTTNG (LH/RH) N,-, 2 $,217.60 $435.20
FRONT DRIVE SHAFT (LH/RH) \.7 2 $2,061.60 $4.123.20
RACK & PINION ASSY D. 

"Vr.,
1 $'r.820.00 $1.820.00

9 JG TIE ROD (LH/RH) at4 !+'-h^ 2 /$135-00\ $2ffin0
STG TIE END (LHiRH) o(s{"+^l 2 a$12s-.24 -92-5e40STG BALL JOINT (LH/RH) q.r 2 s'73 10 $146.20
STABILIZER BAR |.1..r 1 $252 s0 $252.30



TABILIZER BAR BUSH (LH/RH) h,..{ $16.40STABILIZER BAR LINK
STABILIZER BRACKET /RH) {\l
FRONT SUSPENSION LOWER ARIVI (LH/i

$1.191.80KNUCKLE ARM (LH/RH) d{^\d-,rr
ING-FRONT \'r

SUB TOTAL
$30,885.60
$6,177.12

DISCOUNTED TOTAL

FRONT DOoR coLoURED CoI,FoRTT66-iE--N
FRONT ERP STICKER tI,L(

BONT TYRE (RH) O !'+ rl(.A"J sN

$3't7.00

Labour Ch
Panel Beati

Paintino Ch

ransfer of Door lvlechanism FRONT
Re-set Frt Power Window
Four WheelAliqnment
Remove/Refix Undercarri
Re-set Frt ABS Svstem
Remove/Refix Radiator
Remove/Refix Aircon & Refill Gas $130.00
Remove/Refix Fuse Box
Remove/Refix Front Windscreen Glass $'120.00Remove/Refix Enoine 1.200.00

TOTAL LABOUR

ESTIMATE TOTAL
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DATE:

MODEL:

29-Apt-2O

BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD

REPAR ESTIMATE

INSURANCE:
9"{p"

HYUNDAi I4O

VEHICLE NO.: SHA4997Y (S )

llro.to

z7o*.5D
)bL9.Lo

2EK

.xxr ue€3xtc-E
MDIATOR GRILLE "rnr ^*fr @- l<- $1,480.00 $L480.00
ENGINE CROSS MEI\,,IBER \af,rytr6.4 $2,094.40 $2,094.40

SUB TOTAL $3,s74.40
LESS 20% $714.88
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $2,8s9.52

ThisisaninitjalestimatebasedonaVisUalin5pectionoftheab@
prepared afterthe vehicle is surveyed by a motorSurveyor appointed bythe insurance companv.


