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Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Mgian, Kelvyna <kelvyna.ngian@sg.gaig.com=

Sent: Monday, 2 March, 2020 5:58 PM

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto); 'Admin A", 'SUR’

Subject: RE: Our Ref:CLMOMVMO000000558, DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO.
SKN5790R AGAINST FBN9745C DATE OF ACCIDENT: 1/3/2020

Attachments: pri.pdf

Hi team

Please conduct TP survey

Best Regards

Kelvyna Ngian, Claims Department | P. +65 6804 6059 | F. +65 6235 3354 | Kelvyna.Ngian{@sg.gaig.com

GREATAMERICAN

INSURANCE COMPANY Claims| 3 Temasek Avenue #16-01 Centennial Tower Singapore 039190

M & Moody's Standard & Poor's
g i) g J A1 (Good) A+ (Strong)
b ,@"g L Published December 2018 Alfirmed February 23, 2018

. A+ (Superior)

Affirmed August 17, 2018

For more information on our financial ratings, visit GAILG. com/Financialstrength

From: Liew Thye Wui <twliew@honda.com.sg>

Sent: 02 March 2020 5:25 PM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <kelvyna.ngian@sg.gaig.com=>

Subject: [External] RE: Our Ref:CLMOMYMOO00D00558, DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO. SKN5790R AGAINST
FBN9745C DATE OF ACCIDENT: 1/3/2020

Dear Sir / Mdm,
Kindly help to arrange LKK Auto Consultants for the survey.
Thank you and have a Nice Day.

Best Regards

TW LIEW
Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.
15 Ubi Road 4



Singapore 408610
DID: 6514 5687
Fax: 6748 0770

From: Liew Thye Wui <twliew@honda.com.sg>

Sent: 02 March 2020 3:04 PM

To: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.galg.com>

Subject: [External] DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NQO. SKNS790R AGAINST FBN9745C DATE OF ACCIDENT:
1/3/2020

Dear Officer-in-charge,

Kindly refer to the attachments for third party direct settlement,
Vehicle is not in our workshop. Please call for the arrangement.
Meanwhile, kindly get back to me once liability has establish.

Thank you very much.

Best Regards

TW LIEW

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.
15 Ubi Road 4
Singapore 408610

DID: 6514 5687

Fax: 6748 0770

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.

The content of this e-mail massage and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended selely for the addressee, i you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you recaive this message In error, please natify the sender
immediataty by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.



The cantent of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally priviteged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.



MEM 120072 1 Hah by
EMNTRY DATE & TIME: 0
SUBMITTED BY: Liew Thye Wai

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Pleiase: reeport comrectly the dedails of the accident ko spesd up the claims process
2. This Form musl be completed by the Policyholder andler the Authorised Driver

a5 o
repudiale policy lability,

4, The issue and acceptance of thes Form by insurance companies s not an admission af policy lability on the pan ol The insurance companias

5, Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

&, This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GlA Records Management Cenira established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) lor
archiving and that copies of thes report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interesied partes

7. By the lodgament of this rapart to thi: insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and 1o copies of the report being made available
aforesaid

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident
Exact Location Of Accident

Country/State of Loss

02/03/2020 11:01

01/03/2020 12:40

SLIP ROAD FROM NEW UPPER CHANG| RD TO SIGLAF RD
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Mumber
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner
MRIC No

Ermail Address

Mobile Phone No

Altarnative Phone Mo
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to ba taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

MWame of Driver

NRIC No

Drate Of Birth

Qeccupation

Date OF Driving Pass

Driving Experiance

Gender

Mobile Mumber

Fax Mumber

Contact Mumber

EbMail Address

SKNSTI0R

LIM ¥YLU-WEN JOEL
SXXXX13TE
K1243@HOTMAIL.COM
(LOCAL) +65-96624763
OTHERS-NOPHOME

HONDA
CITY-1.5 (A)

PERSOMAL USE (SOCIAL)

MO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

LIBERTY INSURANCE PTE LTD
COMPREHENSIVE

L8]

SOV ETSNVPC2/IR0G

CHERLYMN OMNG TZE-MAE
SHAXAAN12G

13/06/1983

INDOOR

25/08/2011

£ YEARS AND 6 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-21 546884

CHERLYN_B3@HOTMAIL.COM



BLK 807C CHAl CHEE ROAD
#0442

Postcode 463807

Address

Was driver an employes of the Insured's Company NO
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured SPOUSE

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle .

Insurance Company of Dnvers Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information
Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?  NO

Mumber of vehicles (including own vehicle)

invalved in the accident 2

Was any bady injured in the Accident? MO

Was any injured conveyed (o hospital by

ambulance? NO

Was any olher malerial or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown _persc:nl;s] NO

soliciting/offering accident claims assislance

MNumber of Passengers {Including Driver) 2

Passenger 1 NAME: © ELYSE LIM YIRU
GEMDER : FEMALE

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? (]

If Yes,Please state which Police Station

YWas notice of intended Prosecution gliven? ND

If Yes, against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

PLEASE REFER TO ATTACHMEMNT REPORT

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES

Was there any audio recorded? MO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Wehicle Registration Mumber FEBNS745C
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour /1 B/ACK & BLUE
Details Of Properties FROMNT
Wehicle Category MOTORCYCLE
Mame of Driver MOHAMMAD ZAKIR BIN MOHD RIDWAMN
NRIC/Passport Number SHEXXKI0Z
Contact Number 96485076
Address
Postcode
Insurance Company Name GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

Mature Of Damage

Fage 2ol 13



No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 3ol 13



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

Wibicte Mavnbey e GI8aE
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Py B icher’s Signature

Bate & Vipe!

SKETCH PLAN

Dlewratiin provided sl be as truthiul and aceurate o5 passibile. Ay wil fol s eent e vl el tal sdevial fogts
rkivy allowe izsurance companics 1o repudiate policy liability,

The issue and acceplance of tis Torm by insurance companies is aot s aamission of paalicy laliility oo the part of thabntimance

AT,

Ay [alse reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

The report will be forwarded by the insurers af the GIA Records Manapoiment Contre estabilished by the Goneral nsuranoe
Associalion of Sinpapore (GIA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for 2 Toe be made available upon application by

interested parties,

By the: lodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this repart at the contre amd 1o copias of the
report being made available aforesaid,

Consent under the Personal Datz Protection Act (PDPA] | understand, acknawledpe, apree and canseat thal

{al My insurer, my workshap and the General Insurance Association of Singapore [“GIA") mayfare permitted to collect, use,
disclose andfor process my personal datafpersonal informatian set out in this fform] and any other personal infarmation
provided by me or possessed by my insurer [coliectively the "Personal infarmation”] and disclnse and transfer such Personal
Information o all insuser(s) who have insured vehicle{s) involved in this aceident {alf insurer(s} who have insured vehicle]s)
involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the “Insurers), the Insurers’ lawyersflaw Tirms, the Monetary
Autharity of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority (such as the police), for the purpose(s) of :

(i} processing, kandling andfor dealing with iy claims including the sertfement of the claims and sny necessary
irvestigations relating ta the claims;

{ii} investigating the accident and/or my claims;

(i} earrylng out andfar dealing with my instructions or responding to any enguiries by me;

{iv) administering my claims {including the mailing of correspondence, staterments, involces, reparts or notices to me, which
could invelve disclosure of certain personal data about me ta bring about delivery of the same as well 25 on the external
cover of envelopes/mail packages); andfor

{v) complying with applicable law in admimistering, processing, handling andfor dealing with my claims.{collectively the
"Purposes”)

(B} all insurer{s) who have insured wahiche{s) imvelved in this aceldent and the Insurers' lawyers/law firms, rnayfare permilted Lo
tollect, use, disclose andfor process my Personal Infarmation for one or more of the above Purposss; and

{c)  my Personal information may/ean be disclosed by any of the Insurers andfor GIA ta their third party service providers or
agents{including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the abave Purposes.

(d}  my Personal information will alse bo collecied and used to compile clains history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management in present and all future claims.

ti}  the infarmation so collected under {d) above may be shared / disclosed:
(i} 1o allinsurers andfor any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controllfing or managing fraud,
regulatars, law enfarcement and government agencies as reasanably required for the purpeses stated, or

{ii} for cormplying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders, ’

b

Aeparting Cefta: Peisonnel's Signature

Driver’s :-u|gﬂ.£uu.—
(I driver B not the palicyhalder} Mamno
Date & Time: 2 wpdpds Jose G000 PR SFIN P

Paga d af 13



Sketch Plan Pg. 2
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DECLARATION
Ife declare the foregoing particulars are Lrug in every respect.

Briver's Signatlire .

{F driver is not the policyholder)
Date & Thme: & vercha Sole ., W (e

Foficyholder's Signasure
Mzt & Tirma:

/

1

P

Reporting Centre Personncl's Signature

Mo
HRICSFIN Mo

Page 5ol 13



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 of |

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner I1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Cutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
137E

SKN5790R

No

09 Mar 2020
HONDA

CITY 1.55VCVT
Silver

2018
L15Z16205303
MRHGM6660KT000471
88.0 kW (118 bhp)
$17,864.00

22 Jan 2019

22 Jan 2019

0

$17,864.00

Yes
21 Jan 2029
$13,398.00

21 Jan 2029

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$28,000.00

$24,823.00

$38,221.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 09 Mar 2020

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION _ID=F030... 09-Mar-20



Used Honda City Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart Page 1 of 1
sﬁcg\ﬂMAnt.tuu Login  Sign up

New Cars Used Cars Rental Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources

-

Open bookings for
HDB Sales of Balance flats

goV

i L}

Post an Advertisement r‘mlnn n

Sell it yourself! Advertise & at Just a fnspisation, For Car Raper .

$53 until it's SOLD! - Pl click here to view =

B [iirect Chwne our PRISTINE USED CARS iz

at GREAT PRICES -

L]

Browse by Catagory v Sort by Date Posted | 20 results/page |
1 vehicles Homda City N Submit!
Model Price Cepreciation i te Emg Cap Mileage Wieh Type

Search Selection Honda City 2019 Awailable
Honda City 1.5A 5V £76,800 57480 fyr 10-Apr-2019 1,487 o 9,589 km Sedan Available

655, Loan Amownt Avaiable As Advertisad) 1 Crmer Onky! Meticulously Wall Maintained Unit That Comes With A 5 Years Warranty & Fre...

Craative Auto

Save this search oriteria, to gt email alerts whenever a mat 8 foung

Migche| Price Depreciation eq Diate Eng Cap Mileaga Veh Type

[30 w] results/page

For old advertisements, view Expirod ads

Haome  MNew Cars | Used Cars | Sell My Car = Directory | Products | Insurance | Article | Forum  Resources

Follow sgCarMart.com

About Us | Careers | Contact Us | Sitemap  Terms of Service | Privacy Palicy | Personal Data Protection Statement
£2004-2020 sgCarMart. All nghts reserved.

Compare

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?RGD=2019&MOD=Honda City&RPG=20&VEH=0...  09-Mar-20



VD HONDA

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.
(A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)
Senvice and Body Repair

Tel: +685 6641 3838

Website! www.honda.com._sg

For 24-hours Roadside Assistance, Call 38203838

QUOTATION

GST Reg No.: M200050223
Company Ref. No.; S60FC1380G

Customer . GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Document No. + SQT20001018 Page 1
3 TEMASEK AVENUE Date : 2. Mar 2020
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Customer No. « WZG001
SINGAPORE 039190 Svc Advisor . LIEW THYE WEI
Registration No - SKNSTA0R Engine No - L15Z16205303
Chassis No » MRHGMEEEOKTO00471 Date | Time 2. Mar 2020 11:29:54 AM
Model . CITY 1.55V CVT 2018 (EUROC &) Surveyor Name
Owner's Name + LIM YU-WEN JOEL Survey Date
Ins Policy No. : Authorisation Date
Date of Accident  : 1/3/2020
0% GST Amount
Item __Description Qty  Unit Price  Disc % Amount Amount _incld GST
TP DIRECT SETTLEMENT (J/INO: )
OWNER: LIM YU-WEN JOEL
OWNER INSURER: LIBERTY INSURANCE PTE LTD
ACC DATE: 1/3/2020
SURVEYED BY:
DATE:
REF NO:
TP INSURER: GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE
TP VEH: FBN 9745C
71501-T9A-T202Z  FACE, RR. BUMPER o 1 46370 — 25 MTTT 2434 37211
71505-T9D-K00 GARNISH, RR. BUMPER CENTER %/ 1 2490 — 25 18.67 — 1.31 19,98
71593-T9A-J00 SPACER R.RR.BUMPER SIDE 4 +] 1 1150 [ 25 8.62 0.60 5.22
71598-T9A-J0O SPACERL.RR.BUMPER SIDE 4 /] 1 150 & 25 8.62 0.60 9.22
91505-TM8-003 CLIPBUMPER  A_2A 4 230 — 25 §.90— 048 7.38
75722-T9A-T10 EMBLEM, RR. CITY  /LLa 1 1270~ 25 9527 067 10.19
75701-T9C-000 EMBLEM H AAA 1 1230 = _ 25 9227 065 .87
75725-T9A-TOO EMBLEMRR IVTEC /LLA 1 1330 =" 28 a9z 070 10.67
Sum Item 419.29 29.35 448.64
BOSUN SUNDRIES AL 1 000 0 30.00 2.10 32.10
—— LEEFEET RR LIGHTING MECHANISMS, PERFORM : G = . 2%t —
— EE}MDUE, CHECK & INSTALL REVERSE SENSORS=4PES, Wi E— - e
BKRP02S it ALIGH ;‘f:‘"‘”E'“ & RENEW DAMAGE: 7 woooo P ZET Ttoo000 13300 203300
BPO3R ;ﬁ:“ F'A'“T;EE ON REPAIRED OR REPLACED AREAS. 0000 30 J 400000 13300  2033.00
2 Sum Labor 407000  284.90 4.354.90

Printed on 2/3/2020 1:26:37 PM
This is a computer ganarased invoice. Mo signature is required

Par prces ane subjectad 10 change wilhoul nobce,

The abowve eslimated cost of repair ¢o nol include any unioreseen damages

GST Amount (5 calculated from irdivicual line(s].
An amount of 353,50 {incl GST) will be apphcatie for the request of the abowe gquoistion for estimates above 52,000.00.
However, If the repairs are subssguently done al Kah kotor Co. Sdn. Bhd, |t will be reflunded



VU HONDA

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.
(A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)
Service and Body Repair

Ted: +65 6841 3838

Wehsite: www honda.com.sg

Eor 24-hours Roadside Assistance, Call 3203838

QUOTATION

GST Reg No: M200050223
Company Ref. No.: SE0FC1380G

Customer

Registration No
Chassis No
Model

Owner's Name
Ins Policy No.

. GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

3 TEMASEK AVENUE
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER
SINGAPORE 039180

: SKNSTI0R

: MRHGMEEE0KTDO0471

. CITY 1.58V CVT 2018 (EURD B)
. LIM YU-WEM JOEL

: 1/372020

Document No. + SOT20001018 Page 2
Date + 2. Mar 2020

Customer No. : WZG001

Svc Advisor - LIEW THYE WEI

Engine No « L15216205303

Date | Time 2. Mar 2020 11:29:54 AM
Surveyor Name :

Survey Date :

Authorisation Date

0% GST Amount

Qty __Unit Price_Disc % Amount Amount  incld GST

Date of Accident
E_g*rn Description 2
Survey By nAer st _f M‘" L
Date & Time 9/3/ 20

__._.—-'-."
Excess - 7
Status A/ -"?L W L
Signature

LZ‘AA{RH fﬁéA}%/

5- %cf?s'.

Total Amount  4,489.29, 31425 480354
Total (Inclusive of GST) 4,803.54

Printed on 2/3/2020 1:26:37 PM

This i5 a compuied ganeraled inwice. Na gigoature s required

Part prices ame sulbjeciad o change without notice.

Tha abova satimaled cost o repair do nol includa any unloresesn damagas

G5T Amount is calculaied from mdheadual line{s).

A armount od $53,.50 fincl GST) will be applicable for the request of e abowe gualaton for esbmales above 52 00000

Hoeeer, i tha repairs pne subsequenily done al Kah Mobor Co. Sdn. Bhd, A Wi be refunded.



J HONDA.

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.
(A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)

370 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408651. Tel; +65 6841 3883 Fax; +65 6741 5022
255 Alenandra Road Singapore 150037, Tel: +65 6471 5458 Fax: +65 6471 5460

SERVICE PRE-INVOICE

GST Reg No.: M200050223
Company Rel. No.: SE0FC1380G

Custoemar: CUD117268 | GREAT AMERICAN Document Ne: SVO20015565
Chassis No: MRHGMBEE0KTOD047T1 Printed By: TWLIEW
License No: SKNSTIOR Order Date: 9. March 2020
Mileage: 8510 Order Time: 9:26:43 AM
Engine No: L156Z216206303 Service Advisor: LIEW THYE WEI
TEM DESCRIPTION QT UNIT DISC% AMOUNT amost Ameum™ifes
TP DIRECT SETTLEMENT (J/NO; 74458}
OWNER: LIM YU-WEN JOEL
OWNER INSURER; LIBERTY INSURANCE PTE LTD
ACC DATE: 1/2/2020
SURVEYED BY: MARCUS
DATE: DS/03/2020 @ 089.15AM
REF NO; GLMOMVMODO000556
TP INSURER: GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE
TP VEH: FBN 87450
71501-T9A-T202Z FACE, RR. BUMPER 17" 48370 25 U777 2434 372.41
71505-T9D-K00 GARNISH, RR. BUMPER CENTER 1/ 2490 25 18.67 1.31 19.88
91505-TMB-003 CLIP BUMPER 47 230 25 8.90 0.48 7.38
75722-TOA-T10 EMBLEM, RR. CITY 1/ 1270 25 8.52 0.67 10.19
75701-T9C-000 EMBLEM H 1/ 1230 25 9.22 D65 .87
75725-T9A-T00 EMBLEMRR.IVTEC 1./ 1330 25 8.87 D70 10.67
SUM PARTS: 402.05 28.15 430.20
BOSUN 0780 1/ 2000 20,00 1,40 21.40
SUNDRIES
BMLDZI EXT-YJ 1 / 100,00 100.00 7.00 107.00
INSPECT RR LIGHTING MECHANISMS,
PERFORM WATER
TEST.(N)
BAOZR EXT-YJ 1 / 140.00 140,00 5.80 148,80
REMOVE, CHECK & INSTALL REVERSE
SENSORS-4 PCS (N)
BKRPOZS EXT-YJ 14 975.00 575.00 B6.25 1,043.25
STRAIGHTEN ALIGN RR PANEL &
RENEW DAMAGE PARTS.
BPO3IR EXT-YBH 1 /1,300.00 1,300.00 51.00 1,391,00
SPRAY PAINTING ON REPAIRED OR
REPLACED AREAS.(3P)
SUM LABOUR:  2,535.00  {77.45 2,712.45
TOTAL SGD  2,937.05 20580 3,142.65
Total Payable (SGD) 3,142.85

GET Amount is calculaled Fom individual Yna(s)



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

o §1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 189607198R GST Reg. No. 18-86071 98-~

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref :  CS/GAIZ0003482/Utf3s2
DT CENTERAL T
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Date: 18-03-2020
SINGAPORE 039190
Code: GAl
1s Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. FBN 9745C Veh. Inspected SKN 5790R
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CLMOMVMOD00000558 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From KELVYMNA NGIAN Assign Date 02/03/2020
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA CITY (A) c.C 1497
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2019
Chassis No. MRHGMEEE0KTO00471 Colour GREY
Odometer 008510 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre 185/55 R18 BRIDGESTONE 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/55 R16 BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |1B85/55R16 BRIDGESTONE 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 185/55 R16 BRIDGESTONE & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. _ General Information
Accident Date  01/03/2020 Inspection Date 09/03/2020
Survey held at KAHMOTOR CO SDN BERHAD
15 UBI ROAD 4
SINGAPORE 408610
5a. : Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A'WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKN 5790R

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933

Page Mo.:1 of 1

Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =8 rk;hop?;}] “J}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FACE, RR. BUMPER (SHN) DENTED 34777 M7TV
1|GARNISH, RR. BUMPER CENTER (SN) BENT 18 67 18.67
1|8PACER R RR.BUMPER SIDE (SN) NOT NECESSARY B62 -
1|SPACERL RR.BUMPER SIDE (SN) MOT NECESSARY 8.62 -
4|CLIP, BUMPER (SN) MECESSARY £.90 6.90
1|EMBLEM, RR. CITY (SN) MECESSARY 952 952
1|EMEBLEM H (SM) NECESSARY 022 g.22
1|EMBLEMRR.I-WVTEC (SN} MECESSARY 9497 9.97
1|SUNDRIES (SN) MECESSARY 30.00 20.00
44929 42205
LABOUR
INSPECT RR LIGHTING MECHANISMS., PERFORM 100.00 100.00
WATER.
REMOVE, CHECK & INSTALL REVERSE SENSORS. 140.00 140.00
STRAIGHTEMN ALIGN RR PANEL & RENEW DAMAGE 1,900.00 g975.00
PARTS.
SPRAY PAINTING ON REPAIRED OR REPLACED AREAS. 1,800.00 1,300.00
4.040.00 2,515.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,489.29 2,937.05
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 2,937.05|

Report Ref No. CS/GAI20003492/Utf3s2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

ISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Raport is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the frant page of this Reparn.

WWWWWWW
Beport, in whals ar in part, does so at his or her own rsk.



