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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Tan Alan <atautoconsultant@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 June 2020 3:37 pm

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Finalize PC 3355B

Hi Sun Pin, 

 

We are agreeable to accept the lump sum COR offer @$1100 and 02 repair days, thank you. 

 

Rgds 

Alan 

 

On Wed, Jun 3, 2020 at 3:23 PM Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Sir, 

  

Kindly refer the finalize amount $1,100. Repair day 2 days. (P/P, before gst). 

  

Please confirm the COR by return email. 

  

Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
  
LKK Auto Consultants 
  
Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

 

 

 

--  

Rgds 

Alan Tan 

83868989 

A T Auto Consultant 


