Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 28 February 2020 4:50 pm

To: ‘Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; assignments

Cc: '‘Gnoh, Pau Loong’; 'Henry, Irene James'; SUR

Subject: RE: Ref: CMTD2000787/GPL RE: 2 Days notice: PC 8095 T (Our Ref) and FBG 791 P (Your

Ref) Dated 19th February 2020

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards
G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin [mailto:melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 28 February 2020 4:42 PM

To: TeamAutoPro North; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments

Cc: Gnoh, Pau Loong; Henry, Irene James

Subject: RE: Ref: CMTD2000787/GPL RE: 2 Days notice: PC 8095 T (Our Ref) and FBG 791 P (Your Ref) Dated 19th
February 2020

Dear Peach,

We will appoint LKK Auto to conduct the survey.

Dear LKK Auto,

Please make the arrangement to survey for PC8095T and revert with your preliminary report upon completion of survey
to my colleague, Pau Loong.

Best Regards

Melvin Ye

Claims Division

D: 6322 4667 | T: 6461 6555
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From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 28 February, 2020 3:24 PM

To: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Cc: Gnoh, Pau Loong <PauLoong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: Re: Ref: CMTD2000787/GPL RE: 2 Days notice: PC 8095 T (Our Ref) and FBG 791 P (Your Ref) Dated 19th
February 2020

Dear Sirs,
With reference to your list of surveyors, we are agreeable with the appointment of Mr Lim - LKK as the SJE for subject claim.

Kindly note our personnel in charge for the survey as follows:-

Contact Person Eric Lee 8269 9999

Email Address teamautogl@gmail.com
Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Singapore 575722

Thank you for your kind attention to our request.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Peach Ang



Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

On Fri, Feb 28, 2020 at 3:17 PM Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye @sompo.com.sg> wrote:

Our Reference : CMTD2000787/GPL

Without Prejudice

Date: 28/02/2020

Attention:

TEAM AUTOPRO PTE LTD

Dear Peach,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC8095T & FBG791P ON 19.02.2020

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 28/02/2020.

Please be informed that Mr Gnoh Pau Loong is the handler of this case.
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We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct the
joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as

Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 | LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 | Priority Services Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

Jeffery Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of the
pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards

Melvin Ye
Claims Division

D: 6322 4667 | T: 6461 6555

LV @ SOMPO A century of Trust
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From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 28 February, 2020 2:56 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: 2 Days notice: PC 8095 T (Our Ref) and FBG 791 P (Your Ref) Dated 19th February 2020

Dear Sir/Madam,

Road Traffic Accident Involving PC 8095 T (Our Ref) and FBG 791 P (Your Ref)

Dated 19 February 2020, Time around 15;15HRS

@ BEDOK SOUTH ROAD



We represent our client ; TONG HAI TRANSPORT & SERVICES, to notify you of the aforesaid road traffic accident
involving our client’s vehicle registration number: PC 8095 T and your insured’s vehicle registration number: FBG 791
P.

Kindly send us your list of at least ten (10) motor surveyors, via email to the following personnel:-

Contact Person Eric Lee 8269 9999
Email Address teamautopl@gmail.com
Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Thank you for your attention to this email and we look forward to your earliest reply.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Peach Ang

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
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Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
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