Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Cheng Huat <tanch@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>
Sent: Monday, 22 June 2020 4:24 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Cc: Lai Bee Yin; Seah Wan Er

Subject: RE: SME 9660E - Finalize

Hi All,

The following is confirmed:

Finalize COR $5063. 15 before GST @ 10 working days.
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Tan Cheng Huat

Technical Officer

INDECO ENGINEERS PTE LTD
(A member of the CWT Group)

DID +65 63822736 Fax +65 63822817 www.indeco.cwtlimited.com

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This communication is meant only for the addressee(s) named above and may contain information, which is confidential
and/or legally privileged. If you are not the named addressee(s), or the agent responsible for receiving and delivering this communication to the
named addressee(s), this communication has been sent to you in error. If so, kindly contact us immediately for retrieval purposes. Unauthorized
dissemination, distribution, copying or reliance on this communication is prohibited and may attract criminal penalties. Thank you.

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 June, 2020 5:50 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>; Tan Cheng Huat <tanch@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>
Cc: Lai Bee Yin <bylai@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>; Seah Wan Er <weseah@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>
Subject: RE: SME 9660E - Finalize

Dear Mr Tan,

Can we confirm?

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will
be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 June 2020 6:04 PM

To: Tan Cheng Huat <tanch@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@I|kkauto.com>; Lai Bee Yin <bylai@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>; Seah Wan Er
<weseah@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>

Subject: [F] % : SME 9660E - Finalize




Hi Tan,

Finalize COR $5063.15 before GST @ 10 working days.

Regards,

Guo Qiang

R : Tan Cheng Huat <tanch@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>

RIEmE]: 20206 H 15H 15:24

ek A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ikkauto.com>

#3%: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Lai Bee Yin <bylai@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>; Seah Wan Er
<weseah@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>

ZE: RE: SME 9660E - Finalize

Hi Guo Qiang,

Waiting for your confirmation of finalised costs.
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Tan Cheng Huat

Technical Officer

INDECO ENGINEERS PTE LTD
(A member of the CWT Group)

DID +65 63822736 Fax +65 63822817 www.indeco.cwtlimited.com

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This communication is meant only for the addressee(s) named above and may contain information, which is confidential
and/or legally privileged. If you are not the named addressee(s), or the agent responsible for receiving and delivering this communication to the
named addressee(s), this communication has been sent to you in error. If so, kindly contact us immediately for retrieval purposes. Unauthorized
dissemination, distribution, copying or reliance on this communication is prohibited and may attract criminal penalties. Thank you.

From: Tan Cheng Huat

Sent: Thursday, 11 June, 2020 3:15 PM

To: 'Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)' <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@I|kkauto.com>; Lai Bee Yin <bylai@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>; Seah Wan Er
<weseah@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>

Subject: RE: SME 9660E - Finalize

Hi Guo Qiang,

Attached is the updated repair estimates inclusive of the roof items prices (previously waiting for overseas parts
prices).



Also attached is the earlier surveyed repair estimates.
Please confirm finalised costs.

Thank you.

Waarmesr Regards

Tan Cheng Huat

Technical Officer

INDECO ENGINEERS PTE LTD
(A member of the CWT Group)

DID +65 63822736 Fax +65 63822817 www.indeco.cwtlimited.com

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This communication is meant only for the addressee(s) named above and may contain information, which is confidential
and/or legally privileged. If you are not the named addressee(s), or the agent responsible for receiving and delivering this communication to the
named addressee(s), this communication has been sent to you in error. If so, kindly contact us immediately for retrieval purposes. Unauthorized
dissemination, distribution, copying or reliance on this communication is prohibited and may attract criminal penalties. Thank you.

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) [mailto:GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 29 May, 2020 5:19 PM

To: Tan Cheng Huat <tanch@sg.indeco.cwtlimited.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: SME 9660E - Finalize

Hi Tan,

Please provide parts price for finalize, thanks.

Regards,

Guo Qiang



