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SLUBLAVE 1, #0125 PAYA UBI INDUSTRI

AL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (65} 62563561 FAX @ (065) 62564315

Your Ref: CMTD2000897/GPL Date: 11" March 2020
Our Ref: CSISMOZUU{HBEJIEgd3 Without Prejudice

The Motor Claims Department
Sompo Insurance

Attn; Grace
Dear Sirs'Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO,_SKV 722D .

We thank you for the instruction on _28/02/2020.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 10/03/2020 at the premises of M/s MOVA AUTOMOTIVE and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8% 2.967.96
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 2.101.86
“Check” Items Amount : 8% 372.60
Market Value : 8% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -
Nett Value : 5% -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the

rear o/s portion.

Comments’ Present Status:

Damages consistent.

Days of repair: 4 days.
We have not authorized repair.

Yours faithfully

Steve
Automobile Assessor



Nivitha {LKK Auto)

From: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 28 February 2020 12:20 PM

To: Mitha; assignments; sur@lkkauto.com

Ce: Henry, Irene James; Gnoh, Pau Loong

Subject: FW: CMTD2000897/GPL  RE: TP CLAIMS - SKV722D AGAINST PC4843C DOA
26/02/20

Attachments: WinZip Compressed Attachments.zip

Without Prejudice
Dear Nitha,

We will appoint LKK Auto to conduct the survey on a without Prejudice Basis.

Dear LKK Auto,

Please make the arrangement to survey for SKV722D on a without Prejudice Basis and revert with your preliminary
report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Pau Loong.

Best Regards
Melvin Ye

Claims Division
D: 6322 4667 | T: 6461 6555

@) SOMPO ' A century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook com!SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase® via Sompo 5G

Download now @ App e

‘For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance |  For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the personis) or company named and may contain confidential
and/ar legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure. copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents {acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Nitha <nitha@mova.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 28 February, 2020 11:43 AM



To: Ye, Yeng Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Ce: tanyw@mova.com.sg; 'AVRIL HO' <avril@mova.com.sg>; Gnoh, Pau Loong <Pauloong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>;
Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: CMTD2000897/GPL RE: TP CLAIMS - SKV722D AGAINST PC4843C DOA 26/02/20

Dear Melvin ,
Kindly assign LEK,
Thank you,

Best Regards,
Nutha

Claims Officer

Mova Autamative Ple Litd
Tel B272 3892 Fax: B270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automolive Ple Ltg

From: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin [mailto:melvin.ye@sompo.com.sq]
Sent: Friday, 28 February 2020 11:17 AM

To: Nitha
Cc: tanyw@mova.com.sq; 'AVRIL HO'; Gnoh, Pau Loong; Henry, Irene James
Subject: Ref: CMTD2000897/GPL RE: TP CLAIMS - SKV722D AGAINST PC4843C DOA 26/02/20

Qur Reference: CMTD2000897/GPL
Your Reference:; SKV722D

Without Prejudice

Date: 28.02.2020

Attention:
MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD
Dear Nitha,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5KV722D & PC4843C ON 26.02,2020

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 27,/02/2020.

Please be informed that Mr Gnoh Pau Loong is the handler of this case.
We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your

client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)

2



1 | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng

Kenneth Kong (North
2 | LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 | Priority Services limmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

leffery Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards
Melvin Ye
Claims Division

D: 6322 4667 | T. 6451 6555

—

L SOMPO A century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place. #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase® via Sompao 5G

#  Dgwrnbpad on R . CATmON
Download now @ ' App Store or P, Gﬂogicplay

Yror Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
andfor legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If yau are not the intended recipient, please delete this message

Privacy Policy Motice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple, Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf), Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Nitha <nitha@mova.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 28 February, 2020 11:14 AM




To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey @sompo.com.sg>

Ce: tanyw@mova.com.sg; 'AVRIL HO' <avril@mova.com sg>
Euhject: TP CLAIMS - SKV722D AGAINST PC4843C DOA 26/02/20

Dear All,
Kindly advise officer in charge and assign surveyor for the above mention case,

Thank you

Best Regards,
Nutha

Claims Officer
Mowva Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel 6272 3852 Fax; 6270 B314

@MOVA ¢ o

Autlomolive Ple Lid



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAute)

Sent: Wednesday, 11 March 2020 2:27 PM

To: Gnoh, Pau Loong

Cc: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: Direct Settle ; RE: CMTD2000897/GPL  RE: TP CLAIMS - SKV722D AGAINST
PCAB43C DOA 26/02/20

Attachments: CS5M0O20003323Eqd3.pdf

Dear Mr Gnoh,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of 5KV 722D.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Gnoh, Pau Loong <Pauloong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 28 February 2020 2:33 PM

To: 'AVRIL HO' <avril@mova.com.sg>

Cc: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.coms: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settle ; RE: CMTD2000897/GPL RE: TP CLAIMS - SKNV722D AGAINST PCA843C DOA 26/02/20

Dear Avril,

With reference above, we would like to Direct Settle and please arrange / liaise with agreed SJE, M/s LKK AUTO for
survey / finalization,

By copy to M/s LKK AUTO,

Please assist above, thank you.

Best Regards

Gnoh Pau Loong

Claims Division

D: 6329 5217 | T, 6461 6555

L @ SOMPO A century of Trust

INSURAN CE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sqg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase’ via Sompo 5G



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner 1D;

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Male:

YVehicle Model:

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year;

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Mar 2020

Company
167N

SKNT22D

Mo

10 Mar 2020
TOYOTA

CAMRY 2.5 AUTO
Silver

2015

ZARUZ229382
MRO53AK 5004009397
133.0 kW (178 bhp)
$29,170.00

17 Aug 2015

17 Aug 2015

4]

$32,838.00

Yes
16 Aug 2025
$24,628.00

16 Aug 2025

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

%65,501.00

$£35,585.00

£40,213.00

1M



@MOVA

I f = Main ﬂfl‘ice
¥ : ) I | o i
Page # | ' {65] E-ﬂﬁ éadd
Ueh # SKU?EED . W -:':l_r i l'I:L
28/02/2020 Wurksl'_!n_;f I:I.ng:
Veh Model - TOYOTA CAMRY sy
SOMPO INSU ;
50 RAFFLES PLACE ) |1 (65) 6272 3802
#05-01/06 SINGAPORE LAND TOWER Claim# - (66) 6270 8314
SINGAPORE 048623. ACC. Date - 26/02/20
Terms - C.OD Days
Attention - XAD18 Remarks -
Mo, Description City U.Price Amounts 53
LIST ITEMS : o
1. REARBOOT-REPAR = | 1 ec
2. REARBOOT LOGO (CAMRY) - /™ 1 PC B8 60 68.607
3. REARBOOT LOGO (2 5; - 1 PC 55.70 55.70
4 REARBUMPER 1 PG 79671 E*"H % 736.71
5.  BUMPERCLIPS - o 10 PG 480 777 4800
6.  REAR BUMPER BRACKETRH -~ [/ 1 PC 124.80 124.80
7. REAREND PANEL -REPAIR + | 1 PC
8. END PANEL TOP GARNISH - CHECK * MM (C.f[ 1 FC
9. REARREINFORCEMENT T - Of] J’ W03 db ¢ pe 196.80 3957 496,80
LIST TOTAL S§ ' 7 } 1,530.61
25% DISCOUNT S§ Jj - 382 65
1,147.96
SPECIAL NET ITEMS : A S
1 REAR PARKING SENSOR -~ || 1 PC 774/ 25000 250.00
SPECIAL NET TOTAL S§ 250.00
LABOUR : 99439
TO REPAIR REAR END PANEL, REAR BOOT, TO [ ;
REMOVE & REPLACE ALL ACCIDENT DAMAGED AREAS =8
TO STRAIGHTEN ON ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS y S 800.00
TO SPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT DAMAGED AREAS 144
(PEARL WHITE) Yy : 700.00
2T64.49
TO REMOVE REAR SIDE TRIM BOARD L+R, SPARE s
TYRE & OTHER ATTACHMENT PARTS | {] _rJ Bel ©7 150.00
=) ] :
TO RUST PROOF ON ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS I 40.00
{ ki o
TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR PARKING SENSOR = 13 79 40.00
TO INSPECT REAR TAILLAMP WATER LEAKAGE TEST 70  40.00

LABOUR TOTAL 5%

1.570.00



Estimate

28/02/2020

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTELTD
50 RAFFLES PLACE

#05-01/06 SINGAPORE LAND TOWER
SINGAPORE 048623.

Page #

Veh #

Veh Model -
Estimates :

Claim #
ACC. Date :

n

@MOVA

Automotive

Main Office:
Morea Buildin 0

Mo, 22 ar-Kilang,

1 137710 Tol: (65) 64763333
Fax: [B5) 621 58491

WAL MO 0T 50

Singapore 158419

SKvV722D
TOYOTA CAMRY

Workshop Dept:
| 1008

CK420453

Singapor o
Tel: (65) 62723892

Fax: (B5) 62708314

26/02/20

Terms = GO0 Days
Attention - XA018 Remarks -
No.  Description Oty U.Price Amounts 5%

E.&0E

NON-TAX AMOUNT §
AMOUNT S§
GST@ 7 %

2,967.96

AMOUNT DUE S%

Customer's Signature/Co. Stamp MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

wonsullants hence notify
r of the ."-'.'-’--'u.-a'lr-g:

. spray painting
: during resurvey
Tiaticn
t Prejudice” basis
I il 5 alicwed
" Supp : e -"“He'iiﬂﬂ
=+ 3l pproval lrom imsurance Company

Acknowledged by Repainer
Signature:
Date:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 4089233
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 5258 4315
Reg. No: 199607 158R GS5T Reg. No. 19-0607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref . C5/SMO20003323/Eqd3n2
50 RAFFLES PLACE
#05-01/06 Date: 01-04-2020

SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623

Code: SMO
1. Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. PC 4843C Veh. Inspected SKV 7220
Policy No. Coverage (8) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD2000897/GPL Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From YE YONG KANG MELVIN Assign Date 28/02/2020
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA CAMRY c.C 2454
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. MROS3AKS004009397 Colour SILVER
Odometer 101203 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOCD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Frant Tyre |215/55 R17 ¥ OKOHAMA, 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/55R17 YOKOHAMA 5mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/55R17 YOKOHAMA 5mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/55 R17 YOKOHAMA 5mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/02/2020 Inspection Date 10/0372020
Survey held at MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/06/08 .
SINGAPORE 158722
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

4 Working Days




y

sl Bna B

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199807198R G5T Reg. No. 19-9807198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKV T22D
= Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BOOT (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE - -
LABOUR
1|REAR BOOT LOGO (CAMRY) MECESSARY 68.60 68.60
1|REAR BOOT LOGO (2.5) NECESSARY 55.70 55.70
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED 736.71 691.76
10|BUMPER CLIPS @%4.80 NECESSARY 48.00 30.00
1|REAR BUMPER BRACKET RH BROKEN 124.80 124,80
1|REAR END PANEL [MPA) TO REPAIR SEE - -
LABOUR
1|END PANEL TOP GARNISH (NPA) NOT NECESSARY - o
1|REAR REINFORCEMENT DENTED 496 80 305.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -382.65 -341.47
1,147.96 1,024.39
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR PARKING SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 250.00 200.00
250.00 200,00
LABOUR
TO REPAIR REAR END PANEL. REAR BOOT,TO REMOVE 600.00 500.00
& REFLACE ALL ACCIDENT DAMAGED AREAS.TO
STRAIGHTEN ON ACCIDENT DAMAGED
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR BOOT AND
REAR END PAMNEL.
TC SPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT DAMAGED AREAS 700.00 500.00
(PEARL WHITE).
TO REMOVE REAR SIDE TRIM BOARD L+R, SPARE TYRE 150.00 50.00
& OTHER ATTACHMENT PARTS.
TO RUST PROOF ON ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS. 40.00 30.00
TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR PARKING SENSOR, 40.00 30.00
TO INSPECT REAR TAILLAMP WATER LEAKAGE TEST. 40.00 30.00
1,5670.00 1,140.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,967.96 2,364.39

Report Ref No. C5/5SMO20003323/Eqd3n2




' ’d 74

ada an »

Page No.:2 of 2

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

1,900.00

Report Ref No, C5/SM0O20003323/Eqd3n2

% % g‘
CHEN TSUE YEE ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Automotive Assessor B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart is made solaly for the uss and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Repon,
Any thied party wha B i




