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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 21 May 2020 5:33 PM

To: GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE LTD; Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLC 2671S DOA : 08/02/2020

Hi Don, 

 

Please submit the documents to Sompo insurance directly. 

 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 

related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6271-0351 | email:  sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-

25 | S(408933) 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE LTD <claims@goldautoworks.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 21 May 2020 3:22 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SLC 2671S DOA : 08/02/2020 

 

Hi Mr Rasul, 

 

Please advise me LOD i email to who? 

 

Best Regards, 

Don Wang 

 

GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE. LTD. 

48 TOH GUAN ROADS ENTERPRISE HUB, #01-119 SINGAPORE 608586 

(TEL) 62640995    (FAX) 62645948 

(Email) claims@goldautoworks.com.sg     (Website)  

https://goldautoworks.com.sg/ 

 

 

*STRICTLY CONFIDENTIAL* 

 

This message, its contents and any files transmitted with it are intended SOLELY for the addressee(s) and may be 

legally privileged and/or confidential. Access by any other party is unauthorised without the express written 

permission of the sender. If you have received this message in error, you may not copy or use the contents, 

attachments or information in any way. Please destroy it and contact us immediately via e-mail return. This message 

has been prepared using information believed by the author to be reliable and accurate; we make no warranty as to 

its accuracy or completeness. We do not accept responsibility for changes made to this message after it was sent. 

 

***********************************************************************************************

*********************************************************************** 
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**WARNING: Computer viruses can and/or may be transmitted via email.  

Kindly check and ensure that all emails received from our firm ends with the domain @goldautoworks.com.sg 

before acting on them. When and/or if unsure, please contact us to verify. Please note that the company accepts no 

liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email. 

 

 

 

On 2020-05-21 14:08, GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE LTD wrote: 

> Hi Mr Rasul, 

>  

> I would like to accept this $2200 lum sum repair with 04 working days. 

>  

> Best Regards, 

> Don Wang 

>  

> GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE. LTD. 

> 48 TOH GUAN ROADS ENTERPRISE HUB, #01-119 SINGAPORE 608586 

> (TEL) 62640995    (FAX) 62645948 

> (Email) claims@goldautoworks.com.sg     (Website)  

> https://goldautoworks.com.sg/ 

>  

>  

> *STRICTLY CONFIDENTIAL* 

>  

> This message, its contents and any files transmitted with it are  

> intended SOLELY for the addressee(s) and may be legally privileged  

> and/or confidential. Access by any other party is unauthorised without  

> the express written permission of the sender. If you have received  

> this message in error, you may not copy or use the contents,  

> attachments or information in any way. Please destroy it and contact  

> us immediately via e-mail return. This message has been prepared using  

> information believed by the author to be reliable and accurate; we  

> make no warranty as to its accuracy or completeness. We do not accept  

> responsibility for changes made to this message after it was sent. 

>  

> ********************************************************************** 

> ********************************************************************** 

> ************************** 

>  

> **WARNING: Computer viruses can and/or may be transmitted via email. 

> Kindly check and ensure that all emails received from our firm ends  

> with the domain @goldautoworks.com.sg before acting on them. When  

> and/or if unsure, please contact us to verify. Please note that the  

> company accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus  

> transmitted by this email. 

>  

> On 2020-05-21 13:27, Rasul (LKKAuto) wrote: 

>> Hi Don, 

>>  

>> As spoken, refer to attachment 

>>  

>> Take note that the parts lists price for Mercedes benz model is 10%  

>> instead of 5%. 

>>  

>> Finalised amount is $ 2,200 / 4 days of lump sum repair 
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>>  

>> Kindly confirm 

>>  

>> Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should  

>> be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in  

>> softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

>>  

>> Best Regards, 

>>  

>> RASUL | Assessor 

>>  

>> LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 

>>  

>> Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

>>  

>> Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

>>  

>> _SAVE THE EARTH. PRINT ONLY WHEN NECESSARY._ 

 


