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Mivitha (LKK Auto)

T — ——— — L
From: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 27 February 2020 12:33 PM
To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR; Loganathan Agoram
Subject: FW: Accident vehicle between our insured SMR9416BT and your insured SJV103C
on 25/02/2020 || C10005630
Attachments: SMR9416R.pdf; SIV103C.pdf

Hi Team,
We would like to arrange TP PRS for SMR9416B. They have chosen Mr. Adrian Ling to survey the mentioned vehicle.

Workshop information:

Ace Auto Solution

Hp : 9189 2617 / Fax : 6844 5185

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01 (South Wing), 5'pore 415933

Please confirm. Thank you.
Regards,

Ivy Ratilla
Executive, Claims Admin

T +65 6540 2185
F +65 6725 0853
E ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.s

aulo J‘:general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
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.confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is
for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the
stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may
be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use,
interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

From: Ace Auto Solution <aceautosolution@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 February 2020 11:46 AM

To: lvy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Loganathan Agoram <loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Subject: Re: Accident vehicle between our insured SMR9416BT and your insured SIV103C on 25/02/2020 |
C10005690

Hi Ivy,
We would like to appoint Adrian Ling LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd as the single joint expert for this accident case.

Thanks & Regards

Suhaimi / Service Advisor

Aca Aute Solufion

Hp : 9189 2617 / Fax : 6544 5185

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01 (South Wing), S'pore 415933

Plaase note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury elalm (if any) of the owner
claimant.

From: Ace Auto Solution <aceautosolution@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 February 2020 8:49 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Fwd: Accident vehicle between our insured SMR9416BT and your insured S/V103C on 25/02/2020

Dear Sir

We are instructed by Alpine Car Rental Pte Ltd to notify you of a road traffic accident on 25/02/2020 at
about 0745 at North Buona Vista involving our client’s/customer’s vehicle registration number
SMR9416B and vehicle registration number SJV103C driven by you at the material time. A copy of the
Singapore accident statement/traffic police report filed is enclosed.

As a result of the accident, our client’s/customer’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client/we proceed
to repair the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether
you or your insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply
from you within the stipulated timeline, our client/we shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further
reference to you.
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We look forward in having a direct settlement and request that one of the following named survey
companies be appointed as the single joint expert as finalization/processing of the claims after
finalization are done promptly.

1)
2)
3)

Thanks & Regards

Suhaimi / Service Advisor

Ace Auto Solution

Hp : 9189 2617 ! Fax ; 6844 5185

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01 (South Wing), S'pore 415933

Flaase note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal Injury claim {if any) of the ownerf
claimant.

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited,
Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee.
The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not
reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are
not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or
disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the
sender and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services
Pte. Limited, Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the
intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated
author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It
may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived
and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended
addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant
that this email is error or virus free.



WAL PEOOZ4B5E | Alpine Molors Pa Lid = HQ
EMTRY DATE & TIME: 2602020 15:57
SUBMITTED BY: Mohd Suhaimi Bin Mohd Suadi Ong

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please repor corractly the detads of the accident to speed up the claims process,

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder andior the Authorised Drlver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any willul misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow Ingurance companies o

repudiate policy lability.

4, The issus and acceptance of this Form by Insurance companies is nat an admission of pelicy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

5, Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Aszsociation of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and thal capies of this report will, lor & fae, ba made available upon application by interested partes, _
7. By the kodgement of this report lo the insurers, you heraby consent to the archiving of this report a1 the centre and to copies of the repart being made available

aforosaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

25/02/2020 15:57
25/02/2020 07:45
NORTH BUONA VISTA
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Mumber
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registerad Owner
Co Reg Mo

Email Address

Mabile Phone No

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair ta your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

MName of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleat Policy

Policy Number

Cover Mole Mumber

Driver

MName of Driver

Passport No/FIN

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

SMR94168

ALPINE CAR RENTAL PTELTD
1XEMHNXABIE
PHILLIP.PHANG@ALPINECARRENTAL.COM.5G

OFFICE-65113021

BMwW
216! GRAN TOURER HALOGEN LIGHT

PRIVATE USE

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE HIRE

NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-DPERATIVE LTD

COMPREHENSIVE
YES

CHEN SEAN CHUAN
GHHAHI14M

24/05M975

QUTDOOR

21/05/2012

7 YEARS AND 9 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-90664731

NOEMAIL

Page 1 of 9



Address 5 EVERTON, #08-28
Postcode

Was drivar an employee of the Insured's Company MO
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insurad OTHER - HIRER

Vehicle Registration Mumber of Driver's Own -
Vahicle 3

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Mumber of vehicles (including own vehicle)

involved in the accident 2
Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES
| hgva been appmached by ur_'iknr:rwn_parsnnisfl NO
solicitingf/offering accident claims assistance,

Mumber of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO SKETCH PLAN

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES

Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Vehicle Registration Number SV103C
Yehicle Make/Modal/Colour MISSAN f TEAMA 2.5L CVT
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
Mame of Drivar
NRIC/Passport Numbar
Contact Number
Addrass
Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Mature Of Damage
Mo. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Fage 2010



INVPORTANT NOTICH

.

1= Pledase iepatt corraciy the detads of the oot 1 speed up e vieian, [agass

2= This Torm must be comploted by the

i : . 4T ek gt b Erpalied B o b
3 - Infermation peovidod must be as nehfuland accerate os poible. vy valfol masraptesaiation o wethheldbg ol matesial
facts may allow insurance compinas to repudiate policy liability.
4. Theissue and acceptance al this i-orm by invseie el comapagivs i not o admission of pelicy fiataility o thee prartaf the dnsurans
companing. :

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Policn for investination.
G. The report will be torwarded by the insurors of T Gin Records Manapeneni Centre established by the Geneal Insurance

Assoclation af Singapore (GIA) Tor archiviap sod that eepies of this peport with for a fee be made avaiiable ugan application by
interested partios,

the report being made available aforesaid,
&, Consent under the Porsonal Data Protoction Act (PORA)
| understand, acknowdedpe, 2gree and consent et

2] My insuter, my workshop and Uw General Insurance Association of Singapure (“GIA") may/fare permitted to coliect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/persanal informistion seb out in this [Toim] and any other gerconal inforelion
provided by me ot possessod by my insurer {eoliectively the “Personal Infarmation”) and disclase and fransfor suzh
Persanal Infarmation 1o allmsurer(s) who have insured vehiciels) involved in this accident {all insurers} whao have insured
vehicle(s) Involved in this accident shall be eallectively teferred Lo oo the “lnsurers”), the Insurers’ lwyers/law fiems, the
Manetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant povernment agency/muthorlty (such as the police], fon the purpose(s)
of :

ti) procassing, handling and/or dealing with my claineg indeding the settlament of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating 1o the cdalms:

{ii} investigating the accident and/for my claims:
(ili} corrying out and/or cealing with my instructions or respending 1o any enguitles by me;

(iv) administering my clzims (including the mailing of correspondence, statements, invoices, reporis of notices to me,
which could involve disclosure of cortain personal data about mae to bring aboul delivery of the zame 2y well 25 on the
external cover af envelopes/mail packiges): andfor

{v] complying with applicable law in administering, precessing, handling andfor dealing with my clalms.{collectively the
“Purposes”™}

(b)  all insurer(s) whe have Insured vehidefs) involved in this secident and the Insurers’ lnwyers/law firms, mayfure permitted
Lo collect, wse, disclosc and/or process my Persenz! Informatian for one ar more of the above Purposes; and

(¢} my Personal infarmation mayfean be disclosed by any of the Insuress andfor Gia 1o their iitrd pany sorvice providers o
agentifincluding thelr lawyers/law firms), which may be sited autside of Singapore, for ens or more of the dbove Purposes,

(d]  my Personal Information will ato be collected and used Lo compile clalms histary for the purpate of fraud detoction,
investipation and management in proseat and all future elaims,

(e) theinformation so collected under () aliove may be shared / disclosed:

(] toallinsurers andfor any other third partias that assst in evaluating, investigating, controliing or managing fraud,
regulators, law enlorcement and government apencies 25 reasonabily required (or the purpases stated, or

{ii] for camplying with requirements under any repuiations, liws or court orders.
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Ace Auto Solution
Registration number : 53228991M
23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933

Repair Estimate

Date :
Reference: SMR94168
BMW. / 216l
: e
y k= LIGHT
To Whom It May Concern
Dear Sir,
RE: VEHICLE .:SMR9416B
CHASSIS NO.:WBABEV120205P79951
ENGINE NO.:45125888B38A15A
Name of insured .: Alpine Car Rental Pte Ltd
Date of accident.; 25/02/2020
We append hereunder the estimated cost of repairs to be carried out to the above vehicle.
Parts
No. Qty Part Description Price (SGD)
1 | ' |Rear Tailgate et § 189870
2 | 1 |Rear Windscreen pLit= $ 957.60 |
3 | 10 |Rear Tailgate Inner Trim Clips  *" ™ $ 80.00 |-
4 | 1 |Rear Tailgate Inner Weatherstrip " $ 250.80
5 | ' |RHR Taillamp __ #< $ 539.70
6 [ 1 |Rear Bumper jrw*« ! $ 1,620.40
7 | 19 |Rear Bumper Clips  Alc $ 80.00
8 | 1 |Rear Bumper Towing Cover A4 $ 65.10
9 | 1 |RHR Bumper Reflector < $ 78.70
10 | 2 |Reverse Sensor | Pt G - 5 66160
11 | 1 |Reverse Sensor Wiring Harness e Sa <o ] $ 1,548.50
12 | 1 |Rear Bumper Reinforcement Bar e A - B $ 530.70
13 | 1 |Rear End Panel e L $ 484.80
14 | 1 |Rear End Panel Trim __ AL¢ $ 85.00
15 | 6 |Rear End Panel Trim Clips /' “~ $ 48.00
16 | 1 |Rear Bumper Lower Aluminium Plate % 4 $ 98.70
% | 1 : $ 105.30

Rear Bumper Bracket Centre "o L&




i | e
18 Rear Bumper Bracket Centre .. L < 5 105.30
19 LHR Bumper Bracket 7~ $ 150.70
20 RHR Bumper Bracket ¢/ wc $ 150.70
21 LHR Bumper Bracket Lower [, , $ 124.30
22 RHR Bumper Bracket Lower - S 124.30
L1G4L 1D Parts Total: §  9,788.90
Less10%: $ 978.89
~ Total: $  8,810.01
Labour
Labour Description
No. Price (SGD)
Rear portion
To dismantle / renew the accident damaged portion,to panel
1 ; : : - : 5 1,200.00
= beating,reshape, straighten,orientate and align repair /replacement parts. -
2 Carry out spray painting on accident affected area 5 1.000.00
3 To conduct anti rust of under carriage tuff coat 3 80.00 |
To disconnect wire harness of electrical component to facilitate .
4 : : ; : - 50.00
- repairs,reconnect and check electrical function after repair
5 To remove and refix reverse sensor and conduct test 5 ‘IQD,UO" i
6 To conduct transfer of parts from old tailgate to new tailgate g 150.00°|
I To conduct water leakage test after repairs of vehicle g 50.00
8 To apply sealant to rear tail gate 3 80.00
9 To remove and refix rear tail gate windscreen $ 120.00
! 'ﬂ',l
Labour Total : § 2,830.00
Others
Other Description
No. Price (SGD)
Rear portion
1 Rear end panel insulation seal ) 5 120.00 |~
2 Rear floor panel insulation seal TJ fre S 100.00
3 Tailgate windscreen sealant e~ S 120.00 Lo
4 Tailgate windscreen solar film ¢ $ 220.00 |
L
o'\ Other Total: § 560.00
GRAND TOTAL: § 12,200.01



NB: THIS IS OMLY AN ESTIMATE AND SHOULD ADDITIONAL WORK BE FOUND NECESSARY TO BE CARRIED OUT IN THE
COURSE OF REPAIRS, EXTRA MATERIALS AND LABOUR COST WILL BE CHARGED ACCORDINGLY WHICH HOWEWVER, YOU
WILL BE INFORMED PRIOR TO ACTION TAKEN. PARTS PRICES ARE SUBJECT TO CHANGES.

Yours faithfully

Service Advisor
Suhaimi
HP : 91898 2617 Email - aceautosolution@gmail.com

APPROVER DETAILS ,
Adas =
SURVEYOR - L J,
f |
CONTACT NO - h ..I S 25(02/20
! [
PART BY PART / LUMP SUM )
(] S ,z';'(-ﬁ.:_yf'r_g_
x.f

Acknowledged by Repairer

Signatura:

Date:




Ace Auto Solution
Registration number : 53228991M
23 Kaki Bukil Ave 4, #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933

INVOICE
To : Auto & General Insurance(Singapore) Pte, Limited
190 CLEMENCEAU AVENUE
#03-01, SINGAPORE SHOPPING CENTRE
SINGAPORE 239524
Invoice MNo: ACC-2015001
Invoice Date:
Vehicle No:  SMRI94168
Chasis No:  WBABW120205PT78951
Engine No:  45125888B38A15A
DESCRIPTION ANQUNT
SGD
Parts
No. _Qty. Price (SGD)
i 1 |Rear Tailgate $ 1,898.70
2 1 _|Rear Tailgate Inner Weatherstrip 3 250.80
3 1 |Rear Bumper $ 162040
4 | 10 |Rear Bumper Clips $ 30.00
5 1 |Rear Bumper Towing Cover $ 65.10
| 6 1 |RHR Bumper Reflector $ 78.70
7 1 |Reverse Sensor $ 265.00
| 8 1 |Reverse Sensor Wiring Harness $ 1,548.50
| 9 1 |Rear Bumper Reinforcement Bar $ 530.70
|10 1 |Rear Bumper Lower Aluminium Plate 5 98.70
| 11 | 1 [Rear Bumper Bracket Centre $ 105.30
| 12 | 1 |Rear Bumper Bracket Centre $ 105.30
| 13 | 1 |RHR Bumper Bracket $ 150.70
Total: $ 6,747.90
Less 10%: 674.79
Parts Total 1 3 6,073.11
Labour
No. Price (SGD)
1 To dismantle .frenew_ the ar::m'ﬁent damagexj.* purtioﬂl.tr:u panel S 500.00
5 beating, reshape. straighten,orientate and align repair /replacement parts.
2 Carry out spray painting on accident affected area g 600.00
3 To conduct anti rust of under carriage tuff coat ] 50.00
4 To disconnect wire harness of electrical component to facilitate repairs,reconnect and
- check electrical function after repair S 30.00
8 To remove and refix reverse sensor and conduct test 3 60.00
(5] To conduct transfer of parts from old tailgate to new tailgate 3 80.00
7 To remove and refix rear tail gate windscreen g 120.00




=

Labour Total : & 1.440.00
Other
Mo, Prica @Eﬂt
| 1 | 1 [Tailgate windscreen sealant | 60.00 |
Other Total : & 60.00
Total: & 757311
Less lump sum 20%: $ 1,514.62
Grand Total: $ 6,050.00
{"fﬁl Er-ﬁ'“\_
i (4 1
Yours Faithft@{'ﬂ !
[\ gj ),
P LN e f
\.\hf;r:_ *_ -__‘/
Suhaimi

Service Executive
Tel: 9183 2617 Fax:6844 5185

Email ; aceautosolution@gmail.com
E&OE

ALL CHEQUE PAYMENTS SHOULD BE CROSSED AND MADE PAYABLE TO "ACE AUTO SOLUTION".

PLEASE INDICATE THE INVOICE NO. ON THE REVERSE SIDE.
Please check and finalize with me this invoice



y

-5V

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libi Ave 1 #071-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AUTO & GENERAL INSURANCE (S) PL

(BUDGET DIRECT INSURANCE)
190 CLEMENCEAU AVENUE #03-01

Ref : CS/AGI20003272/Agd3n2

AU

SNGAPORE SHOPPING CENTRESINGAPORE ~ Date®  16:03:2020
239924
Code ; AGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJV 103C Veh. Inspected SMR 94168
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. C100056590 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From WY RATILLA Assign Date 27102/2020
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model BMW 216 GRAN TOURER c.c 1499
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2020
Chassis No. WEABY120205PT9951 Colour BLACK
Odometer 1172 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre [205/60 R16 BRIDGESTOMNE 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 BRIDGESTONE & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  25/02/2020 |inspection Date 28/02/2020
Survey held at ACE AUTO SOLUTION
23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4,#04-01 (SOUTH WING) SINGAPORE 415933
5a, Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMR 9416B

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
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Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |\ e P {i; {s!,u
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR TAILGATE DENTED 1,898.70 1,898.70
1|REAR WINDSCREEM WOT NECESSARY 857 .60 -
10|REAR TAILGATE INMER TRIM CLIPS MNOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
1|REAR TAILGATE INNER WEATHERSTRIP cuT 250.80 250.80
1|RHR TAILLAMP NOT NECESSARY 539.70 -
1|REAR BUMPER DISTORTED 1.620.40 1,620.40
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS MECESSARY 80.00 30.00
1|REAR BUMPER TOWING COVER DEFORMED 65.10 B5.10
1|RHR BUMPER REFLECTOR CRACKED 78,70 TB.70
2|REVERSE SENSOR DAMAGED (1 PC 661.60 265.00
ONLY)
1|REVERSE SENSOR WIRING HARNESS SMAFPPED 1,548.50 1,548.50
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BAR BENT 530.70 530.70
1|REAR END PAMEL TO REPAIR SEE 484 80 -
LABCOUR
1|REAR END PAMEL TRIM WNOT NECESSARY 85.00
6|REAR END PANEL TRIM CLIPS NOT MNECESSARY 48.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER ALUMINILIM PLATE BENT a8.70 98.70
1|REAR BUMPER BRACKET CENTRE CRACKED 105,30 105.30
1|REAR BUMPER BRACKET CENTRE CRACKED 105.30 105.30
1|LHR BUMPER BRACKET WOT NECESSARY 150.70
1|RHR BUMPER BRACKET CRACKED 150.70 180.70
1|LHR BUMPER BRACKET LOWER WOT NECESSARY 124,30 -
1|RHR BUMPER BRACKET LOWER NOT NECESSARY 124.30 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -978.89 -674.78
8,810.01 6,073.11
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR EMD PANEL INSULATION SEAL (SM) WNOT MECESSARY 120.00 -
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL INSULATION SEAL (SN) MOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
1| TAILGATE WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 120,00 60.00
1| TAILGATE WINDSCREEN SOLAR FILM (SN) MOT NECESSARY 220.00 -
580.00 60,00

Report Ref No. CS/AGI20003272/Aqd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199807138R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Page No.;2 of 2

aty Description of Parts Condition jzﬂrk'::‘::[;} Our ‘"'l':j}“’“d
LABOUR
TO DISMANTLE/RENEW THE ACCIDENT DAMAGED 1,200.00 500.00
PORTION, TO PANEL BEATING RESHAPE, STRAIGHTEN,
ORIENTATE AND ALIGN REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REFPAIR OF REAR END
PAMNEL.
CARRY OUT SPRAY PAINTING ON ACCIDENT AFFECTED 1,000.00 B00.00
AREA.
TO CONDUCT ANTI RUST OF UNDER CARRIAGE TUFF 80.00 50.00
COAT.
TO DISCONNECT WIRE HARNESS OF ELECTRICAL 50.00 30.00
COMPONENT TO FACILITATE REPAIRS RECOMNMNECT
AND CHECK ELECTRICAL FUNCTION AFTER REPAIR.
TO REMOVE AND REFIX REVERSE SENSOR AND 100.00 60.00
CONDUCT TEST.
TO CONDUCT TRANSFER OF PARTS FROM OLD 150.00 BO.00
TAILGATE TO NEW TAILGATE.
TO CONDUCT WATER LEAKAGE TEST AFTER REPAIRS  |NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
OF VEHICLE.
TO APPLY SEALANT TO REAR TAIL GATE. NOT MECESSARY B0.0D -
TO REMOVE AND REFIX REAR TAIL GATE WINDSCREEN. 120.00 120.00

2,830.00 1,440.00

GRAND TOTAL 12,200.01 7.573.11
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 8,050.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/AGI20003272/Agqd3n2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

BISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is mads solaly for the uss and banafit of the Client named on the front page of this Repart.
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