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) NEW OD CLAIM - FBL532U

From: Chin, Lee-Ying

Ta: ‘assignments', Nivitha (LKK Auto)
Cc: Lim, Kok-Chang

Sent:  2/27/2020 10:08:39 AM

Attachments: T8} £gL532UEstimate.pd™) FBL532U DOA 240220 AIG ODOWS. pdf

Hi LKK,

Kindly assist to survey.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Lee ¥Ying, Chin

AIG

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
78 Shenton Way #88-16 Singapore 879128

Tel +(65) 6419 1947

Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com | www.aig.sg

————— Original Message-----

From: Sbk E [mailto:sbkS643e@yahoo.com]

sent: Thursday, February 27, 2028 9:18 AM

Te: AIG 5GP, Claims-Survey

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: NEW OD CLAIM - FBL532U

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Dear Sir,

Please arrange PRI for own damage claim. Thanks.

Regards,

Kwan 5. H.

Director
Bike Production Pte Ltd



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
e S e e e —

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 16 March 2020 5:38 PM

To: Sbk E; SUR

Subject: RE: AUTHORISE REPAIR, Re: DOCS REQUESTED, Re: OD claim # FBL532U # request

DL, UT letter and IV form

Dear Mr Kwan,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle FBL 532U (Excess 5500/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company befare
completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 12 March 2020 4:25 PM

To: Shk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>; yokeshi.chan@aig.com; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto)
<denisetay@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: shengyang.lim@aig.com; theerthan.parthiban@aig.com; nurmariahhuibrechts.mohdrizal@aig.com
Subject: RE: AUTHORISE REPAIR, Re: DOCS REQUESTED, Re: OD claim # FBL532U # request DL, UT letter and IV form

Dear Mr Kwan,

Already send the email to chase officer for authorisation.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: 5hk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, 12 March 2020 3:27 PM

To: yokeshi.chan@aig.com; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>; Shiau Chan
(LKKAuto) <siewsc@|kkauto.com>

Cc: shengyang lim@aig.com; theerthan.parthiban@aig.com; nurmariahhuibrechts.mohd rizal@aig.com
Subject: Re: AUTHORISE REPAIR, Re: DOCS REQUESTED, Re: OD claim # FBL532U # request DL, UT letter and IV form

Dear Shiau Chan,
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Meriman e-Claims

Claim Audit

= AUDIT TRAIL
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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Mg, Thaddaeus-HC <Thaddaeus-HC.Ng®@aig.com>

Sent: Friday, 13 March 2020 6:59 FM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Yvonne Waong (LKK Auto)

Cc: SUR; Fong, Andy-SY

Subject: RE: PENDING MANDATE APPROVAL - FBJ 9402M, FBL 532U & FBJ 8060Y Damaged
TBA

Hi,

Mandate send and to update below mentioned.
FBJ 9402M — No photo show parts damaged as below or require to advise

e Front Wheel Axle (Damaged Photo or Require)

e Front Right Fork Assy (Damaged Photo or Require)
e Front Sport Rim (Damaged Photo or Require)

¢ Rear Right Side Case (Sales Agreement TBC)

FBJ 8060Y — Damaged parts vs after repair & Decals

e Front Sport Rim (New & Damaged Photo TBC)
e Decals Front Fairing & Rear Box LH self-fix not for claim

FBL 532U — Carbon Sticker
e Carbon Sticker self-fix for claim

To arrange resurvey for check, supplementary & after repair. Net loss repair for all bike to
be alert.

Thanks

Regards,

Thaddaeus Ng

AlG

Maotor Claims Surveyar

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Hp +(65) BETS 5433

Thaddaeus-HC.Ma@AIG.com | www, AIG.com.sg

From: Shiau Chan [LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, March 13, 2020 5:47 PM

To: Ng, Thaddaeus-HC <Thaddaeus-HC.Ng@aig.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] PENDING MANDATE APPROVAL



21282020 Adjuster Immediate Advice

MNote: This document has not been finalised,

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreqno 1sss07108m)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933
Tel: B256-3561 Fax: 6844-BB05 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AlG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi industrial Park

Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933
Altn:  Chan, Yoke Shi Date: 28 Feb 2020

Prelimi Advi

Vehicle No : FBLS32U Accident Date 1 240022020
Make : HONDA FJS400 Policy MNa. : 1900043871
Assignment Date : 2710212020 Excess 1 550.00
Date of Inspection  : 27/02/2020 Est. Duration of Repair £ 3.00
Inspection At : BIKE PRODUCTION PTE LTD (HQ)

610 SERANGOON ROAD
SINGAPORE 2182186

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front portion, n/s body and parts claimed are consistent to the accident,

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 5% 7,581.50
Revised Amount 5% 5,065.50
Check Items (Estimated) ot 301.50
Total pe =4 5,367.00
Lump Sum Repair S5

Total Loss Consideration

MNew for Old Value 5%
Pre-Accident Value 5% 11,500.00
COE / PARF Rebate 5% 3,815.00
Salvage Value 5%
Margin for Repair 5% 7.,585.00
Remarks
{ X ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly

let us have your autherisation.
| ) The vehicle is uneconormical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck,

{ | Other comments ;

hitps:/isingapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cim?fusebox=5VCdocAfuseaction=dsp_viewersmart&docid=51632702&preview=1&nalayout=1&CF... 11



