Vic (LKKAuto)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 24 April, 2020 11:10 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SMM 6791M - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHC 8250G AND
SMM 6791M ON 11/02/2020 - LKK REF CC6/FCI20003257/Aha3

Attachments: 24022020165322-0001.tif; 24022020165322-0004.jpg

Your Ref: CC6/FCI20003257/Aha3 (SHC8250G)
Our Ref: SMM6791M

Dear Vic,
Please find attached file for your reference.
Best Regards,

Ms Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Fri, Apr 24, 2020 at 10:46 AM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Ms Wong,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly also furnish us a copy of your client’s Vehicle Insurance Cert and the Driver’s Driving Licence as
requested by our principal.

Thank you.



Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

N Save the Earthe Print only whetr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: MG Solution [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 24 April, 2020 10:24 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SMM 6791M - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHC 8250G AND SMM 6791M ON
11/02/2020 - LKK REF CC6/FCI20003257/Aha3

Your Ref: CC6/FCI20003257/Aha3 (SHC8250G)
Our Ref: SMM6791M

Dear Vic,



Please find attached our LOD for your onward action.
Please feel free to contact the under mentioned should you require any further information.
Your prompt action will be greatly appreciated.

Best Regards,

Ms Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Thu, Mar 19, 2020 at 10:15 AM MG Solution <mg3solution @ gmail.com> wrote:

Your Ref: CC6/FCI20003257/Aha3 (SHC8250G)
Our Ref: SMM6791M

Dear Vic,

We refer to below email, please find attached cctv footage for your reference.

Best Regards,

Ms Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD



No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Thu, Mar 19, 2020 at 9:08 AM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHC 8250G AND SMM 6791M ON 11/02/2020

We refer to the above matter.

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no conclusive evidence yet to
substantiate either party’s version. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident
report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with
our OI we will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for
legal assistance until you heard further from us.

Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) your client have to support your claim.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only wherr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by
an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please
do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and
inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



