Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 April, 2020 11:24 AM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: FW: SKA6972U Finalize

Dear Vic,

FYNA. CC4/FCI20003235/R1ha3

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wahhong motors & credit pte ltd <motor@wahhong.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 2 April 2020 11:22 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SKA6972U Finalize

Hi Rasul,

Finalised amount is $ 350 / 2 days of repair confirmed.

On 2020-04-02 09:16, Rasul (LKKAuto) wrote:

> Hi Victor,

>

> Finalised amount is $ 350 / 2 days of repair Kindly confirm

>

>

>

> Best Regards,

> Rasul | Assessor

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 Blk 51,
> Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933) Save the
> Earth. Print only when necessary.

> From: Wahhong motors & credit pte ltd [mailto:motor@wahhong.sg]
> Sent: Wednesday, 1 April, 2020 4:56 PM

> To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

> Subject: SKA6972U Finalize

>

> Hi Rasul

>

>



> After repair as attached. Kindly finalize.

Thank You and Best Regards,

Victor Seng

Claims

WAH HONG MOTORS & CREDIT PTE LTD
ROC:199806235M
ENTERPRISE HUB

38 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST
#01-57 S(608581)
Tel:(65)67737377

HP :(65)87784848

Website: www.wahhong.sg
Mail : motor@wahhong.sg



