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Note: This documant has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreqgne 1essorissr

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: BB44-BBOS Emall: sur@lkkauto, com;assignments(@kkaulo.com

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Lid. From: LKK Auto Consultanis Pla Lid
& Temasak Boulavard 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
#04-01 Suntec Tower Five Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 038985 Singapore 408933
Alln: Date: 03 Mar 2020
Preliminary Advice
Insured Vehicle No YP7T991M
TP Vehicle No P SLATS84) Accident Data 1 24/02/2020
Make : HYUNDA| AVANTE Assignment Dale - 26/02/2020
Date of Inspection  : 26/02/2020 Est, Duration of Repair 15,00
Inspection At P AUTOMOBILE INTEGRATED MANAGEMENT PTE LTD (HQ)
23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 #04-01, KAKI BUKIT (SOUTH WING)
SINGAPORE 415933

Point of Impact { General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front portion and pars claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 5% 12,146.36
Revised Amount 5% 6,200.00
Check ltems (Estimated) ;5% 0.00
Total :5% 6.200.00
Lump Sum Repair 35

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Valus
Pre-Accident Value
COE / PARF Rebate
Salvage Value
Margin for Repair

22824

Remarks

{ ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly letl us
have your authorisation.

{ }  The vehicle is uneconomical io be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

{ X } Other comments : The abave survey was conducted on a without "prejudice” basis.



1 Adjuster Activity Log

ADJUSTER ACTIVITY LOG
Activity VEHICLE NO: SLAT524) DOA: 24/02/20

(28/02/2020 19:39] YVONNE WONG YIN CHENG:
Hi efficer-in charge

Flease be informed that we have ingpected the vehiche SLATS94) on 26/01/20,
We are pending estimate from repalrer.

M .. 0 B



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) -:claims@ergn.cum.svga

Sent: Tuesday, 25 February 2020 5:23 PM

To: AIM PTE LTD; Admin-D (LKKAuto (admin-d@Ilkkauto.com); Admin A {admin-
a@lkkauto.com);, Mei Kwan (LKKAuto (Meikwan@lkkauto.com)

Cc: Ivy Yong; Zheng Hanyang; Phoebe Xie

Subject: RE: FW: Claims ref no. (P) COMCG20000344 NOA- SLA7594) // TP Claim

Date Classification : Confidential, C3

** NOTE: Please create case, input our Claim ref no. and upload ALL survey related documents into
Merimen. Payment invoices shall be ignored for cases that are not submitted via Merimen.

Hi LKK,

Please conduct this survey request.
(Note: Survey vehicle only, LOD will be handled by Ergo)

Kindly inform us if you are not able to attend it.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards
Pauline Soh
ERGO Insurance Pte. Lid.

2 Temasek Boulevard, #34-05 Sunisc Tower Fives
Singapore 038385

DID +55 5825 5154
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From: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 February 2020 5:22 pm

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Ce: vy Yong <ivy.yong@ergo.com.sg>; Zheng Hanyang <hanyang.zheng@ergo.com.sg>; Phoebe Xie
<phoebe xie@ergo.com.sg>

Subject: Re: FW: Claims ref no. (P) COMCG20000344 NOA- S5LA7594) // TP Claim

Hi Pauline,



We would like to appoint surveyor from LKK to conduct survey,
Thank you.

Regards,
lacyne

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd (aim)

Office: 28 Sin Ming Lane #07-147 Midview City Singapore 573972

W/S: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933
Tel: 91198371

On Tue, Feb 25, 2020 at 5:19 PM ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. [Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg> wrote:

Date Classification : Confidential, C3

Dear Jacyne,

We would like to conduct a PRI survey, please refer to our list of surveyors :

1 | AIS | Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
2 | FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd
3 | 1AS Infiniti Appraisal Service

4 | IPK JP Knights Pte Ltd

5 | LBS L.B.S Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

6 | LKK LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

7 PS Priority Services

8 | VAC Vicom Ltd

9 | AJAX AJAX Inspection Services Pte Lid
10| AA Appraisal Associate




Warmest Regards
Faullne Sah

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard #04-05 Suritec Tower Five
Singapore Q8985
DID - +B5 8820 G184

cauline sohTermo com &g
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From: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 February 2020 11:43 am
To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>
Subject: NOA- SLA7594) // TP Claim

Hi,

Please refer attached to advise further.

Thank you.



Regards,

lacyne

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd {aim)
Office: 28 Sin Ming Lane #07-147 Midview City Singapore 573972
W/S: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933

Tel: 91198371



FUFL - TP Usad Honda Stream Car for Sale in Singapore, V-Kar Tradars Pt Lid - sgCarMan

SGCARMART.COM Login  Sign up

New Cars Ised Cars Rental Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Foru

ALL-NEW TEST DRIVE TODAY!

Mercedes-Benz GLE450 AMG
Premium Plus _ (L) 6250 6696 / 9637 5329

Stream PriceRange ¥ | |Depreciation ¥ | > 10year(: ¥ | [VehideType ¥| B

Home = Used Cars » V-Kar Traders Me Lid » Honda Stream 184 (COE tin OB/2G27

Honda Stream 1.8A (COE till 06/2023)

Financlal Insurance Accessories Similar Research Photos Map
Price $21,800
Depreciation $6,610 fyr Reg Date 14-Jun-2008

(3yrs Imths 18days COE left)

Mileage N.A. Manufactured 2008
Road Tax 1,174 fyr Transmission Auto
Deren Value $12,493 as of today (change) oMV $20,643
COE $18,953 ARF $20,643
Engine Cap 1,799 cc Power 103.0 kW (135 bhp)
Curb Weight 1,370 kg No, of Owners 4

Type of Vehicle MRV

Features
ocafion

1.BL DOHC 16V 1- VTEC Engine, Digital Cimatic Alrcon Controls, Knockdown Rear Seats. 7 Seater MPV. View - .
specs of the Honda Stream (2007-2014)

Shortlist Compara

Report Errer More Actior
Leather Upholstery Seats, 17" Sports Rims With Brand New Michelin Tyres, Pioneer Touchscreen DVD Audio
Systems With Reverse Camera, Fog Lamps.

Caller Tnformation

Description V-Kar Traders Pte Ltd
Servicing Done, Road Tax Till June. Buy With A Peace Of Mind. 100% Loan Available, High Trade In, Do Not Miss § vehicies for sale. 12 soid I past 3 n

It, Whatsapp For An Appaintment To View,
@ 24 Sin Ming Lane #01-54

Category Midview Clty
COE Car Ted: 3341582
5".‘\]”"' cars naarty
|
Status & Rendous BE.
Available Ray 56,
Resourc

VT [N

hitpazfiwww.sgearmart.comiused_carafinfo, php?|D=R8872280L=1245 13



212612020 Used Honda Stream Car for Sale In Singapore, Maylair Mataring - sgCariart

sGCARMART.COM Login  Sign up

MewCars  Used Cars Rental Cars Saell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Foru

UNSW Sydney - World Top 50 Uni

Meet UNSW @ SG Sat Feb 29. Degree in Commerce, Law, Engr, Arts, Biomed

(Stream | [Pricarange v [Deprecistion ¥ [> 10year(s ¥ | [vehieType Y| W

Home = Used Cars » Mayfar Motoring = Honda Stream 1,84 (COE till 08/2023)

Honda Stream 1.8A (COE till 08/2023)

Dwverview Financial Insurance Accessories Similar Research Fhotos

Price $25,800
Depreciation $7,350 fyr Reg Dates 26-Now-2008
{3yrs 6mths Sdays COE left)
Mileage 172,354 km (15.3k jyr) Manufactured 2008
Road Tax $1,174 fyr Transmission Auto
Dereg Value £12,290 as of today (change) oMV £23,116
COE £17,496 ARF $23,116
Engine Cap 1,799 Power 103.0 kW (138 bhp)
Curb Welght 1,370 kg No. of Owners 3

Type of Vehicle My

Shortlist Compare
Report Error More Action
Features
Raliable 1.8L I-VTEC 16 Valves DOHC Engine, 5 Speed Auto Transmission. SRS Airbags, ABS. View specs of the
Honda Stream (2007-2014) Sabls 11l !
=l rnfgrmation
Mayfair Motorin
Accessories a : g
Leather Seats, Sport Rime, DVD Player, Reverse Camera, Reversa Sensors, Arm Rest, Solar Film, Remote Key PREMIUM Dm
Alarm System. 47 vetucles for sake. 174 sold in past
Q 61 Ubl Avenue 2 #05-11/16
Description Autornobile Megamart
Kah Motor Model. In Excellent Condition, Best MPV In Its Class. Must View To Appreclate. Loan From 3.18%. High Tel: 64792220
Trade In Possible. Saarch cars nearty
&  Pavid Tan o8
=
- po= T Aex € 84
COE Car, Premium ar a7
Kenny Toh a9

hitps:{www.sgcarman com/used _carsfinfo,php710=886506A0L=1032 13



212612020

> Back to OneMotoring

PARF/COE Rabate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID; 193A

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SLA7594)
Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 26 Feb 2020
Vehicle Make: HONDA
Vehicle Model: STREAM 18X A
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2008

Engine No.: R1BA1769483
Chassis No.: RN61062321
Maximum Power Qutput: 103.0 kW (138 bhp)
Open Market Value: $18,941.00
Original Registration Date: 13 Aug 2008
First Registration Date: 13 Aug 2008
Transfer Count: 2

Actual ARF Paid: $18,941.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Forfeited

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 30 Jun 2023
COE Category: B - Car (1601cc & above)
COE Period(Years): 5

PQP Paid: $18,953.00
COE Rebate Amount: $12,677.00
Total Rebate Amount: $12,677.00
Message

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-
registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is
earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 26 Feb 2020

OK

hitps:iivrlta.gov.sgitaivrilaction/enquireRebate ByPublicBaforeDereginput PFUNCTION_ID=F0304008TT n
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Autormabile imegrated Management Ple Lid

Co & GST Reg iy J01605297G

Offica: 28 Sin Ming Lane 807147 Midview City
Singapors 573972

Workshop: 13 Kakl Bukit ave S 804-01 [Scuth Wing)
singapore 415533

am

Automobile Iniegrmed Managesnnt e Lid Email: automim, ciam @ gmail.com Tel: 9119 8371
Vo¥ J‘?W/éyf{.v/
ESTIMATE { {(E‘
Our Ref: AC2020015/TP/SLA7S94)-24.02.2020 ’: {_‘3 J-OIJ/
Sedegg-
Vehicle number: SLA7594) Vehicle Made & Model: HONDA STREAM -z_ L f H';t ﬁr
Items Qty List ltems Amount §
1 1 Front bonnet £1850 Awl 81690~
2 1 Front bonnetlock f‘ﬂ"fﬂ -r“‘""'f FIEE.S
3 1 Front bonnet lock cable AN 89.60 %
- 1  Front bonnetseal - Inner A1 4860 X
5 1  Front bonnet seal - Outer J(-.27 el 862
6 1 Front bonnetinsulator A IZE.EDX
7 10  Front bonnet insulator clips @ 5.50 A1 5500
8 2 Front bonnet hinges - L/R @ 55.60 2177 11220
9 1 Front grille base ?-IE:E{) 341.20
10 1 Front grille chrome moulding 242,60~
11 1 Front grille logo IR-X0 A 8390 —
12 1 Front bumper 63800 Nfﬂfﬁ,ﬁﬂ,ﬂ"
13 1  Front bumper reinforcement j_,rf,.ﬁ) 4&:{/ -ﬂggu,-"'
14 2 Front bumper side retainers - L/R @ 41.20 32-X0¥ 3541 8240

15 10  Front bumperclips @ 450 3¢--2 45
16 2 Front fenders-L/R @ 581.40 N MR olchu 1.1'%5."32 (A
17 2 Front fenderinner top garnishes @ 81.50 “ <7 163.00
18 10 Front fender inner top garnish clips @ 5.50 41 55.00
19 2 Front headlamps-L/R@108260 803K %[ ¢hp-Jp O/ 216520 <
20 Front headlamp lower brackets - L/R @ B6.60 Y- e y o Cr EHUD/’
21 1  Front support panel 587.60
22 1 Front support top garnish Q¢ [AArn 11020~
23 10 Front support top garnish clips @ 4.50 "? 45.00
24 1  Air con condenser M M 790,60 —
25 1 Air con electric fan assy A7 aa1soX
26 1  Radiator assy TY$3. o) 4’/‘1( ( e 'I_EE_ED-"""-
27 1 Radiator electric fan assy AN Tag1e0 X
28 1 Radiator top hose A1 8660 X
29 1 Radiator spare tank —_— : AN 12660 X
' < Sub-total 11,389.20
Less 20% 2,277.84
Total List 9.111.36
| ; 1&'1“-6')

e Caga %yﬁ

Page 1af 2



30
i
32

33

35
36
37
32

Special Nett Items

lset Front no. plate
1bot Aircon oil
1bot Radiator coolant
Total Special Nett

Labour charges
To check front electrical wiring

To remove, refix A/C condenser & refill A/C gas
Ta respray undercoating
To respray painting and etc
Panel beating, cut, weld remove & replacing above parts
Total Labour

ESTIMATE PARTS AND LABOUR GRAND TOTAL $

Page 2 of 2

scfe 50,004,
11 6500 ¥
UA  60.00 o

185.00

50,00

180.00/0 2
120.00f
1,200.00 72
12000049,

2,850.00
350

12k - 26
12,146.36

7263.¢F
suo- Y



AG2020 Adjuster Report
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ccregnoiseeorioes
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6G256-3561 Fax: 68448805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignmenis@lkkauto.com
VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT
Our File No: CS/EGI20003208/UYD3IN2
Date: 05/03/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. ERGO Insurance Pte. Lid, Palicy No: DMCG18010613
ol V- Insured Vehicle No:  YP7991M
Date of Loss. 24/02/2020 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: CDMCG20000344
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg Mo SLATS94)
Make & Model HONDA STREAM, 1.8 X (A) Engine No: R1BA1769483
Reg. Date: 13/08/2008 (Man. Year. 2008) Chassis No: RNE1062321
Colour: Silver Odomaeter: 196155 km
Engine Capacity. 1798 cc
Markat Value/New Car Price: M/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steenng (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceahle); Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION QF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 215/60R16 Rear Tyre Size: 215/60R16
Front Left Side: Dunlop 6 mm Rear Left Side: Dunlop 6 mm
Front Right Side: Duniop & mm Rear Right Side: Dunlop 6 mm
The above vilues represent the remaining b freads degth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer’'s Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 9,296.36 6.053.68 324268 3488
Miscellansous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,750.00 1,710.00 1,040.00 3ar.8z2
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Tawing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 12,046.36 7,763.68 4,282,868 35.55
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 6,200.00
(5%) 12.048.36 6,200.00 5,846.36 48.53
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 84325 434.00 400.25 48.53
Mett Amount (5§) 12,889.61 6,634.00 6,255.61 48.53
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 25/02/2020
Automobile Integraled Managemen! Pte Lid (HQ)
Date Inspected: 26/02/2020 | tod At 23 Ka:.kl Bukit Ave 4 #04-01, Kakl Bukit {South
Singapore 415833
Eslimated Pariod of Rapair: 5.0 days

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA

Manager: YVONNE WONG YIN CHENG

NOTE: This repart represents agr findings af the time and place of inspecton sated hermin, Such inspechion has besn carmed oul fo the best of our knowledge and
abuliry but ary otter Kablity under any ofher crcumstances s hereby expressly sacluded

https:/singapore. marnmen.com/claimafindex.cim Plusebox=MTRadjusteri luseaction=gen_prnirpl&caseid=0195018extid=3326034CFID=661939. 13



3572020 Adjuster Repor
REPAIR DETAILS

'Reference

'Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 05 Mar 2020)

Parts: M1-MPV HONDA STREAM 1.8 X (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitied, no print-code for SLATS24.J)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page numbers with

the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimale page

Further Info: Items/values nol in reference calalogue are prefixed with an astensk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BONNET Buckied B1690FL *63890FL
2 1 *FRONT BONNET LOCK Twisted 183.50FL  *145.50FL
3 1 *FRONT BONNET LOCK CABLE Naol Necessary B9.60FL *.FL
4 1 *FRONT BONNET SEAL-INNER Not Necessary 48 60FL “-FL
5 1 *FRONT BONNET SEAL-OUTER Necessary B6.20 FL *35.00FL
L& 1 *FRONT BONNET INSULATOR Not Necessary 126.20 FL FL
7 10 *FRONT BONNET INSULATOR CLIPS Mot Necessary 55.00FL *FL
8 2 *FRONT BONNET HINGES-L/R Not Necessary 112.20FL “.FL
9 1 *FRONT GRILLE BASE Cracked 341.20FL 218 BOFL
10 1 *FRONT GRILLE CHROME MOULDING Cracked 242 60FL  "242B0FL
LA | *FRONT GRILLE LOGO Necessary 89 90FL *38.50 FL
12 1 *FRONT BUMPER Deformed/Tom 683.60FL “638.00FL
13 1 *FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT MNecessary 410.TOFL  “218.BOFL
M 2 *FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS-L/IR Beni 82 40FL *65.00 FL
15 10 *FRONT BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 45.00 FL *35.00FL
16 1 *FRONT FENDERS-LIR Ofs Buckled/N/s Rapair 1,162.B0 FL *581 .40 FL
17 2 *FRONT FENDER INNER TOP GARNISHES Mot Necessary 163.00 FL *FL
18 10 *FRONT FENDER INNER TOP GARNISH CLIPS Not Necessary 55.00 FL *-FL
19 2 *FRONT HEADLAMPS-L/R Cracked 2,16520FL *1,560.70FL
20 2 *FRONT HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKETS-L/R Cracked 173.00FL *80.00 FL
21 1 *FRONT SUPPORT PANEL Bent 587.60FL  *58T.BOFL
2 1 *FRONT SUPPORT TOP GARNISH Deformed/Torn 110.20FL "110.20FL
23 10 *FRONT SUPPORT TOP GARNISH CLIPS Not Necessary 45.00FL *-FL
24 1 “AIR CON CONDENSER Bent/Punclured 79060FL  *780.60FL
25 1 *AlR CON ELECTRIC FAN ASSY Nol Necessary 441 50FL *-FL
26 1 *RADIATOR ASSY Bent/Cracked 1,586 90FL *1,483.00FL
27 *RADIATOR ELECTRIC FAN ASSY Not Necessary 481.60FL *-FL
28 1 *RADIATOR TOP HOSE Not Necessary B86.60FL *-FL
28 1 *RADIATOR SPARE TANK Not Necessary 12660 FL “~FL
o 1 *SET FRONT NO PLATE Scraiched B0.00FS *40.00FS
N 1 *BOT AIR CON 0IL Not Necessary 65.00FS *-FS
3z 1 *BOT RADIATOR COOLANT Necessary 60.00FS *30.00FS

FaFranchise parl. E=Spchett. L=ListlemDisc.

Sub Total (3%) 11,5T4.20 7,549.60

- List Item Discount on L Items 20.00/20.00% (58) 2.277.84 1.495.92

Total Parts (S§)  9,296.36 6,053.68

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.

hitpe:/isingapore. menmen.comiclaims/findex. cfmPfusebox=MTRad|uster &fuseaction=gen_printrpiicaseid=0105918exlid=3326034CFID=6819309... 23



52020 Adjuster Repor
Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

Thare are no new miscellansous lems salected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour llems
1 TO CHECK FRONT ELECTRICAL WIRING MNaw 50.00 30.00
2 TO REMOVE ,REFIX A/C CONDENSER & REFILL AIC GAS MNew 180.00 100.00
3 TO RESPRAY UNDERCOATING Mew 120.00 80.00
4 TO RESPRAY PAINTING AND ETC Mew 1,200,00 900.00
5 PAMNEL BEATING,CUTWELD,REMOVE & REPLACING ABOVE PARTS Naw 1,200.00 800.00
Gross Labour Cost (S5§) 2,750.00 1,710.00
I_ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out,

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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