Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, 23 April 2020 12:28 PM

To: Naz (LKKAuto)

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: INV AND DV, Re: FBJ 9402M Finalization
Attachments: FBJ9402MInvDV.pdf

Dear All,

Please submit the report and invoice. We agree to the lump sum repair of $6,500.00 before insurance and 3
repair days. Thanks.

Regards,

Kwan S. H.
Director
Bike Production Pte Ltd

On Tuesday, April 21, 2020, 06:15:23 PM GMT+8, Naz (LKKAuto) <naz @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Mr Kwan,

Apologies for the late reply. Attached herewith is the amended marked estimate. We will proceed to finalize if
you are agreeable with the Lump Sum COR of $6500.00 / 3 REPAIR DAYSas approved by insurance;

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Nazl Technical Investigator

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6841-2157 | Email: Naz@Ikkauto.com | Fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Sent: Sunday, 8 March 2020 3:38 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FBJ9402M INV AND DV

Dear Veron,

Please refer to the attached file for the Invoice and DV for FBJ9402M. Please help to submit with the surveyor report for payment.
Thanks.

Regards,
Kwan S. H.

Director
Bike Production Pte Ltd



