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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 January 2021 4:13 PM

To: sharon@sngahtee.com; SUR

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: YP44T - OD CHINA

Dear Sharon, 

 

Confirmed Lump Sum $28,100 before excess $500 @ 20 working days 

 

Will offer in merimen shortly. 
  

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: sharon@sngahtee.com <sharon@sngahtee.com>  

Sent: Friday, 8 January 2021 10:45 AM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YP44T - OD CHINA 

 

Hi Veron 

 

Can we confirm $28100 before excess? 

Please offer in merimen. 

Thanks. 

 

 

Best Regards 

____________________________________________ 

Sharon Sng  

 
SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD  | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457 

TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com 

 

 

 

 

From: sharon@sngahtee.com <sharon@sngahtee.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, January 5, 2021 11:38 AM 
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To: 'Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)' <yvonnewong@lkkauto.com>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YP44T - OD CHINA 

 

Hi Yvoone, 

 

Can we confirm this case? 

It has been quite long. 

 

 

Best Regards 

____________________________________________ 

Sharon Sng  

 
SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD  | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457 

TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com 

 

 

 

 

 

 

From: sharon@sngahtee.com <sharon@sngahtee.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, November 4, 2020 4:45 PM 

To: 'Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)' <yvonnewong@lkkauto.com>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YP44T - OD CHINA 

 

 

 

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto) <yvonnewong@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, November 4, 2020 11:34 AM 

To: sharon@sngahtee.com; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YP44T - OD CHINA 

 

Hi Sharon 

 

1) 4069    Front Tank Carrier          Part No MK473711 

2) 4942    R/upp A-pillar Trim        Part No MK405508 

3) 4070    Rear Tank Carrier           Part No MK473711 

 

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: sharon@sngahtee.com [mailto:sharon@sngahtee.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, November 04, 2020 11:07 AM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: YP44T - OD CHINA 

 

Hi Yvonne 

 

What photos do u require? Can send me a list? 

 

Best Regards 

____________________________________________ 

SHARON SNG  

 
SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD  | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457 

TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com 

 

 


