Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 30 March 2020 4:18 pm

To: You Po Soon

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: PRE-INVOICE FOR VEHICLE SLG9065A

Dear Po Soon,

Finalize amount confirmed.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: You Po Soon <psyou@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 26 March 2020 5:58 pm

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: PRE-INVOICE FOR VEHICLE SLG9065A

Dear Rasul,

We enclosed the total final repair costs of...

Vehicle No. SLG9065A
Final Repair Costs (include GST) | $4,303.08
Repair Period*( Working Day) 5 days

*Note: Repair period does not include Sunday and Public Holiday.

Please examine the above information carefully. If no discrepancy is reported within 7 days (exclude Sunday and Public
Holiday) from the date of this email, the information will be considered as correct. Thereafter, no adjustment will be made.

Thanks & best regards,

Best Regards,



You Po Soon

Bodyshop Service Advisor
Kah motor Co. Sdn Bhd

15, Ubi Road 4

Singapore 408610

E-mail : psyou@honda.com.sg
TEL : 9678 6493

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual
or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from
disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete
the mail. Thank you.



